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NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM

AWARDED VENDOR LIST

Bid No: P2024-10

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper

Sponsoring District: Escondido Union School District

Bid Administrator:
Isaac Hernandez 760-432-2387
ishernandez@eusd.org

CONTRACT PERIOD: 10/02/2024 - 03/31/2025
MINIMUM FREE FREIGHT - $50.00

DELIVERY: 30 Working Days on Case, and 90
Working Days on Pallet or Carload Quantities

VENDOR NAME

ADDRESS

PHONE/FAX NUMBERS

CONTACT NAME

Carroll Business Supply

1950 Cardell Ct Ste 102
El Cajon, CA 92020

800-995-4227 - Customer Service
619-885-8315 - Cell

Tonya Langdon-Carroll tonya@carrollbusiness.net

Complete Office LLC

12724 Moore St.
Cerritos, CA 90703

858-435-7070 - Customer Service
619-654-7454 - Cell

Sarah Harper sharper@complete-office.com

Kelly Spicers Inc.

12310 E Slauson Ave.
Santa Fe Springs, CA 90670

800-774-2377 - Toll Free
562-693-0868 - Fax
714-883-7277 - Direct

Jason Christopher jason.christopher@kellyspicers.com
Jeff Scuderi jeff.scuderi@kellyspicers.com

Liberty Paper

5025 Hampton St
Los Angeles, CA 90058

866-507-2737 x2102

Erik Amador erik@libertypp.com

ODP Business Solutions,
LLC

6600 North Military Trail
Boca Raton, FL 33496

801-643-7166 - Phone
800-593-8830 - Fax

Collin Frandsen collin.frandsen@odpbusiness.com

Send Orders To: bsdcustomercare@odpbusiness.com

Southwest School Supply

3790 De Forest Circle
Jurupa Valley, CA 91752

800-227-7159 - Toll Free
909-980-7159 - Fax

Aja Stickler Bid Manager aja@southwestschool.com
Send Orders To: biddesk@southwestschool.com
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NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM - ATTACHMENT B

Sponsoring District: Escondido Union School District
Bid Administrator: Isaac Hernandez 760-432-2387 ishernandez@eusd.org

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
Bid No: P2024-10

SECTION A - XEROGRAPHIC PAPER

Item# Esﬂ:l:teed Item Specification/Description UOM [Mfr/Product Name/Part# Vendor Stock # Price per UOM Vendor

Super Premium No. 4 high-speed multi-use dual purpose paper, white, 204, 8
1A 396 %" x 11”. Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or Case

spirit duplicating. Brightness: 96% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price.

Case of 10 Reams. Boise X-9 High Bright X9HB2011 S 32.08 | Complete Office
1B 103 40 cases in a pallet| Pallet Boise X-9 High Bright X9HB2011(40) S 1,263.20 | Complete Office
1C 5 840 cases or 21 pallets per carload| Carload TruRed 513096 513096 S 24,990.00 Southwest

Super Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 204,
2A 185 8 %" x 14”. Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or Case

spirit duplicating. Brightness: 96% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price.

Case of 10 Reams. Double A 1500820 S 55.00 Kelly
2B 0 30 cases in a pallet| Pallet Gemini Legal GEMS814 S 1,680.00 Liberty Paper
2C 0 630 cases or 21 pallets per carload| Carload Gemini Legal GEMS814 S 35,280.00 Liberty Paper

Super Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 204,

8 %" x 11", 3 hole-drilled. Designed for xerographic reproduction, also
. . suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 96% min; Opacity: 88% Case

min. Case of 10 Reams. Staples 562786 562786 $ 39.50 Southwest
3B 0 40 cases in a pallet| Pallet 0D Multi-Purpose OFD940601(40) S 1,788.00 | Complete Office
3C 0 840 cases or 21 pallets per carload| Carload 0D Multi-Purpose OFD940601(840) S 37,548.00 | Complete Office

Super Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 204,

11” x 17”. Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or
A 4 spirit duplicating. Brightness: 96% min; Opacity: 88% min. Case

Case of 5 Reams. Staples 562782 562782 $ 43.80 Southwest
4B 20 40 cases in a pallet| Pallet Double A 1500821 S 1,644.80 Kelly
4C 1 840 cases or 21 pallets per carload| Carload Staples 562782 562782 S 32,592.00 Southwest

Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 8 %2” x

11”. Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit
oA 1042 duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Xerox #3R2047. NO Case

Substitute Case of 10 Reams. Xerox 3R2047 234062 $ 39.29 Southwest
5B 0 40 cases in a pallet| Pallet Xerox Vitality XER3R2047(40) 5 1,575.60 | Complete Office
5C 15 840 cases or 21 pallets per carload| Carload Xerox 3R2047 234062 S 30,903.60 Southwest

Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 8 %2” x

11”. Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit
6A 0 duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Case

Case of 10 Reams. Complete Office CoMmM8511 $ 32.75 | Complete Office

Section A - Xerographic Print Shop Paper Bid




NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM - ATTACHMENT B

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper Sponsoring District: Escondido Union School District
Bid No: P2024-10 Bid Administrator: Isaac Hernandez 760-432-2387 ishernandez@eusd.org
SECTION A - XEROGRAPHIC PAPER
Estimated e .. A :
Item# U Item Specification/Description UOM [Mfr/Product Name/Part# Vendor Stock # Price per UOM Vendor
sage
6B 0 40 cases in a pallet| Pallet Premier PRE811 S 1,283.60 Liberty Paper
6C 0 840 cases or 21 pallets per carload| Carload Premier PRE811 S 24,208.80 Liberty Paper
Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic paper, white, 20#, 8 15" x 14”.
Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit
7A 10 duplicating.Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Xerox #3R2051. No Case
substitute.
Case of 10 Reams. Xerox Vitality XER3R2051CT S 62.90 [ Complete Office
7B 0 30 cases in a pallet| Pallet Xerox Vitality XER3R2051CT(30) S 1,768.50 | Complete Office
Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic paper, white, 204, 8 15" x 14”.
Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit
8A 0 duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Case
Case of 10 Reams. Boise CASOX9004 $ 48.50 | Complete Office
8b 0 30 cases in a pallet| Pallet Boise X-9 0X9004-SKD-DA S 1,402.50 oDP
Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic paper, white, 20#, 8 %2” x 11”, 3 hole-
drilled. Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit
9A 60 duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Xerox #3R2641. No Case
substitute.
Case of 10 Reams. Xerox Vitality XER3R02641 S 46.40 | Complete Office
9B 0 40 cases in a pallet| Pallet Xerox Vitality XER3R02641(40) 5 1,856.00 | Complete Office
Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic paper, white, 20#, 8 5" x 11”, 3 hole-
drilled. Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit
10A 200 - . 090/ i 000/ pi Case
duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min.
Case of 10 Reams. Boise CASOX9001P $ 33.80 | Complete Office
10B 6 40 cases in a pallet| Pallet Boise CASOX9001(40) 5 1,352.00 | Complete Office
Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 11” x
17”. Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit
11A 0 duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min Case
Case of 5 Reams. Boise CASOX9007 $ 33.80 | Complete Office
11B 0 40 cases in a pallet| Pallet Boise CASOX9007(40) $ 1,352.00 | Complete Office
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NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM - ATTACHMENT B

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
Bid No: P2024-10

Sponsoring District: Escondido Union School District
Bid Administrator: Isaac Hernandez 760-432-2387 ishernandez@eusd.org

SECTION A - XEROGRAPHIC PAPER

Item# Esﬂ:;ied Item Specification/Description UOM |Mfr/Product Name/Part Vendor Stock # Price per UOM Vendor
Premium No. 4 colored high-speed xerographic paper or xerographic bond, COLORS: COLORS:
20#, 8 " x 11”. Blue - 490947 Blue - 490947
Case of 10 Reams. Canary - 490948 Canary - 490948
Goldenrod - 490944 Goldenrod - 490944
Green - 490936 Green - 490936
12A 762 Case |Gray-678831 Gray - 678831
Ivory - N/A Ivory - N/A
Pink - 490935 Pink - 490935
Salmon - 678824 Salmon - 678824
Cream - 490950 Cream - 490950
Orchid - 678826 Orchid - 678826 $ 58.50 Southwest
12B 0 40 cases in a pallet| Pallet NO BID NO BID
PREMIUM COLORED- ATTACHMENT WITH COLORS AND PART #'S Premium COLORS: COLORS:
No. 4 colored xerographic paper or xerographic bond, pastel colors, 20#, 8 %" Blue XER3R05856 Blue XER3R05856
x 11”. Price Xerox only. No Substitute. Yellow XER3R05858 Yellow XER3R05858
13A 800 Case of 10 Reams. Case |Goldenrod XER3R05861 Goldenrod XER3R05861
Green XER3R05857 Green XER3R05857
Ivory XER3R05862 Ivory XER3R05862
Pink XER3R05859 Pink XER3R05859 $ 53.90 | Complete Office
13B 0 40 cases in a pallet.| Pallet S 1,956.00 | Complete Office
PREMIUM COLORED- ATTACHMENT WITH COLORS AND PART #'S Premium COLORS: COLORS:
No. 4 colored xerographic paper or xerographic bond, pastel colors, 20#, 8 5" Blue - 276927 Blue - 276927
x 11”. Canary Canary
14A 0 Case of 10 Reams. Case |Goldenrod Goldenrod
Green Green
Ivory Ivory
Pink Pink S 65.87 ODP
14B 0 40 cases in a pallet| Pallet NO BID NO BID
Premium No. 4 xerographic paper or xerographic bond, pastels colors, 20#, 8
15A 0 %" x 14”. Xerox only. No Substitute. Case
Case of 10 Reams. 3R20084 345710 $ 80.50 oDP
15B 0 30 cases in a pallet| Pallet NO BID NO BID
Premium No. 4 xerographic paper or xerographic bond, pastels colors, 20#, 8
16A 0 % x 147 Case
Case of 10 Reams.
NO BID NO BID

Section A - Xerographic Print Shop Paper Bid




NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM - ATTACHMENT B

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
Bid No: P2024-10

Sponsoring District: Escondido Union School District
Bid Administrator: Isaac Hernandez 760-432-2387 ishernandez@eusd.org

SECTION A - XEROGRAPHIC PAPER

Item#

Estimated
Usage

Item Specification/Description

uom

Mfr/Product Name/Part#

Vendor Stock #

Price per UOM

Vendor

16B

0

30 cases in a pallet

Pallet

NO BID

NO BID

Section A - Xerographic Print Shop Paper Bid




NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM - ATTACHMENT B

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
Bid No: P2024-10

Sponsoring District: Escondido Union School District
Bid Administrator: Isaac Hernandez 760-432-2387 ishernandez@eusd.org

SECTION B - PRINT SHOP PAPER

I:\'e:‘ Esﬂ:‘:‘;ed Item Specification/Description Mfr/Product Name/Part# Vendor Stock # St:;;“:kg Ptrosftizt?itl:g f’t:gn:::;: Vendor
Text Weight
1 Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ Text, Wt. - 24/60, Finish - Smooth, 8.5 X 11. NO SUBSTITUTIONS
1A 15 Celestial Blue #22661 Astrobrights #22661 815742 REAM 500 S 9.50 | Southwest
1B 63 Cosmic Orange #22651 Astrobrights #22651 491617 REAM 500 $ 9.50 | Southwest
1C 23 Fireball Fuchsia #22681 Astrobrights #22681 634645 REAM 500 S 9.50 | Southwest
1D 26 Galaxy Gold #22571 Astrobrights #22571 958671 REAM 500 $ 9.50 | Southwest
1E 65 Gamma Green #22541 Astrobrights #22541 491616 REAM 500 S 9.50 | Southwest
1F 56 Lift-Off Lemon #22631 Astrobrights #22631 507437 REAM 500 $ 9.50 | Southwest
1G 110 Lunar Blue #22521 Astrobrights #22521 491618 REAM 500 S 9.50 | Southwest
1H 0 Martian Green #22061 Astrobrights #22061 2657432 REAM 500 S 9.50 | Southwest
1l 76 Orbit Orange #22561 Astrobrights #22561 815741 REAM 500 $ 9.50 | Southwest
1) 26 Plasma Pink #22119 Astrobrights #22119 812505 REAM 500 $ 9.50 | Southwest
1K 50 Planetary Purple #22671 Astrobrights #22671 507438 REAM 500 $ 9.50 | Southwest
1L 26 Pulsar Pink #22621 Astrobrights #22621 491620 REAM 500 S 9.50 | Southwest
1M 65 Re-Entry Red #22551 Astrobrights #22551 491619 REAM 500 $ 9.50 | Southwest
IN 20 Rocket Red #22641 Astrobrights #22641 560490 REAM 500 $ 9.50 | Southwest
10 122 Solar Yellow #22531 Astrobrights #22531 491164 REAM 500 $ 9.50 | Southwest
1P 0 Sunburst Yellow #22591 Astrobrights #22591 2657427 REAM 500 S 9.50 | Southwest
1Q 80 Terra Green #22581 Astrobrights #22581 507430 REAM 500 S 9.50 | Southwest
1R 20 Terrestrial Teal #22479 Astrobrights #22479 812513 REAM 500 S 9.50 | Southwest
2 Equivalent to Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ Text, Wt. - 24/60, Finish - Smooth, 8.5 X 11.
2A 15 Celestial Blue #22661 Astrobrights #22661 815742 REAM 500 S 9.50 | Southwest
2B 63 Cosmic Orange #22651 Astrobrights #22651 491617 REAM 500 $ 9.50 | Southwest
2C 23 Fireball Fuchsia #22681 Astrobrights #22681 634645 REAM 500 S 9.50 | Southwest
2D 26 Galaxy Gold #22571 Astrobrights #22571 958671 REAM 500 $ 9.50 | Southwest
2E 65 Gamma Green #22541 Astrobrights #22541 491616 REAM 500 S 9.50 | Southwest
2F 56 Lift-Off Lemon #22631 Astrobrights #22631 507437 REAM 500 $ 9.50 | Southwest
2G 110 Lunar Blue #22521 Astrobrights #22521 491618 REAM 500 S 9.50 | Southwest
2H 0 Martian Green #22061 Astrobrights #22061 2657432 REAM 500 S 9.50 | Southwest
2| 76 Orbit Orange #22561 Astrobrights #22561 815741 REAM 500 $ 9.50 | Southwest
2) 26 Plasma Pink #22119 Astrobrights #22119 812505 REAM 500 $ 9.50 | Southwest
2K 50 Planetary Purple #22671 Astrobrights #22671 507438 REAM 500 $ 9.50 | Southwest
2L 26 Pulsar Pink #22621 Astrobrights #22621 491620 REAM 500 S 9.50 | Southwest
2M 65 Re-Entry Red #22551 Astrobrights #22551 491619 REAM 500 $ 9.50 | Southwest
2N 20 Rocket Red #22641 Astrobrights #22641 560490 REAM 500 $ 9.50 | Southwest
20 122 Solar Yellow #22531 Astrobrights #22531 491164 REAM 500 $ 9.50 | Southwest
2P 0 Sunburst Yellow #22591 Astrobrights #22591 2657427 REAM 500 S 9.50 | Southwest
2Q 80 Terra Green #22581 Astrobrights #22581 507430 REAM 500 S 9.50 | Southwest
2R 20 Terrestrial Teal #22479 Astrobrights #22479 812513 REAM 500 S 9.50 | Southwest

Section B - Xerographic Print Shop Paper Bid




NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM - ATTACHMENT B

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper Sponsoring District: Escondido Union School District
Bid No: P2024-10 Bid Administrator: Isaac Hernandez 760-432-2387 ishernandez@eusd.org
SECTION B - PRINT SHOP PAPER
I:\'e: Esﬂ:‘:‘:d Item Specification/Description Mfr/Product Name/Part# Vendor Stock # St[‘;;“:kg P‘:rosftsnl:it:g itkagn:::: Vendor
3 Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ COLORS, Text, 11x17, Wt. 60#, Smooth Finish, Colors, NO SUBSTITUTIONS
3A 0 Cosmic Orange #22653 Astrobrights #22653 1302752 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
3B 5 Fireball Fuchsia #22683 Astrobrights #22683 1302758 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
3C 0 Gamma Green #22543 Astrobrights #22543 1302766 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
3D 5 Lift-Off Lemon #22633 Astrobrights #22633 1302991 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
3E 6 Lunar Blue #22523 Astrobrights #22523 1302771 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
3F 5 Orbit Orange #22563 Astrobrights #22563 1302774 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
3G 3 Pulsar Pink #22623 Astrobrights #22623 1302997 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
3H 9 Re-Entry Red #22553 Astrobrights #22553 1302782 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
3l 0 Solar Yellow #22533 Astrobrights #22533 1302790 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
3J 5 Terra Green #22583 Astrobrights #22583 1302801 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
3K 0 Terrestrial Teal #22473 Astrobrights #22473 1302803 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
4 Equivalent to Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ COLORS, Text, 11x17, Wt. 60#, Smooth Finish, Colors
4A 10 Cosmic Orange #22653 Astrobrights #22653 1302752 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
4B 10 Fireball Fuchsia #22683 Astrobrights #22683 1302758 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
4C 10 Gamma Green #22543 Astrobrights #22543 1302766 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
4D 10 Lift-Off Lemon #22633 Astrobrights #22633 1302991 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
AE 10 Lunar Blue #22523 Astrobrights #22523 1302771 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
4F 10 Orbit Orange #22563 Astrobrights #22563 1302774 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
4G 10 Pulsar Pink #22623 Astrobrights #22623 1302997 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
4H 10 Re-Entry Red #22553 Astrobrights #22553 1302782 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
41 10 Solar Yellow #22533 Astrobrights #22533 1302790 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
4) 10 Terra Green #22583 Astrobrights #22583 1302801 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
4K 10 Terrestrial Teal #22473 Astrobrights #22473 1302803 REAM 500 S 38.18 | Kelly Spicers
Astroparche, Neenah Paper, Text, 8.5x11, Wt. 60#, Vellum Finish, Color Blue, NO
5 10 SUBSTITUTIONS NO BID NO BID REAM 500 NO BID NO BID
Equivalent to Astroparche, Neenah Paper, Text, 8.5x11, Wt. 60#, Vellum Finish,
6 0 Color Blue NO BID NO BID REAM 500 NO BID NO BID
Int. Paper Hammermill Radiant White #104604, Text Laser Print, 8.5x11, Wt. 24/60,
7 0 Smooth Finish, 98 Brightness, NO SUBSTITUTIONS Hammermill #104604 234377 REAM 500 S 7.90 | Southwest
Egivalent to Int. Paper Hammermill Radiant White #104604, Text Laser Print,
8 0 8.5x11, Wt. 24/60, Smooth Finish, 98 Brightness Hammermill #104604 234377 REAM 500 S 7.90 | Southwest
COVER & INDEX
Neenah CLASSIC CREST Rcyc 100 Bright White #14108, Cover, Wt. 80#, White,
9 5 8.5x11, Finish smooth, Brightness 95. NO SUBSTITUTIONS NO BID NO BID PKG 250 NO BID NO BID
10 0 Equivalent to Neenah CLASSIC CREST Rcyc 100 Bright White #14108, Cover, Wt.
80#, White, 8.5x11, Finish smooth, Brightness 95. NO AWARD NO AWARD PKG 250 NO AWARD NO AWARD
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NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM - ATTACHMENT B

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper Sponsoring District: Escondido Union School District
Bid No: P2024-10 Bid Administrator: Isaac Hernandez 760-432-2387 ishernandez@eusd.org

SECTION B - PRINT SHOP PAPER

I:\'e: Esﬂ:‘:‘:d Item Specification/Description Mfr/Product Name/Part# Vendor Stock # St[‘;;“:kg P‘:rosftsnl:it:g itkagn:::: Vendor
11 |[Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ Cover, Wt. 65#, Finish smooth, 8.5x11, Colors, NO SUBSTITUTIONS
11A 104 Celestial Blue #22861 Astrobrights #22861 958660 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
11B 251 Cosmic Orange #22851 Astrobrights #22851 495481 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
11C 174 Fireball Fuchsia #22881 Astrobrights #22881 853959 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
11D 26 Galaxy Gold #22771 Astrobrights #22771 958662 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
11E 208 Gamma Green #22741 Astrobrights #22741 495483 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
11F 50 Lift-Off Lemon #22831 Astrobrights #22831 508038 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
11G 261 Lunar Blue #22721 Astrobrights #22721 477581 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
11H 0 Martian Green #22071 Astrobrights #22071 2657431 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
111 66 Orbit Orange #22761 Astrobrights #22761 958673 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
11) 56 Plasma Pink #22129 Astrobrights #22129 812508 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
11K 70 Planetary Purple #22871 Astrobrights #22871 679891 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
11L 68 Pulsar Pink #22821 Astrobrights #22821 495484 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
11M 206 Re-Entry Red #22751 Astrobrights #22751 477582 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
11N 26 Rocket Red #22841 Astrobrights #22841 508041 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
110 298 Solar Yellow #22731 Astrobrights #22731 477580 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
11P 0 Sunburst Yellow #22791 Astrobrights #22791 2657426 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
11Q 36 Terra Green #22781 Astrobrights #22781 404620 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
11R 31 Terrestrial Teal #22109 Astrobrights #22109 812502 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
12 |Equivalent to Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ Cover, Wt. 65#, Finish smooth, 8.5x11, Colors
12A 104 Celestial Blue #22861 Astrobrights #22861 958660 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
12B 251 Cosmic Orange #22851 Astrobrights #22851 495481 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
12C 174 Fireball Fuchsia #22881 Astrobrights #22881 853959 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
12D 26 Galaxy Gold #22771 Astrobrights #22771 958662 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
12E 208 Gamma Green #22741 Astrobrights #22741 495483 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
12F 50 Lift-Off Lemon #22831 Astrobrights #22831 508038 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
12G 261 Lunar Blue #22721 Astrobrights #22721 477581 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
12H 0 Martian Green #22071 Astrobrights #22071 2657431 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
121 66 Orbit Orange #22761 Astrobrights #22761 958673 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
12) 56 Plasma Pink #22129 Astrobrights #22129 812508 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
12K 70 Planetary Purple #22871 Astrobrights #22871 679891 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
12L 68 Pulsar Pink #22821 Astrobrights #22821 495484 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
12M 206 Re-Entry Red #22751 Astrobrights #22751 477582 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
12N 26 Rocket Red #22841 Astrobrights #22841 508041 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
120 298 Solar Yellow #22731 Astrobrights #22731 477580 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
12P 0 Sunburst Yellow #22791 Astrobrights #22791 2657426 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
12Q 36 Terra Green #22781 Astrobrights #22781 404620 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
12R 31 Terrestrial Teal #22109 Astrobrights #22109 812502 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Southwest
13 [Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™, Cover, Wt. 65#, Finish smooth, 23x35, Colors listed, NO SUBSTITUTIONS
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NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM - ATTACHMENT B

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper Sponsoring District: Escondido Union School District
Bid No: P2024-10 Bid Administrator: Isaac Hernandez 760-432-2387 ishernandez@eusd.org
SECTION B - PRINT SHOP PAPER
I:\'e: Esﬂ:‘:‘:d Item Specification/Description Mfr/Product Name/Part# Vendor Stock # St[‘;;“:kg P‘:rosftsnl:it:g itkagn:::: Vendor
13A 0 Lunar Blue #22724 Astrobrights #22791 1302702 PKG 500 S 324.94 | Kelly Spicers
13B 0 Re-Entry Red #22754 Astrobrights #22754 1302716 PKG 500 S 324.94 | Kelly Spicers
13C 0 Solar Yellow #22734 Astrobrights #22734 1302724 PKG 500 S 324.94 | Kelly Spicers
13D 0 Terra Green #22784 Astrobrights #22784 1302740 PKG 500 S 324.94 | Kelly Spicers
13E 0 Orbit Orange #22764 Astrobrights #22764 1302705 PKG 500 S 324.94 | Kelly Spicers
13F 0 Terrestial Teal# 21854 Astrobrights #21854 1302741 PKG 500 S 324.94 | Kelly Spicers
14 |Equivalent to Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™, Cover, Wt. 65#, Finish smooth, 23x35, Colors listed.
14A 0 Lunar Blue #22724 Astrobrights #22791 1302702 PKG 500 S 324.94 | Kelly Spicers
14B 0 Re-Entry Red #22754 Astrobrights #22754 1302716 PKG 500 S 324.94 | Kelly Spicers
14C 0 Solar Yellow #22734 Astrobrights #22734 1302724 PKG 500 S 324.94 | Kelly Spicers
14D 0 Terra Green #22784 Astrobrights #22784 1302740 PKG 500 S 324.94 | Kelly Spicers
14E 0 Orbit Orange #22764 Astrobrights #22764 1302705 PKG 500 S 324.94 | Kelly Spicers
14F 0 Terrestial Teal# 21854 Astrobrights #21854 1302741 PKG 500 S 324.94 | Kelly Spicers
Int. Paper Springhill #016000 or Wausau,Paper Exact Vellum Cover, 8.5 x 11 White,
15 3,821 Wt. 67#, Finish Vellom Bristol, Brightness 92, Bristol #82211 NO SUBSTITUTIONS Exact #016000 831298 PKG 250 S 6.00 | Southwest
Equivalent to Int. Paper Springhill #016000 or Wausau,Paper Exact Vellum Cover,
16 3,821 8.5 x 11 White, Wt. 674#, Finish Vellom Bristol, Brightness 92, Bristol #82211 Lettermark 94338 759119 PKG 250 s 5.95 | southwest
17 |Int. Paper Springhill, Cover, Wt.67#, Finish Vellom Bristol, 8.5x11, Colors listed. NO SUBSTITUTIONS
17A 432 Blue #026000 Springhill #026000 SGH026000 PKG 250 S 9.50 | Carroll
178 377 Canary #036000 Springhill #036000 SGH036000 PKG 250 S 7.10 | Carroll
17C 111 Cream #097000 Springhill #097000 1301701 PKG 250 S 10.76 | Kelly Spicers
17D 226 Goldenrod #086000 Springhill #086000 1301695 PKG 250 S 10.76 | Kelly Spicers
17E 394 Green #046000 Springhill #046000 1301438 PKG 250 S 10.76 | Kelly Spicers
17F 196 Ilvory #056000 Springhill #056000 1301697 PKG 250 S 10.76 | Kelly Spicers
17G 152 Gray #066000 Springhill #066000 1301696 PKG 250 S 10.76 | Kelly Spicers
17H 313 Pink #076000 Springhill #076000 SGH076000 PKG 250 S 6.85 | Carroll
18 |[Equivalent to Int. Paper Springhill, Cover, Wt.67#, Finish Vellom Bristol, 8.5x11, Colors listed.
18A 432 Blue #026000 Springhill #026000 1301694 PKG 250 S 10.76 | Kelly Spicers
18B 377 Canary #036000 Springhill #036000 1301700 PKG 250 S 10.76 | Kelly Spicers
18C 111 Cream #097000 Springhill #097000 1301701 PKG 250 S 10.76 | Kelly Spicers
18D 226 Goldenrod #086000 Springhill #086000 1301695 PKG 250 S 10.76 | Kelly Spicers
18E 394 Green #046000 Springhill #046000 1301438 PKG 250 S 10.76 | Kelly Spicers
18F 196 lvory #056000 Springhill #056000 1301697 PKG 250 S 10.76 | Kelly Spicers
18G 152 Gray #066000 Springhill #066000 1301696 PKG 250 S 10.76 | Kelly Spicers
18H 313 Pink #076000 Springhill #076000 SGH076000 PKG 250 S 6.85 | Carroll
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NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM - ATTACHMENT B

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper Sponsoring District: Escondido Union School District
Bid No: P2024-10 Bid Administrator: Isaac Hernandez 760-432-2387 ishernandez@eusd.org
SECTION B - PRINT SHOP PAPER
I:\'e:‘ Esﬂ:‘:‘:d Item Specification/Description Mfr/Product Name/Part# Vendor Stock # St::;;lkg Ptrosftsnl:it:g it:gn:::;: Vendor
19 |[Int. Paper Springhill, Cover, Wt. 67#, Finish Vellum Bristol, 11x17, Colors listed. NO SUBSTITUTIONS
19A 125 Blue #026004 Springhill #026004 1301713 PKG 250 S 22.76 | Kelly Spicers
198 117 Canary #036004 Springhill #036004 1301714 PKG 250 S 22.76 | Kelly Spicers
19C 141 Green #046004 Springhill #046004 1301553 PKG 250 S 22.76 | Kelly Spicers
19D 117 Pink #076004 Springhill #076004 1301724 PKG 250 S 22.76 | Kelly Spicers
19E 117 Goldenrod #086004 Springhill #086004 1301715 PKG 250 S 22.76 | Kelly Spicers
19F 185 White# 016004 Springhill #016004 1301712 PKG 250 S 21.94 | Kelly Spicers
20 |Equivalent to Int. Paper Springhill, Cover, Wt. 67#, Finish Vellum Bristol, 11x17, Colors listed.
20A 125 Blue #026004 Springhill #026004 1301713 PKG 250 S 22.76 | Kelly Spicers
20B 117 Canary #036004 Springhill #036004 1301714 PKG 250 S 22.76 | Kelly Spicers
20C 141 Green #046004 Springhill #046004 1301553 PKG 250 S 22.76 | Kelly Spicers
20D 117 Pink #076004 Springhill #076004 1301724 PKG 250 S 22.76 | Kelly Spicers
20E 117 Goldenrod #086004 Springhill #086004 1301715 PKG 250 S 22.76 | Kelly Spicers
20F 185 White# 016004 Springhill #016004 1301712 PKG 250 S 21.94 | Kelly Spicers
Color Copy Digital Photo White, Cover, Wt. 60#, Finish smooth, 8.5x11, Brightness
21 16 100, Int. Paper Hammermill # 122549 NO SUBSTITUTIONS Hammermill #122549 HAM122549 PKG 250 $ 8.35 | Carroll
Equivalent to Color Copy Digital Photo White, Cover, Wt. 604, Finish smooth,
22 16 8.5x11, Brightness 100, Int. Paper Hammermill # 122549 Hammermill #122549 397186 PKG 250 $ 8.35 | Southwest
Color Copy Digital Cover, Finish Vellum Bristol, Wt. 80#, White, 11x17, Brightness
23 96 100, Int. Paper Hammermill #120037 NO SUBSTITUTIONS Hammermill #120037 HAM120037 PKG 250 $ 23.69 | Carroll
Equivalent to Color Copy Digital Cover, Finish Vellum Bristol, Wt. 80#, White,
24 9 11x17, Brightness 100, Int. Paper Hammermill #120037 Hammermill #120037 HAM120037 PKG 250 $ 23.69 | carroll
25 |Int. Paper Springhill Colors or Equivalent, Index Digital, Wt. 90#, Finish Bristol, 8.5x11, Colors as listed. NO SUBSTITUTIONS
25A 36 Cherry #075100 Hammermill #075100 1301748 PKG 250 S 12.00 | Kelly Spicers
25B 24 Salmon #085100 Hammermill #085100 1301747 PKG 250 S 12.00 | Kelly Spicers
26 |Equivalent to Int. Paper Springhill Colors or Equivalent, Index Digital, Wt. 90#, Finish Bristol, 8.5x11, Colors as listed.
26A 36 Cherry #075100 Hammermill #075100 1301748 PKG 250 S 12.00 | Kelly Spicers
26B 24 Salmon #085100 Hammermill #085100 SGH085101 PKG 250 S 7.50 | Carroll
WRITING
27 |BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP, Writing, Finish bond, 8.5 x11, Wt. 20 Colors listed. NO SUBSTITUTIONS
27A 1,285 Blue # 103309 Hammermill #103309 103309 REAM 500 S 6.47 | Complete Office
27B 691 Canary # 103341 Hammermill #103341 103341 REAM 500 $ 6.47 | Complete Office
27C 188 Cream # 168030 Hammermill #168030 168030 REAM 500 S 6.47 | Complete Office
27D 409 Goldenrod # 103168 Hammermill #103168 103168 REAM 500 S 6.47 | Complete Office
27E 671 Green # 103366 Hammermill #103366 103366 REAM 500 S 6.47 | Complete Office
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Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper

Bid No: P2024-10

Sponsoring District: Escondido Union School District
Bid Administrator: Isaac Hernandez 760-432-2387 ishernandez@eusd.org

SECTION B - PRINT SHOP PAPER

I:\'e: Esﬂ:‘:‘:d Item Specification/Description Mfr/Product Name/Part# Vendor Stock # St[‘;;“:kg P‘:rosftsnl:it:g itkagn:::: Vendor
27F 190 Lilac # 102269 Hammermill #102269 102269 REAM 500 S 6.47 | Complete Office
27G 339 Pink # 103382 Hammermill #103382 103382 REAM 500 S 6.47 | Complete Office
27H 321 Salmon # 103119 Hammermill #103119 103119 REAM 500 S 6.47 | Complete Office
28 |Equivalent to BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP, Writing, Finish bond, 8.5 x11, Wt. 20 Colors listed
28A 1,285 Blue # 103309 Xerox Vitality 3R05856 REAM 500 S 5.39 | Complete Office
28B 691 Canary # 103341 Xerox Vitality 3R05858 REAM 500 S 5.39 | Complete Office
28C 188 Cream # 168030 Xerox Vitality 3R05862 REAM 500 S 5.39 | Complete Office
28D 409 Goldenrod # 103168 Xerox Vitality 3R05861 REAM 500 S 5.39 | Complete Office
28E 671 Green # 103366 Xerox Vitality 3R05857 REAM 500 S 5.39 | Complete Office
28F 190 Lilac # 102269 Xerox Vitality 3R11230 REAM 500 S 5.39 | Complete Office
28G 339 Pink # 103382 Xerox Vitality 3R05859 REAM 500 S 5.39 | Complete Office
28H 321 Salmon # 103119 Xerox Vitality 3R11231 REAM 500 S 5.39 | Complete Office
29 |BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP, Writing, Finish bond, 11 x17, Wt. 20 Colors listed. NO SUBSTITUTIONS
29A 125 Blue # 102137 Hammermill #102137 1500697 REAM 500 S 14.95 | Kelly Spicers
29B 100 Canary # 102152 Hammermill #102152 1500698 REAM 500 S 14.95 | Kelly Spicers
29C 11 Gray #102178 Hammermill #102178 1500700 REAM 500 S 14.95 | Kelly Spicers
29D 105 Green # 102186 Hammermill #102186 1500701 REAM 500 S 14.95 | Kelly Spicers
29E 95 Pink # 102368 Hammermill #102368 1500703 REAM 500 S 14.95 | Kelly Spicers
29F 115 Salmon # 102103 Hammermill #102103 1500704 REAM 500 S 14.95 | Kelly Spicers
30 |[Equivalent to BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP, Writing, Finish bond, 11 x17, Wt. 20 Colors listed.
30a 125 Blue # 102137 Hammermill #102137 1500697 REAM 500 S 14.95 | Kelly Spicers
30B 100 Canary # 102152 Hammermill #102152 1500698 REAM 500 S 14.95 | Kelly Spicers
30C 11 Gray #102178 Hammermill #102178 1500700 REAM 500 S 14.95 | Kelly Spicers
30D 105 Green # 102186 Hammermill #102186 1500701 REAM 500 S 14.95 | Kelly Spicers
30E 95 Pink # 102368 Hammermill #102368 1500703 REAM 500 S 14.95 | Kelly Spicers
30F 115 Salmon # 102103 Hammermill #102103 1500704 REAM 500 S 14.95 | Kelly Spicers
BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP White #103192, Writing, Finish
31 111 bond,Wt. 20, White, 11x17, Brightness 96. NO SUBSTITUTIONS Elite Screens #103192 103192 REAM 500 $ 11.99 | Complete Office
Equivalent to BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP White #103192,
32 111 Writing, Finish bond,Wt. 20, White, 11x17, Brightness 96 HAM103192 REAM 500 $ 13.59 | carroll
Opaque Domtar Husky # 5462 Offset, Finish smooth, White, 8.5x11, Wt. 60#,
33 0 Brightness 94. NO SUBSTITUTIONS Domtar #5462 1301165 REAM 500 $ 6.60 [ Kelly Spicers
Equivalent to Opaque Domtar Husky # 5462, Offset, Finish smooth, White, 8.5x11,
34 0 Wt. 60#, Brightness 94. Domtar #5462 1301165 REAM 500 $ 6.60 [ Kelly Spicers
CARBONLESS SETS (NCR)
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NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM - ATTACHMENT B

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper Sponsoring District: Escondido Union School District
Bid No: P2024-10 Bid Administrator: Isaac Hernandez 760-432-2387 ishernandez@eusd.org

SECTION B - PRINT SHOP PAPER

Item Estimated e is L. Stnd. Pk; # Of Sheet: Standard
Item Specification/Description Mfr/Product Name/Part# Vendor Stock # n = eets andar

Vend
No. Usage uom Per Stnd. Pkg Pkg Price endor

Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5887,
Carbonless, 2 parts, Canary /White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.
35 20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS Superior #5887 2500154 REAM 500 S 18.65 | Kelly Spicers

Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior
#5887, Carbonless, 2 parts, Canary /White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.
36 13 Superior #5887 2500154 REAM 500 S 18.65 | Kelly Spicers

Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5900,
Carbonless, 3 parts, Pink/Canary/White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.
37 10 NO SUBSTITUTIONS Superior #5900 2500429 REAM 500 S 20.97 | Kelly Spicers

Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior

#5900, Carbonless, 3 parts, Pink/C White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.
38 0 , Carbonless, 3 parts, Pink/Canary/White, 8.5x11, Brightness White Superior #5900 2500429 REAM 500 $ 20.97 | Kelly Spicers

Pre-collated, heavyweight,STRAIGHT Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5909,
Carbonless, 3 parts, White/Canary/Pink, 8.5x11, Brightness white 92.
39 20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS Superior #5909 2500173 REAM 500 S 20.97 | Kelly Spicers

Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight,STRAIGHT Sequence Appleton Superior #
5909, Carbonless, 3 parts, White/Canary/Pink, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.
40 20 Superior #5909 2500173 REAM 500 S 20.97 | Kelly Spicers

Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior #5891,
Carbonless, 2-Part, White/Canary, 11x17, Brightness white 92.
41 6 NO SUBSTITUTIONS Superior #5891 2500057 REAM 500 S 15.25 | Kelly Spicers

Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton Superior
#5891, Carbonless, 2-part, White/Canary, 11x17, Brightness White 92.
42 6 Superior #5891 2500057 REAM 500 S 15.25 | Kelly Spicers

Pre-collated, heavyweight,STRAIGHT Sequence Appleton NCR Superior #5911,
Carbonless, 3 parts, White/Canary/Pink, 11x17, Brightness white 92.
43 10 NO SUBSTITUTIONS Superior #5911 2500174 REAM 500 S 17.20 | Kelly Spicers

Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight,STRAIGHT Sequence Appleton NCR Superior
#5911, Carbonless, 3 parts, White/Canary/Pink, 11x17, Brightness White 92.

44 10 Superior #5911 2500174 REAM 500 S 17.20 | Kelly Spicers
Pre-collated, REVERSE Sequence Glatfelter Excel One # 16557, Carbonless, 2 parts,

45 0 Canary/White, 8.5x11, Wt. 20 NO SUBSTITUTIONS NO BID NO BID REAM 500 NO BID NO BID
Equivalent to Pre-collated, REVERSE Sequence Glatfelter Excel One # 16557

46 0 Carbonless, 2 parts, Canary/White, 8.5x11, Wt. 20 Superior # 5887 2500147 REAM 500 S 18.65 | Kelly Spicers

47 60 Superior Reverse Pink/White 2pt, 8.5" X 11" or equal Superior #5896 2500164 REAM 500 S 20.20 | Kelly Spicers

48 0 Superior Reverse Pink/White 2pt, 8.5" X 14" or equal Superior #5897 2500165 REAM 500 S 25.68 | Kelly Spicers

49 105 Superior Reverse Canary/White 2pt, 8.5" X 14" or equal Superior #5889 2500056 REAM 500 S 25.67 | Kelly Spicers

50 80 Superior Reverse Pink/Canary/White 3pt, 8.5" X 14" equal Superior #5902 2500156 REAM 500 S 28.87 | Kelly Spicers

ENVELOPES
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Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
Bid No: P2024-10

Sponsoring District: Escondido Union School District
Bid Administrator: Isaac Hernandez 760-432-2387 ishernandez@eusd.org

SECTION B - PRINT SHOP PAPER

I:\'e:‘ Esﬂ:‘:‘:d Item Specification/Description Mfr/Product Name/Part# Vendor Stock # St:;;';kg Ptrosftsnl:it:g itkagn::::: Vendor
#10 REGULAR with gum seal Southland #10 , Finish woven, Wt. 24, White
51 25 Kelly #72964 3005609 Box 500 S 23.64 | Kelly Spicers
Equivalent to #10 REGULAR with gum seal Southland #10 , Finish woven, Wt. 24,
52 0 White UNV35210 Box 500 S 10.95 | Carroll
0 #10 gum sealed Window Envelope, White Wove, 24#, White, Diagonal Seamed
53 NO BID NO BID Box 500 NO BID NO BID
MISCELLANEOUS
54 21 804 Gloss Cover 12" x 18" Kelly - 4002860 1105732 Case 575 S 59.45 | Kelly Spicers
55 4 80# Gloss Text 12" x 18" Kelly - 4002854 1100204 Case 1200 S 66.23 | Kelly Spicers
56 4 130# Gloss Cover 13" x 19" Kelly - 4002870 1107404 Case 350 S 68.00 | Kelly Spicers
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NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM - ATTACHMENT B

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper

Bid No: P2024-10

Sponsoring District: Escondido Union School District
Bid Administrator: Isaac Hernandez 760-432-2387 ishernandez@eusd.org

SECTION C - Large Format

Estimated Mfr/Product Name/Part# Vendor Stnd. Pkg | # Of Units Standard Vendor
Item No. Item Specification/Description Stock # uom Per Stnd. Pkg Price
Usage
Pkg
Paper
1 2 Photo Paper 9mil 54" x 100' 3" Core Sihi - 36990000413C 7002479 Roll 1 S 224.63 Kelly Paper
2 7 8.4Mil Text Gloss Paper 3" core, 54-60" wide, 150-164' long, UV ink compatible, or equal Sihi - 33570000413C 7002229 Roll 1 S 252.37 Kelly Paper
3 4 8.4Mil Text Matte Paper 3" core, 54-60" wide, 150-164' long or equal Sihi - 3686000041G2 7001099 Roll 1 S 250.21 Kelly Paper
Self Adhesive Vinyl
Short Life R ble PSA Calendered Adhesive White 3" , 3.5-4.5mil, 150-164' long, UV ink )
or |.e emovable alendere esive fre 5 core m ong n Que Media - QM-VGBF-54 7005347 Roll 1 S 223.82 Kelly Paper
4 3 compatible, or equal
Short Life Permanent PSA Calendered Adhesive White 3" core, 3.5-4.5mil, 150-164' long, UV ink
. & Que Media - QM-VMBF-55 7005369 Roll 1 S 223.82 Kelly Paper
5 0 compatible or equal
L Life R le PSA Adhesive White 3" , 2.5-3.5mil, 150-164" | , UV ink tible, . .
ong Life Removable PSA Cast Adhesive White 3" core, mi ong ink compatible, or No Bid No Bid Roll 1 No Bid No Bid
6 2 equal
i ive White 3" , 2.5-3.5mil, 150-164' | , UV ink tible, . . .
Long Life Permanent PSA Cast Adhesive ite 3" core, mi ong ink compatible, or No Bid No Bid Roll 1 No Bid No Bid
7 2 equal
Wall Mountable Vinyl PSA Calendered Adhesive (fi ted) 3" , 5-6mil 150-164' Long, UV ink
a c:)un able Viny alendere esive (fire rated) 3" core m one n Nekoosa - SPMWG65450N 7001971 Roll 1 S 424.35 Kelly Paper
8 1 compatible or equal
9 5 Window Perf Adhesive 70/30 3" core, 54" wide, 100-150' long, UV ink compatible, or equal Daf Rill - RILLT7015-54164 7004783 Roll 1 468.35 Kelly Paper
Banner
10 5 130z Scrim Banner Matte, 3" core, font lit, 38" wide, 150-164' long, UV ink compatible, or equal Ultra Flex - JFM0965050 7002056 Roll 1 S 119.60 Kelly Paper
11 2 130z Scrim Banner Matte, 3" core, font lit, 54" wide, 150-164' long, UV ink compatible, or equal Ultra Flex - JFM137050 7002377 Roll 1 S 169.93 Kelly Paper
12 1 130z Scrim Banner Matte, 3" core, font lit, 63" wide, 150-164' long, UV ink compatible, or equal Ultra Flex - JFIM160050 7002418 Roll 1 S 198.26 Kelly Paper
13 3 130z Scrim Banner Gloss, 3" core, font lit, 38" wide, 150-164' long, UV ink compatible, or equal Ultra Flex - JFG0965050 7002215 Roll 1 S 119.60 Kelly Paper
14 6 130z Scrim Banner Gloss, 3" core, font lit, 54" wide, 150-164' long, UV ink compatible, or equal Ultra Flex - JFG137050 7002376 Roll 1 S 169.93 Kelly Paper
15 0 130z Scrim Banner Gloss, 3" core, font lit, 63" wide, 150-164' long, UV ink compatible, or equal Ultra Flex - JFG160050 7002216 Roll 1 S 198.26 Kelly Paper
16 5 Ultraflex SuperPrint Plus FL 130z 63" X 164' Matte 3" Core or equal Ultra Flex - JFIM160050 7002418 Roll 1 S 198.26 Kelly Paper
17 4 Ultraflex SuperPrint Plus FL 130z 54" X 164' Matte 3" Core or equal Ultra Flex - JFM137050 7002377 Roll 1 S 169.93 Kelly Paper
18 0 Ultraflex SuperPrint Plus FL 130z 38" X 164' Matte 3" Core or equal Ultra Flex - JFM0965050 7002056 Roll 1 S 119.60 Kelly Paper
Specialty
19 6 10mil Rigid Vinyl, 3" core, 54" wide, 150-164' long, UV ink compatible, or equal No Bid No Bid Roll 1 No Bid No Bid
Consumables
20 | 15 Banner Seam Tape, 1" wide, 100-150' long or equal Budnick - TIGTAPE1036-36 7004451 Roll 1 S 12.35 Kelly Paper
21 | 5 Banner Seam Tape, 1.5" wide, 100-150' long or equal No Bid No Bid Roll 1 No Bid No Bid
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