


Date: 

To:  

From:  

Subject: 

September 11, 2024 

Members 
Associate Members 

Cathy Brizes,Encinitas Union School District
Bid Administrator 

Amendment No. 1 
Bid # 2024-12, Title:  PE & Athletic Supply Bid 

BACKGROUND INFORMATION: 

DISCONTINUED ITEM Line item #29 – Soccer ball, weight #5, 32 panel nylon wound, pebble finish 
Cannon PSB05 4921, VOIT-VCS33XXX or equal has been discontinued. Cannon Sports has provided 
a supporting letter for the model being discontinued. There is a substitute item suggested at no cost 
increase. The suggested soccer ball official size 5, a smooth rubber finish, is item#4919. This ball is 
identical in design to line item # 30, Soccer ball, official size 4, rubber, Western Star WS101, VOIT-
VCS66HXX or equal, with the difference of size and no pebble-finish, is currently awarded to Cannon 
Sports. 

Product Change with No Price Changes 1. Line # 29 - Soccer ball, weight #5, 32 panel nylon wound, 
pebble finish Cannon PSB05 4921, VOIT-VCS33XXX or equal has been discontinued. The 
replacement item has been assigned item #4919. This model is same as line#30 description/model. The 
price will remain the same at $2.79 each. 

 RECOMMENDATION Please approve revisions to line #29 as presented. 



Page 1 of 1
NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM

AWARDED VENDOR LIST

BID TITLE:  PE & Athletic Supply Bid SPONSORING DISTRICT:  Encinitas Union School District DELIVERY A.R.O.:  10 Days
BID NUMBER:  2024-12 DISTRICT CONTACT:  Kerry Baker MIN QTY FOR FREE FREIGHT:  $100.00
CONTRACT PERIOD:  01.01.24 – 12.31.24 E-MAIL:  kerry.baker@eusd.net

VENDOR  NAME ADDRESS PHONE/FAX NUMBERS CONTACT  NAME CATALOG / VOLUME 
DISCOUNT

BSN Sports/US Games
REFER TO BID #23-2049154 ON ALL PO’S

PO Box 78268
Corona, CA  92877-0142

Phone: 800-959-1844
Fax: 800-921-2515

Ruben Agustin (x90009)
ragustin@bsnsports.com

10% 
See Attached Terms

Cannon Sports PO Box 11179
Burbank, CA 91510

Phone: 800-223-0064
Fax: 800-388-1993

Bobby Spindler
orders@cannonsports.com

N/A

Lakeshore Learning Materials 2695 E. Dominguez Street
Carson, CA 90895

Phone: 800-421-5354
Fax: 310-537-7990

Mark Rivas
mrivas@lakeshorelearning.com See Attached

Pyramid School Products
*REFER TO Bid #2024-12ENC ON ALL PO’S

6510 N 54th Street
Tampa, FL  33610-1908

Phone: 800-792-2644
Fax: 813-621-7688

Kenneth Miller
biddept@pyramidsp.com N/A

School Specialty
REFER TO BID #Q-2406725 ON ALL PO’S

W6316 Design Drive
Greenville, WI  54942

Phone: 888-388-3224
Fax: 888-388-6344

Jamie Young
bidwestnotices@schoolspecialty.com

35% Catalog
See exclusions

Universal Athletic LLC DBA Game One 912 N 7th Ave.
Bozeman, MT 59715

Phone: 920-619-0601
Fax: 623-878-1933

Jason Kalsow
Jason.kalsow@game-one.com See Attached

*IN ADDITION TO REFERENCING THE APPROPRIATE BID # - NOTE:   “FREE SHIPPING ON ORDERS OVER $100.00”



ITEM # EST 
USAGE UOM ITEM SPECIFICATION AWARDED 

VENDOR
MODEL #/ AND MFG #
REF CATALOG PAGE

UNIT 
PRICE

WARRANTY 
OFFERED

BASEBALL:

1 10 EA
All-Synthetic Baseball Glove 13”L, Gopher 42-139 or 
Equal School Specialty SS# 2123977; FLAGHOUSE #2460L-FH; Page #Web  $      18.80 1 Year

2 16 SET

Base, Orange, rubber:  3 bases & home plate, throw 
down type Cannon 

030392, Cannon Sports Orange Throw Down Bases

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-030382-
orange-throw-down-base-set-with-home-plate-for-baseball-

softball-and-practice?_pos=1&_sid=327c309f2&_ss=r

6.49$        1 YR

BASKETBALL:

3 594 EA

Ball, official size #7 rubber covered waterproof, 
Western Star WSB100 or equal Cannon

0480, Cannon Sports 
Official Size Rubber 

Basketball 29.5"

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-0480-official-
size-29-5-inch-rubber-

basketball?_pos=1&_sid=466994f90&_ss=r

3.23$        1 YR

4 15 EA
Ball, official size, composite leather, Spalding TF1000 
or equal BSN Sports MACGREGOR MCX6000X, BSN page 114 15.88$      ONE YEAR

5 600 EA

Ball, junior size, rubber covered waterproof, Western 
Star WSB105, VOIT-VCB6HXXX or equal Cannon

0489, Cannon Sports Junior 
Size Rubber Basketball 27.5"

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-0489-junior-
size-27-5-inch-rubber-

basketball?_pos=1&_sid=518eeaa0f&_ss=r

3.11$        1 YR

6 32 SET
Ball, junior size, #5, rubber covered, rainbow colored, 
set of 6, Gopher GL61-266 or equal BSN Sports MACGREGOR 93400, BSN page 452 34.96$      ONE YEAR

7 1163 EA

Ball, intermediate size, MacGregor X500 MCX500XX 
or equal Cannon

0487, Cannon Sports
Intermediate Rubber Size

Basketball 28.5"

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-0487-
intermediate-size-28-5-inch-rubber-

basketball?_pos=1&_sid=3c531dcf7&_ss=r

3.14$        1 YR

8 5 EA
Ball, intermediate size, composite leather, Spalding 
TF1008 or equal BSN Sports MACGREGOR MCX6285X, BSN page 114 14.93$      ONE YEAR

9 50 EA
Ball, Mikasa, rubber BX 1000, VOIT-VCB2HXXX or 
equal BSN Sports VOIT VCB2HXXX, BSN page 119 5.43$        ONE YEAR

10 15 EA Front mount double rim basketball goal Pyramid School 
Products GARED #240  $    138.99 STANDARD 

MANUFACTURER'S)

11 15 EA
Lifetime Pro Court adjustable portable basketball 
system (44" backboard) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

12 35 EA
Net, basketball, heavy cord, polyethylene outdoor, 
Carron 10209 or equal School Specialty SS# 2121299; FLAGHOUSE #650E-FH; Page #Web  $        1.11 1 Year

13 20 EA Net, Heavy-Duty Anti-Whip. Item SNBBNWIPY Pyramid School 
Products CHAMPION #409  $        2.09 STANDARD 

MANUFACTURER'S)

14 15 EA
Rims/goals 12 loop heavy double rim, Bison BA37M 
or equal BSN Sports GARED 1237474, BSN page 126 158.33$     ONE YEAR



15 30 EA
Wilson Evolution. Size 7. 29.5" basketball. Item 
1013900 BSN Sports NIKE NKN100011485507, BSN page 115 36.88$      ONE YEAR

16 30 EA
Women's Basketball, 28.5", ProRubber, 
Sportime/017074 (or comparable) BSN Sports VOIT VCB8HXXX, BSN page 119 5.90$        ONE YEAR

17 30 EA
The Rock c2C Composite Game Ball. Official Size 
29.5". Item 1394967 BSN Sports THE ROCK 1394967, BSN page 116 29.38$      ONE YEAR

18 30 EA
Women's Basketball, 28.5", Intermediate, 
SPALDING/008194 (or comparable)            BSN Sports VOIT 1235548, BSN page 119 7.86$        ONE YEAR

FOOTBALL:

19 447 EA

Ball, intermediate size, rubber covered, Western Star 
F-7, VOIT-VCF7SHXX or equal Cannon

2031, Cannon Sports
Intermediate Size Rubber

Football

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-2031-rubber-
football-for-games-training-practice-

intermediate?_pos=1&_sid=cde6e376c&_ss=r

2.77$        1 YR

20 85 EA

Ball, junior size, rubber covered, Cannon CSI F2, 
VOIT-VCF6SHXX or equal Cannon

2032, Cannon Sports Junior
Size Rubber Football

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-2032-rubber-
football-for-games-training-practice-

junior?_pos=1&_sid=46a256cbb&_ss=r

2.71$        1 YR

21 5 EA

Ball, official size and weight rubber covered Cannon 
CSIF6 2030, VOIT-VCF9SHXX or equal Cannon

2030, Cannon Sports Official
Size Rubber Football

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-2030-rubber-
football-for-games-training-practice-

official?_pos=1&_sid=bd95af466&_ss=r

2.83$        1 YR

22 5 SET
Ball, Fun Gripper, vinyl fabric w/foam mesh grip, 
rainbow, 6/set, Gopher 47-748 or equal BSN Sports FUN GRIPPER 80700XXX (6/SET)  US Games page 46 70.08$      ONE YEAR

23 10 EA
Wilson GST NCAA 1003 Official Leather Football
NOTE: CIF Approved New to Bid

Game One Wilson GST 1003 $90 1 year

24 10 EA
Wilson GST  Prime Football
NOTE: CIF Approved New to Bid Game One Wilson WTF1103V $110 1 Year

25 35 SET

Flag, belts, adjustable one size fits all.  Set Includes: 
Heavy duty web belt with metal tip and 2 vinyl slides 
with Velcro and 18” vinyl flags

BSN Sports

MSFBBLUA (BLUE)                MSFBREDA (RED)
MSFBYELA (YELLOW)              BSN MSFB

(Please Specify Colors: BLUE, RED, YELLOW)             
BSN page 193

1.28$        ONE YEAR

26 43 SET

Flag belt, triple threat - Specify Size & Color BSN Sports

TRIPLE THREAT, 1149487 (RED) 1149524 
(YELLOW), 1149562 (BLUE) 1149609 

(GREEN) (Please specify sizes & colors -  Small, Medium, 
Large, XLarge; Red, Yellow, Blue, & Green)

BSN page 193

1.73$        ONE YEAR

27 15 PK

Flag, replacement for Flag Belt, color blue, red or 
yellow, 6/pack.  Indicate color w/#’s BSN Sports

BSN MSFLAGS (6 each/pack)
MSFLAGSRPK (RED) MSFLAGSYPK (YELLOW)

MSFLAGSRBK (BLUE) US 
GAMES page 207

2.18$        ONE YEAR

SOCCER:

28 10 EA R Tuff foam ball or equal School Specialty SS# 009554; SPORTIME #009554; Page #94  $        4.45 1 Year



29 287 EA

Soccer ball, weight #5, 32 panel nylon wound, pebble 
finish Cannon PSB05 4921, VOIT-VCS33XXX or 
equal NOTE: Replacement item #4919. rubber, 
Western Star WS101, VOIT-VCS66HXX or equal

Cannon

4919, Cannon Sports Size 5
Smooth Soccer Ball

Black/White

https://tinyurl.com/NCEPC-Line-29
2.79$  1 YR

30 1308 EA

Soccer ball, Official size 4, rubber, Western Star 
WS101, VOIT-VCS66HXX or equal Cannon

4920, Cannon Sports Size 4
Smooth Soccer Ball

Black/White

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-4920-black-
white-rubber-soccer-ball-for-games-agility-training-and-practice-

smooth-size-4?_pos=1&_sid=33a35ce9a&_ss=r

2.69$  1 YR

31 781 EA

Soccer ball, Official size, synthetic leather, kickoff, 
Mikasa SWK01 310, MacGregor-MCLS303X or equal BSN Sports MACGREGOR MCS30005, BSN page 259 6.23$  ONE YEAR

32 99 EA
Soccer ball, size 5, synthetic leather Tachikara 4948 
ST-5S, MacGregor 70200235 or equal BSN Sports BSN 1384325, BSN page 259 6.83$  ONE YEAR

33 39 SET
Soccer ball, size 5, rubber covered, rainbow colored, 
set of 6, Gopher GL61-630 or equal BSN Sports MACGREGOR 94500, BSN page 452 28.20$  ONE YEAR

34 10 EA

Pro Style Soccer Goal, steel, 4” heavy duty mesh 
netting, 6’H x 12’W x 4’D, S&S Worldwide W8577 or 
equal. 

School Specialty SS# 025079; MYLEC #647; Page #130  $    119.00 1 Year

35 46 SET
Soccer Goal, Pop Up 6’, set includes 2 goals, pegs 
and carrying bag, PUGG or equal School Specialty SS# 1385189; CHAMPION SPORTS #SG7240; Page #129  $  49.35 1 Year

36 30 EA Nike Academy Soccer Ball. Size 5. Item NKCU8047 BSN Sports NIKE NKCU8033101050, BSN page 257 13.28$  ONE YEAR

37 10 EA
Spalding TF-SC5 White/Black Soccer Ball. Item 
WC648678 BSN Sports SPALDING WC648678, BSN page 257 61.90$  ONE YEAR

38 4 EA
Funnet goal 4x6x2 with Net. Soccer goal. Item 
1150025. BSN Sports FUNNET 1150025, BSN page 274 148.00$    ONE YEAR

39 2 EA
Agora 4 " Channel Pro Soccer Goal. 6'6"x18'6". Item 
SA-GCP618S NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SOFTBALL:

40 13 EA

Ball, Super-Soft, 12”, Baden S3R, VOIT-VSBC812 or 
equal (order by dozen) Cannon

03421, Cannon Sports Sponge
Center Softballs (12 pack)

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-03421-
sponge-center-softballs-for-batting-practice-training-12-

pack?_pos=1&_sid=f47d2210d&_ss=r

 37.14/DZ 1 YR

41 6 SET
Bases, all rubber construction 14”x14” beveled edges, 
set of 5 BSN Sports MACGREGOR 1235623, US GAMES page 204 7.60$  ONE YEAR

42 3 EA Bat, aluminum, Louisville 29” or equal Pyramid School 
Products LOUISVILLE DIVA #WBL2552010175  $  33.99 STANDARD 

MANUFACTURER'S)

43 3 EA Bat, aluminum size 31” Powerflite or equal Pyramid School 
Products LOUISVILLE DIVA #WBL2552010175  $  33.99 STANDARD 

MANUFACTURER'S)

44 3 EA Bat, aluminum size 32” Powerflite or equal Pyramid School 
Products LOUISVILLE QUEST #WBL255101020  $  59.99 STANDARD 

MANUFACTURER'S)



TENNIS:

45 10 CAN

Ball, tennis, heavy duty optic yellow for practice 
(3/can), no blemishes, Wilson T1019, PENN-
MTPENBAL or equal

Pyramid School 
Products PENN #524304  $        3.49 STANDARD 

MANUFACTURER'S)

46 3 EA

Net, tennis, high quality competition style, double 
stitching top band, weather treated heavy duty with 
center strap

BSN Sports MACGREGOR TN300V42Y, BSN page 283 77.80$      ONE YEAR

47 3 DZ
Paddle, table tennis, standard sponge rubber, 2.0mm, 
BSN item #NAR2XXXX or equal Cannon 606, Cannon Sports Table Tennis Paddle Red/Black 5-ply 

Rubber Face/Lam wood (EA) $1.92 EA 1 YR

48 25 EA

Standard aluminum tennis racquets - 10oz - 27" L Cannon

5545, Cannon Sports Aluminum
Tennis Racket 27"

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-5545-adult-
aluminum-tennis-racket-27-inch-oversized-racquets-for-men-

women-4-1-4-inch-grip?_pos=1&_sid=4c8cc42a2&_ss=r

8.26$        1 YR

TETHERBALL:

49 333 EA

Ball, official size 7 weight rubber covered rope well 15’ 
nylon braided rope, VOIT VCT850HX or equal Cannon

5615, Cannon Sports Tetherball
and Rope Set

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-5615-
tetherball-and-rope-set-for-school-playground-backyards-recess-

kids-yellow?_pos=1&_sid=269849f28&_ss=r

5.88$        1 YR

50 346 EA Ball, Mikasa Super SoftTouch Cushion or equal BSN Sports VOIT VCT850HS, BSN page 456 9.38$        ONE YEAR

51 20 EA

Ball, weather resistant, natural rubber cover w/nylon 
windings, 8’ nylon rope, blue, Gopher 71-164 or equal BSN Sports VOIT VCT850HX (Yellow), BSN page 456  8.78$        ONE YEAR

52 30 EA

Rope, tetherball, 3/16” x 50’ hank, nylon, diamond 
braid, white, Continental Western #6, 
AAMSTRAD18500 or equal

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

53 395 EA

Swivel ¾” brass covert #225-B (2265-0048) or equal Cannon

225, Cannon Sports Tetherball
Swivel Snap and Hook Eye

Bolt Clip

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-225-tetherball-
swivel-snap-hook-eye-bolt-clip?_pos=1&_sid=b6d45a410&_ss=r

0.57$        1 YR

VOLLEYBALL:

54 713 EA

Ball, official size weight #5 rubber covered waterproof, 
Western Star WSV1 or equal Cannon

61106, Cannon Sports White 
Rubber Volleyball

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-61106-white-
rubber-volleyball-for-indoor-outdoor-training-beach-play-

netball?_pos=1&_sid=a1452ab0a&_ss=r

2.53$        1 YR

55 75 EA
Ball Tachikara Soft Touch SV18S or equal in at lease 
four different colors

Pyramid School 
Products TACHIKARA #SV18S  $      16.50 STANDARD 

MANUFACTURER'S)

56 60 EA
Ball, synthetic leather, official size & weight 18 panel, 
MacGregor VL20 or equal BSN Sports MACGREGOR 1262650, BSN page 330 6.58$        ONE YEAR



57 25 EA

Ball, MacGregor Cross Court, outdoor, BSN 1282405 
or equal Cannon

61106, Cannon Sports White 
Rubber Volleyball

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-61106-white-
rubber-volleyball-for-indoor-outdoor-training-beach-play-

netball?_pos=1&_sid=a1452ab0a&_ss=r

2.53$        1 YR

58 21 EA

Nets, top grade ply or nylon, 32 x 3, white binding with 
steel cables: Good Sports 26236, MacGregor-
SNVBSC32Y or equal

Cannon

61120, Cannon Sports 
Volleyball Net 32 Feet

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-61120-
volleyball-net-indoor-outdoor-for-competition-backyard-training-

beach-play-32-ft?_pos=1&_sid=fabaca9f1&_ss=r

33.90$      1 YR

59 20 PA
Pair of portable heavyweight volleyball standards 
Alumagoal #ST240S or comparable BSN Sports ALUMAGOAL ST240S/P, BSN page 337 932.00$     ONE YEAR

60 20 PA Volleyball antenna- standard any brand BSN Sports ALUMAGOAL VBANT, BSN page 339 25.90$      ONE YEAR

61 20 EA Junior Rec Volleyball Net. 25 ft. Item SNVBRC25Y BSN Sports MACGREGOR SNVBRC25Y, BSN page 338 23.64$      ONE YEAR

BALLS MISCELLANEOUS:

62 20 PK
No Bounce Hot Balls, vinyl, rainbow colors, 6/pack, 
Shield or equal School Specialty SS# 1282655; SHIELD #830; Page #115  $      14.45 1 Year

63 25 SET
Foam, 3.5”, medium bounce, rainbow colors, 6/set, 
Gopher 71-666 or equal BSN Sports VOIT 1369509, US Games page 41 21.16$      ONE YEAR

64 23 SET
Foam, 8”, medium bounce, rainbow colors, 6/set, 
Gopher 71-668 or equal BSN Sports VOIT 1236149, BSN page 453 106.50$     ONE YEAR

65 131 EA
Playground, 6” diameter, yellow, Pro VOIT 
VPG6HNYL or equal BSN Sports VOIT VPG6HNYL, US GAMES page 44 3.00$        ONE YEAR

66 517 EA

Playground, 6” diameter, rubber, red, Western Star or 
equal Cannon

9541, Cannon Sports 6" Red
Rubber Playground Ball

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-9541-red-
rubber-playground-ball-for-4-square-dodgeball-kickball-handball-

6-inch?_pos=1&_sid=73810bf44&_ss=r

2.21$        1 YR

67 149 EA

Playground, 7”,  same as item #51 Cannon

9542, Cannon Sports 7" Red
Rubber Playground Ball

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-9542-red-
rubber-playground-ball-for-4-square-dodgeball-kickball-handball-

7-inch?_pos=1&_sid=c1e6d4c51&_ss=r

2.29$        1 YR

68 2573 EA

Playground, 8.5”, same as item #51 Cannon

9543, Cannon Sports 8.5" Red
Rubber Playground Ball

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-9543-red-
rubber-playground-ball-for-4-square-dodgeball-kickball-handball-

8-5-inch?_pos=1&_sid=3011ba565&_ss=r

2.36$        1 YR



69 559 EA

Playground, 10”, same as item #51 Cannon

9544, Cannon Sports 10" Red
Rubber Playground Ball

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-9544-red-
rubber-playground-ball-for-4-square-dodgeball-kickball-handball-

10-inch?_pos=1&_sid=b1bbb13f2&_ss=r

3.50$        1 YR

70 779 EA

Playground, 13”, same as item #51 Cannon

9545, Cannon Sports 13" Red
Rubber Playground Ball

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-9545-red-
rubber-playground-ball-for-4-square-dodgeball-kickball-handball-

13-inch?_pos=1&_sid=7cd9212a7&_ss=r

6.90$        1 YR

71 40 EA

Playground, 16”, same as item #51 Cannon

9546, Cannon Sports 16" Red
Rubber Playground Ball

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-9546-red-
rubber-playground-ball-for-4-square-dodgeball-kickball-handball-

16-inch?_pos=1&_sid=5cfd1ad44&_ss=r

8.52$        1 YR

72 150 EA

Utility 8 ½” Heavy duty 1216 high impact rubber with 
nylon winding, yellow, Western Star PG-8 ½ (UT), 
VOIT-VPG8HNYL or equal

Cannon

9503, Cannon Sports 4Square
8.5" Yellow Heavy Duty 
Rubber Playground Ball

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-9503-4-
square-playground-balls-for-kids-8-5-inch-for-kickball-handball-

dodgeball-yellow?_pos=1&_sid=b69d1b930&_ss=r

2.61$        1 YR

EQUIPMENT MISC:

73 49 EA

Bag, ball, nylon mesh, 10-12 Ball Capacity, CSI 1392, 
BSN-SNBC1XXX or equal Cannon

1414, Cannon Sports 24" x 36"
Mesh Ball & Equip Bag

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-1414-black-
mesh-ball-and-equipment-bag-24-x-36-
inches?_pos=1&_sid=01326f811&_ss=r

1.55$        1 YR

74 46 EA
Bag, equipment, 32x36, mesh, all colors identify color 
on purchase order BSN Sports BSN SNBCNET, BSN page 278 2.53$        ONE YEAR

75 50 EA

Ball Cart, Portable, Lockable, all-steel construction, 
Powder coated finish, swivel casters, lockable hinged 
cover (holds 24 official basketballs) 36”L x 24”W x 
36”H Gopher #85-098 or equal.

BSN Sports BSN 12002100, BSN page 441 173.60$     ONE YEAR

76 20 EA

Badminton Racquets, 26", aluminum head & steel 
shaft, Yonex/#1390131 (or comparable) Cannon

0200, Cannon Sports Badminton Steel Racket 26"

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-0200-
badminton-steel-racket-for-beginner-players-practice-with-grip-

26-inches?_pos=1&_sid=dedf8f915&_ss=r

3.41$        1 YR

77 30 DZ
Bean bag, 5”, nylon Cannon

1435, Cannon Sports
 Bean Bags 

6" x 6" Green/Blue (10pk)
6.42$        1 YR



78 30 EA Champion Ultimate Ball Locker, Champion/1568538 BSN Sports BSN 1162622, BSN page 137 236.80$     ONE YEAR

79 5 EA Collapsible, folding wagon to transport equipment Game One Gopher 89-558 149.00$     1 Year

80 15 EA Cone, boundary, 10”, yellow BSN Sports BSN MSCONE9XY (9"), BSN page 276 0.68$        ONE YEAR

81 200 EA Cone, boundary, 12”, orange School Specialty SS# 2122075; FLAGHOUSE #2023FH ORG; Page #Web  $        1.37 1 Year

82 16 SET
Cone, boundary, 12”, rainbow colored, set of 6 colors, 
Gopher 85-887 or equal BSN Sports US GAMES 1093452, US Games page 27 34.68$      ONE YEAR

83 105 EA Cone, boundary, 18”, heavy base, orange BSN Sports BSN 1040838, BSN page 276 7.83$        ONE YEAR
84 15 DZ Cone, boundary, disc, rainbow colored BSN Sports GAMECRAFT 1255690, BSN page 276 3.20$        ONE YEAR
85 52 EA Frisbee, tournament quality pro size BSN Sports GAMECRAFT MSDIS140Y, US GAMES page 179 2.63$        ONE YEAR
86 37 EA Frisbee, 9”, Spin Jammer or equal NO BID NO BID NO BID
87 25 PK Golf Discs - INNOVA DISC No substitute NO BID NO BID NO BID

88 105 DZ Hoop, plastic, 36” School Specialty SS# 1478081; PULL BUOY #8011D; Page #71  $      43.00 1 Year

89 108 DZ Hoop, plastic, 24” School Specialty SS# 1478079; PULL BUOY #8009D; Page #71  $      33.99 1 Year

90 32 EA

Inflator, electric, includes gauge, hose & Needle, BSN 
1539 or equal Cannon

1390, Cannon Sports Electric
Ball Inflator Pump with 

Needle and Gauge

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-1390-electric-
ball-inflator-pump-for-exercise-balls-with-needle-

gauge?_pos=1&_sid=006aa8d2e&_ss=r

54.91$      1 YR

91 72 EA

Inflator, electric, heavy duty, includes gauge, hose, 
needle & tire valve, 75” coiled cord, 1/6 HP motor, 
BSN 1240672 or equal.

Lakeshore 
Learning

Lakeshore Learning Materials, LLC / Item #WC218 /Early 
Childhood Catalog Page 19. $75.99 None

92 80 PK
Ladder toss game set with 6 soft rubber bolo balls, 
Gosports/LT-02 (or comparable)

Pyramid School 
Products CHAMPION #LGSTSET  $      36.59 STANDARD 

MANUFACTURER'S)

93 20 DZ

Lanyard, nylon braided cord with nickel plated swivel 
snap all colors, Tomark #30870, BSN-MSLNYD or 
equal Specify color on Purchase Order

Cannon

1346, Cannon Sports Black Nylon Lanyards (DZ)
(1345 White, 1348 Gold,

1349 Red, 1350 Blue)

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-1346-nylon-
lanyards-for-id-badges-whistles-referees-black-12-

pack?_pos=1&_sid=27ee5cec2&_ss=r

2.60$        1 YR

94 10 SET
Ladder toss game set with 6 soft rubber bolo balls, 
Gosports/LT-02 (or comparable) Duplicate Duplicate Duplicate Duplicate

95 6 EA
All Terrain, Open Playground Cart, 52 x 24 x 65 
Inches, Duracart #024786 School Specialty SS# 024786; DURACART #ATPGC; Page #236  $    385.00 1 Year

96 25 EA

Rope, jump, #16 sashcord, cotton, ½” 100 ft. hank, 
Continental Western #16, BSN-NSPDS010 or equal 
(Note:  previously removed will see if another supplier 
is now available)

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

97 107 EA

Rope, Olympic, 9’ Cannon

9701FT9, Cannon Sports Olympic 9' Jump Rope

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-9701ft9-9-
foot-red-white-and-blue-segmented-jump-rope-for-kids-fitness-

and-recreation?_pos=1&_sid=3c6e6dd83&_ss=r

1.43$        1 YR



98 100 EA

Rope, Olympic, 10” Cannon

9701FT10, Cannon Sports Olympic 10' Jump Rope

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-9701ft10-10-
foot-blue-and-white-segmented-jump-rope-for-kids-fitness-and-

recreation?_pos=1&_sid=e17e16eae&_ss=r

1.51$        1 YR

99 110 SET

Rope, cotton, with wood handle, 8’,
set of 6 Cannon

9533, Cannon Sports Braided 
Jump Rope with Wood Handle

(6pk)

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-9533-white-
jump-ropes-with-wooden-handles-braided-polyester-8-

feet?_pos=25&_sid=f7941e8f2&_ss=r

 $1.73 EA
Not sold as 

6pack 
1 YR

100 114 SET
Rope, Nylon, rainbow colored, 7’,
set of 6 colors BSN Sports US GAMES 1343670, US GAMES page 56 4.20$        ONE YEAR

101 120 SET Rope, Nylon, rainbow colored, 8’, set of 6 colors BSN Sports US GAMES 1343687, US GAMES page 56 4.50$        ONE YEAR

102 114 SET Rope, Nylon, rainbow colored, 9’, set of 6 colors BSN Sports US GAMES 1343694, US GAMES page 56 4.90$        ONE YEAR

103 105 EA
Stopwatch, digital, splitime , AAE CEI-420, BSN-
MSSTP260 or equal BSN Sports MARK 1 1269062, US GAMES page 275 5.08$        ONE YEAR

104 75 EA
Vest, scrimmage, all colors, heavy duty 100% nylon, 
Indicate color by product #’s ADULT SIZE BSN Sports BSN C48    (Please Specify Colors: BLACK, GOLD, KELLY, 

PURPLE, ROYAL, SCARLET), BSN page 191 1.88$        ONE YEAR

105 624 DZ

Whistle, metal with rubber tip guard, CSI 1340/1344 
or equal Cannon

13043/1344
(See Line Item 107 for Whistle

Tip Colors)

 $13.68 DZ
or

$1.14 EA 
1 YR

106 615 DZ

Whistle, metal, small, Acme Thunder 605 or equal Cannon

13043, Cannon Sports Silver
Whistle (DZ)

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-13043-silver-
whistle-with-heavy-weight-for-referees-

coaches?_pos=1&_sid=10b0af1c2&_ss=r

 $10.08 DZ 
or 

$0.84 EA 
1 YR

107 605 DZ

Whistle tip guard for item #84 Cannon

1344, Cannon Sports Rubber
Whistle Tip

(1344 White, 1403 Green, 
13359 Gold, 1404 Pink,
13025 Blue, 13346 Red, 

13348 Black, 13360 Purple)

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-1344-rubber-
whistle-tip-guard-covers-for-referee-coach-and-sports-

white?_pos=1&_sid=ebe9251c6&_ss=r

 $3.60 DZ 
or 

$0.30 EA 
1 YR

108 94 DZ

Whistle, plastic, high impact plastic body, cork ball, 
metal lanyard ring, Bake Lite #P20, BSN-3059 or 
equal

BSN Sports MACGREGOR 3059XXXXDZ, US GAMES page 272 3.60$        ONE YEAR

109 10 EA

Whistle, pealess, 2 chamber, assorted colors, Fox 40 
Pearl or Equal School Specialty

Fox 40; Page 224
Black 40P SS#1427480

Red 40P-RE SS#2019999
Blue 40P-BL SS#2019993

 $        2.20 1 Year



110 5 EA

Hockey Stick, floor, 42”, regular shaft and blade, ABS 
plastic, Shield or equal School Specialty

Shield; Page #109
Red #850RED SS#033010

Blue #850BLUE SS#033013
 $      16.60 1 Year

111 10 SET

Hockey Set, 12 sticks with 45” aluminum shaft, 2 
replacement blades, 2 hockey balls, 2 plastic pucks 
and instruction booklet, Flaghouse item #W7537 or 
equal

School Specialty SS# 2120241; FLAGHOUSE #10150-FH; Page #Web  $    105.00 1 Year

112 10 EA
Hockey Puck, Vinyl, Shield Soft, Gopher GW10-184 
or equal School Specialty SS# 2120402; FLAGHOUSE #686-FH; Page #Web  $        1.72 1 Year

113 30 DZ Hoop, plastic, 30” School Specialty SS# 2120023; FLAGHOUSE #11017-FH; Page #Web  $      41.00 1 Year

114 10 SET
Plastic Wiffle Baseballs set of 12, Champion Sports 
or comparable School Specialty SS# 1503870; CHAMPION SPORTS #PLBB; Page #94  $        6.97 1 Year

115 10 EA Traveler Disc Golf Target, Innova/030565 School Specialty SS# 030565; INNOVA-CHAMPION DISCS #DC-TRAV; Page 
#48  $    143.22 1 Year

116 20 SET

Tournament shuttlecocks set of 6 or 12, 
Macgregor/#4397 (or comparable) Cannon

0233, Cannon Sports White
Shuttlecocks (6pk)

https://cannonsports.com/products/cannon-sports-0233-white-
badminton-shuttlecocks-birdies-with-nylon-pvc-for-

competition?_pos=1&_sid=9fee9603b&_ss=r

4.68$        1 YR

117 75 SET Pickleball Paddles BSN Sports DILLER 1450226 (2 paddles & 4 balls/set)                 
US GAMES page 171 24.00$      ONE YEAR

118 75 EA Pickleballs School Specialty SS# 2121238; FLAGHOUSE #PB111-0024; Page #Web  $        2.91 1 Year

119 15 EA Paddlepro Jr Pickleball paddles. Item 56-388 BSN Sports DILLER 1450225, US GAMES page 171 12.00$      ONE YEAR

120 15 SET Pickle ball Paddle Set. Item 2121077 School Specialty SS# 2121077; FRANKLIN #52742; Page #Web  $      19.97 1 Year

121 30 EA
Junior Rugby Ball, Polyester, Size 4, 
Mikasa/#1507814 (or comparable) BSN Sports MIKASA 1303674, US Games page 208 28.00$      ONE YEAR

122 20 EA STXLacrosse Ball. Item 10-735 BSN Sports BSN  LXBO (must order in multiple of 12 each), BSN page 
241 2.00$        ONE YEAR

123 30 EA
Rugby Ball, Polyester, Size 5, Sportime/022516 (or 
comparable) School Specialty SS# 1491900; MIKASA #RNB7; Page #117  $      25.60 1 Year

124 30 EA

100ft Hank Natural White. 1/4 inch. Cotton/Polyester. 
Brand Great White. Manufacturer Seaco Industries BSN Sports 5611, Aamstrand White 1/4" x 100' Solid Braid Nylon Rope 11.23$      1 YR

125 4 EA 18" Color My Class Cones. Item 1245875 BSN Sports BSN 1245875 (6 each/set), US Games page 71 60.00$      ONE YEAR
126 10 EA Exerfit Promat 48"x24"x1/2". Item 67-826 BSN Sports US GAMES 1277159, US GAMES page 147 18.00$      ONE YEAR
127 12 EA AsessPro Curl-Up Mat. Item 67-099 BSN Sports US GAMES 1388274, US GAMES page 146 19.60$      ONE YEAR

128 168 EA

TruMat Championship Series Folding Mat. 1-3/8" 
thick. 4'x6'. Velcro on 2 ends. Item 29472-PS BSN Sports BSN 1257915  BSN page 419 133.00$     ONE YEAR

129 42 EA Mat Truck for Folding Mats. Item 29098-PS BSN Sports BSN 1246155  BSN page 420 226.60$     ONE YEAR

130 60 EA

Scrimmage Vest pack, 2 colors per package, all 
colors, 25 colors of each color for a total of 50 vests, 
polyester mesh, Child Size Indicate color by product 
#’s. BSN #1238082. 

BSN Sports BSN 1238082, US GAMES page 111 90.00$      ONE YEAR



131 5 EA

Multi-purpose equipment wagon All-steel construction 
holds up to heavy use, Pneumatic tires roll easily 
across a variety of indoor and outdoor surfaces
Folding front, rear and side panels make loading and 
unloading large items simple 1,400 lb. weight capacity 
can support field equipment or water containers for 
entire teams.  Handle on the front to pull the 
equipment wagon over smooth gym floors or uneven 
field surfaces. BSN #1291766 or equal.

BSN Sports BSN  1291766, BSN page 442 263.30$     ONE YEAR

132 10 EA

All Terrain Ball Locker. Steel tubing frame with 
powdercoat finish resists wear and tear 16 in. poly-
spoked rear wheels and 4 in. front swivel casters 
move smoothly over various terrains.  Capable of 
holding up to 15 official-size basketballs or 25 
volleyballs.  Welded wire mesh body protects 
contents while keeping them in view.  Lockable 
design keeps equipment secure (padlock not 
included). BSN #1342758 or equal. 

BSN Sports BSN 1342758, BSN page 441 283.86$     ONE YEAR

133 24 EA
Vest scrimmage, numbered 1-12, youth size all colors 
BSN # 1040289 BSN Sports BSN 1040289 (must order in multiple of 12 each)           

US GAMES page 110 2.00$        ONE YEAR
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