
VENDOR NAME ADDRESS PHONE/FAX NUMBER
CONTACT NAME                     
E-MAIL ADDRESS                    

WEBSITE
13575 Gregg Street 800-261-4456 Brian Goad

Poway, CA  92064 858-513-8266  (fax) brian@maintex.com

 www.maintex.com

530 Commerce Ave, Suite D 661-816-1144 Mark Petrosian

Palmdale, CA 93551 858-271-5079 (fax) medxdistributionsd@gmail.com

 medxdistribution@gmail.com

23303 La Palma Avenue 310-477-6591 x 404 Brian Rosenblum - brianr@galesupply.com

Yorba Linda, CA  92887 310-207-1991 (fax) brianr@galesupply.com
 

2202 Verus Street 800-400-3060 Karen Durazo

San Diego, CA  92154 619-237-4371 (fax)

 

6510 North 54th Street 800-792-2644 Kenneth Miller

Tampa, FL  33610 813-621-6446 biddept@pyramidsp.com

813-621-7688 (fax)

3790 De Forest Circle 800-227-7159 Aja Stickler

Jurupa Valley, CA  91752 909-980-7159 (fax)

 

17625 Fabrica Way 888-901-5011 Michael Marriott

Cerritos, CA  90703 714-908-2228 (fax) marriott@casupplysolutions.com
 

PO Box 332 888-808-5120 Brian Marcus

West Long Beach, NJ 07764 718-677-9371 (fax) customercare@unipakcorp.net

9353 Waxie Way 800-544-8054 Lee Jackson or Casey Munoz

San Diego, CA  92123-3506 858-292-8111 ljackson@waxie.com

858-707-0409  fax cmunoz@waxie.com

UniPak, Corp.

Waxie Sanitary Supply

CONTRACT PERIOD:  January 1, 2024- December 31, 2024

Maintex, Inc.

Med-X Surgical Distribution

Office Solutions Business Products            
& Services, LLC.                            

(dba Gale Supply)

Imperiial Valley Distributing
(dba Padre USA or Padre Janitorial Supplies) karen@padrejanitorial.com

Email: nichol.vann@oside.us

Pyramid School Products                     
(Please reference on PO: NCEPC Bid 2024-01-065B             

Southwest School Supply, Inc.
biddesk@southwestschool.com

Signal Hill Enterprises, Inc                    
(dba Supply Solutions)

NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM
AWARDED VENDOR LIST

BID TITLE:  NCEPC CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES SPONSORING DISTRICT: Oceanside Unified School District

BID NUMBER:  2024-01-065B
DISTRICT CONTACT: Nichol Vann - Buyer                                                  
Phone: (760) 966-4026   



BID TITLE: CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES SPONSORING DISTRICT: OCEANSIDE UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT MINIMUM FREE SHIPPING $100.00

DISTRICT CONTACT: NICHOL VANN LIQUIDATED DAMAGES: 2.5% PER DAY

PH: (760) 966-4026 | EMAIL: nichol.vann@oside.us DELIVERY: 10 WORKING DAYS A.R.O.

Bid Item 
No. Est. Usage Unit of Issue Item Specification/Description Vendor and Manufacturer 

Item Number
 Cost Per 

Unit 
Potential Award

Vendor Name

1 5 Each
Bag, Vacuum, Shake Out Cloth for the Sanitare Upright SC886E or 

approved equal
574125 - Green Klean  $         15.91 Waxie

2 5 Each
Bag, Vacuum, for Backpack Vacuum, Sandia Plastics HEPA 10-Quart Raven 

Backpack Vacuum cloth bag, Maintex #SP10-0007 or approved equal

3 5 Pack Bag, Vacuum, Model M, Paper Filter, 3 bags/pack - Mfg #1098861, JANITIZED 
NSS PIG-2(3) or approved equal

2723634/ GK1PIGP  $         11.50 Southwest

4 100 Pack
Bag, Vacuum, Pro Team Super Coach Pro 10, Intercept Micro Filter Bag, 10 

qt. capacity, 10 bags/pack, PROTEAM # 107313 or approved equal

JANITIZED APC3100
10/PACK

 $           9.72 Padre USA

5 30 Pack
Bag, Vacuum, Pro Team Super Coach Pro 6 Backpack, Intercept Micro Filter 

Bag, 6 qt. capacity, 10 bags/pack, PROTEAM # 107314 or approved equal

JANITIZED APC3087
10/PACK

 $          8.60 Padre USA

6 500 Pack
Bag, Vacuum, Pro Team Mega Vac 10 Qt. Vacuum Filter. Fits Maintex 10 
Quart Backpack Vacuum. 10 bags/pack. VFX-PT100331-2(10) or approved 

equal

JANITIZED APC1694
10/PACK

 $          9.25 Padre USA

7 5 Pack
Bag, Vacuum Micro-Lined Paper Filter Bag, for Hipster vacuum, 6-Quart, 

Sandia Plastic, Genuine, 10 per Pack Mfg. Item# 10-0197, or approved equal
JANITIZED APC1717

10/PACK
 $          8.25 Padre USA

8 5 Pack
Bag, VACUUM BAG FOR TENNANT V5 - PACK, Tennant Filter Bags for V5 

Vacuum 10/Pk (#1067460) or approved equal

9 5 Pack
Bag, VACUUM BAG FOR TENNANT V6 - 12/PACK, Item # TEN9009784, 

TENNANT COMPANY or approved equal
589009784 - Tennant  $       28.56 Waxie

10
Bonnet Pads, Launderable, absorbent, blended-yarn pad with looped-end 
construction for bonnet or spin-cleaning carpets with rotary machines. 6 

bonnets/case.
10a 15 Each Bonnet, 17" Spin Bonnet Pads, Waxie 651317 or approved equal. 651317 - Golden Star  $        16.62 Waxie
10b 20 Each Bonnet, 20" Spin Bonnet Pads, Waxie 651320 or approved equal. 651320 - Golden Star  $        18.78 Waxie
11 600 Each Bottle, 32 oz, Continental #932B or approved equal 890050 - Impact  $          0.64 Waxie

12 3,500 Each
Bottle, spray trigger. Trigger to fit bottles described in item #16. One hand 
operation, pistol grip, chemical resistant, leak and drip proof, Continental 

922H/922HL/902RW9 or approved equal
890040 - Impact  $          0.65 Waxie

13 150 Each
Bowl Mop, Little Dipper, Impact 204W, WILEN #WJ510000 or approved 

equal
IMPACT 204 

BOWL MOP WHITE
 $          0.98 Padre USA

NCEPC CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID

NO BID

NO BID

BID NUMBER: 2024-01-065B
CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/1/24 - 12/31/24
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BID TITLE: CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES SPONSORING DISTRICT: OCEANSIDE UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT MINIMUM FREE SHIPPING $100.00

DISTRICT CONTACT: NICHOL VANN LIQUIDATED DAMAGES: 2.5% PER DAY

PH: (760) 966-4026 | EMAIL: nichol.vann@oside.us DELIVERY: 10 WORKING DAYS A.R.O.

Bid Item 
No. Est. Usage Unit of Issue Item Specification/Description Vendor and Manufacturer 

Item Number
 Cost Per 

Unit 
Potential Award

Vendor Name

NCEPC CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID

BID NUMBER: 2024-01-065B
CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/1/24 - 12/31/24

14 10 Each

Broom, Handle, 5' Metal Tip Wood Broom Handle, 60” long, hardwood, 

straight-grained, smooth sanded, lacquered finish, threaded metal tip, 
GOLDEN STAR #262938, Southwest 83391 or approved equal

GOLDENSTAR 262938  $          4.79 Maintex

15 5 Each
Broom, Angle, Flagged Washable Fiber Bristles for Fine Particle and Debris, 

54-55" Wood Handle, Waxie # 2051291 ​ or approved equal ABCO BR1024WH  $          5.98 Pyramid

16 5 Each
Broom, Janitor, top quality, corn broom, 6 sewn, with metal cap or wire 

binding, lacquer finish, natural wood handle, ACS #B412, Premier 60201 or 
approved equal

ACS B412  $           7.31 Pyramid

17 100 Each
Broom, Lobby, Plastic Blue, Premier Mop & Broom Co. 60406, ACS 

#B440BP, Premier 60409 or approved equal
ACS B440BP  $          3.99 Pyramid

18 70 Each
Broom, Parlor, Corn Fiber Blend, 5 sewn, Smoothly finished wood handle, 

ACS #B410, Premier 60001 or approved equal
ACS B410  $          6.29 Pyramid

19 10 Each

Broom, Push, 24” width for coarse sweeping, stiff durene plastic bristles 
designed for rough surfaces; 3-1/2” trim, 2 threaded handle holes set in 

hardwood block (WITHOUT HANDLE), ACS-B6024, CARLISLE #4520201 or 
approved equal

ACS B62024  $        10.89 Pyramid

20 18 Each

Broom, Push, 24” width for fine sweeping, polypropylene bristles, 3” trim set 

in hardwood block (WITHOUT HANDLE), WILEN F002024 or approved 
equal

BWK20424  $        12.95 Southwest

21 28 Each
Brush, Counter, Black Tampico Fiber, 8” plastic, 2-3/8” fine bristles, ABCO 

#00101, ACS #B7708 or approved equal
ACS B7708  $          4.00 Pyramid

22 60 Each

Brush, Toilet Bowl, Plastic Bristles Twisted in nylon or vinyl covered wire, will 
not mark or scratch toilet bowl; not affected by standard toilet bowl 

cleaners, set in clear lacquered block with hang-up hole, 20” overall length. 

Individually wrapped, CONTINENTAL #J507017, CARLISLE 361013600 or 
approved equal

BWK6217  $           2.79 Southwest

23 15 Each Brush, Utility, Palmyra 8". Waxie 060190 or approved equal 2060400 - Carlisle  $           2.79 Southwest
24 5 Each Brush, Utility, Palmyra 20". Waxie 060191 or approved equal BWK4120  $          3.74 Southwest

25 40 Each
Bucket, Plastic, Heavy Duty, 10-quart capacity, resists acids, alkaline, paints, 

chemicals, and cleaning solutions with pour spout and handle, 
RUBBERMAID 2963, Delamo 8010RED or approved equal

8010-RED 
10-QT UTILITY PAIL RED

 $          4.80 Padre USA
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BID TITLE: CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES SPONSORING DISTRICT: OCEANSIDE UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT MINIMUM FREE SHIPPING $100.00

DISTRICT CONTACT: NICHOL VANN LIQUIDATED DAMAGES: 2.5% PER DAY

PH: (760) 966-4026 | EMAIL: nichol.vann@oside.us DELIVERY: 10 WORKING DAYS A.R.O.

Bid Item 
No. Est. Usage Unit of Issue Item Specification/Description Vendor and Manufacturer 

Item Number
 Cost Per 

Unit 
Potential Award

Vendor Name

NCEPC CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID

BID NUMBER: 2024-01-065B
CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/1/24 - 12/31/24

26 40 Each
Cart, Janitor, Compact, Plastic, can accommodate 26 or 35 quart bucket or a 

32 gallon trash can. Rubbermaid or Continental or approved equal
500549 - Rubbermaid  $     137.00 Waxie

27 1,200 Each
Cloths, Microfiber, Lint-Free and Non-Abrasive, 12" x 12" approx size. 

Suitable for cleaning Flat Screen Monitors, Electronic Screens, etc., WPC 
#915111 or approved equal

WIPER CENTRAL 
M915112

 $          0.32 Padre USA

28 10 Dozen
Cloths, Microfiber - Blue 16" x 16", Maintex Mfg. Item# W915101B, or 

approved equal
WIPER CENTRAL 

M915101B
 $          0.48 Padre USA

29 60 Box
Doggie Waste Bags, Dark green, coreless, 8"x12.5", 19 microns, .75 mil 

thickness, 200 bags per box
701600 - Sold by Case - 

Zero Waste
 $       39.56 Waxie

30 60 Each
Duster, Feather, 23" length, Genuine Ostrich feathers for dusting in 

industrial or commercial applications, IMPACT #262315, Lambskin D23SEC 
or approved equal

LAMBSKIN D23SEC  $          6.78 Pyramid

31 80 Each Duster, Round Wall Duster Brush Head. Waxie 180105 approved equal BETTER BRUSH 500108  $          4.69 Padre USA

32 55 Each
Duster, Handle, 34"-59" Extendable, Must fit Duster head above. Waxie 

180115 or approved equal
BETTER BRUSH 330259  $          3.65 Padre USA

33 10 Each Duster, 30"-59" Extendable Handle, Lambswool or approved equal 24418467/CW56799  $          4.55 Southwest

34 90 Each
Dustpan, Janitor, Heavy-Duty 20 gauge steel; one piece beveled edges, 12” 

opening, black, Continental#715, IMPACT #263515 or approved equal
812879/4212  $          4.25 Southwest

35 85 Each
Dustpan, Stand Up with Large Scoop, BIG MOUTH DUSTPAN AMCHEM 

2734-05, Delamo 8497 or approved equal
8497 - RED JUMBO 

DEBRIS LOBBY PAN RED
 $        13.70 Padre USA

36 10 Each
Dustpan, Lobby, PVC Handle Plastic, "L" Grip, LobbyMaster, Mfg. Item# 

912BK-12 or approved equal

37 220 Each
Easy Reacher, 32", Ergonomic Handle with safety locking feature, Heavy-

Duty, Mfg Arcoa #32-S, EASY REACHER #32, Arc 15202 or approved equal
24538739/15202  $          7.35 Southwest

38 80 Each

Electrical Cord, 50’ Heavy Duty, minimum 14 gauge wire with 3 wire 

grounded plug, MAINTEX #262614, CENTURY WIRE 580100 or approved 
equal

SOUTHWIRE 0626  $        24.26 Pyramid

NO BID
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BID TITLE: CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES SPONSORING DISTRICT: OCEANSIDE UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT MINIMUM FREE SHIPPING $100.00

DISTRICT CONTACT: NICHOL VANN LIQUIDATED DAMAGES: 2.5% PER DAY

PH: (760) 966-4026 | EMAIL: nichol.vann@oside.us DELIVERY: 10 WORKING DAYS A.R.O.
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 Cost Per 

Unit 
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Vendor Name

NCEPC CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID

BID NUMBER: 2024-01-065B
CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/1/24 - 12/31/24

39

Gloves, Nitrile Disposable, 5 mil, Powder Free, rolled cuff, ambidextrous, 
highly chemical and puncture resistant, textured grip and dexterity and 

must be FDA compliant. Applications: food preparation, light-duty cleaning, 
painting, manufacturing and parts assembly: any non-medical application. 

Blue, 100/box, 10 boxes/case
39a 150 Box Gloves, Small LIFEGUARD 6392  $          2.69 Gale Supply

39b 500 Box Gloves, Medium, MAINTEX #212834, CAMEO #6393 or approved equal LIFEGUARD 6393  $          2.69 Gale Supply

39c 450 Box Gloves, Large, MAINTEX #212835, CAMEO #6394 or approved equal LIFEGUARD 6394  $          2.69 Gale Supply

39d 150 Box Gloves, Extra Large, MAINTEX #212836, CAMEO #6395 or approved equal LIFEGUARD 6395  $          2.69 Gale Supply

40
Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable, Powder Free, Non-Latex, 5 mil thickness 

minimum,100/box, 10 boxes/case

40a 100 Box Gloves, Small, SANITEX #2392 or approved equal
SANITEX 2390

SMALL
 $           1.74 Med-X

40b 500 Box
Gloves, Medium, SAFETY ZONE #2630401, SANITEX #2393 or approved 

equal
SANITEX 2390

MEDIUM
 $           1.74 Med-X

40c 450 Box
Gloves, Large, SAFETY ZONE #2630402, SANITEX #2394 or approved 

equal
SANITEX 2390

LARGE
 $           1.74 Med-X

40d 800 Box
Gloves, Extra Large, SAFETY ZONE #26301180, SANITEX #2395 or 

approved equal
SANITEX 2390

X-LARGE
 $           1.74 Med-X

41 5 Each
Handle, 71" Pole, Telescopic Aluminum, Monarch, Mfg. Item# W700071-

1EA, or approved equal
MONARCH W700071-EA  $          4.89 Pyramid

42 190 Each
KEY-BAK key ring, 15 keys or 8-10 oz. 2" diameter, belt clip attachment, 

stainless steel chain, WESTCOAST 0005-011, Keybak #5 or approved equal
630010 - West Coast 

Corp
 $         11.66 Waxie

43 20 Each Knives, Putty, 1.5" Stiff, Mfg. Item# 3316, or approved equal GNS15PKS  $          3.20 Southwest

44 5 Box
Mask, Dust, disposable dust and mist respirator, 20 per box, 12 Boxes per 

Case, Pro-Guard Mfg. Item# 7312B or approved equal
504336/8210  $        13.53 Southwest

45 40 Each
Mop Bucket/Wringer Combo, 35 Qt bucket with sidepress wringer , 

RUBBERMAID 758088 or approved equal
660252 - Rubbermaid  $       83.50 Waxie

46 Mop, Dust, Metal Frame
46a 5 Each Mop, Dust, Metal Frame, 5"x24", Waxie 650822 or approved equal 24418785/CW56764  $          2.49 Southwest
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BID TITLE: CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES SPONSORING DISTRICT: OCEANSIDE UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT MINIMUM FREE SHIPPING $100.00

DISTRICT CONTACT: NICHOL VANN LIQUIDATED DAMAGES: 2.5% PER DAY

PH: (760) 966-4026 | EMAIL: nichol.vann@oside.us DELIVERY: 10 WORKING DAYS A.R.O.
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No. Est. Usage Unit of Issue Item Specification/Description Vendor and Manufacturer 

Item Number
 Cost Per 

Unit 
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Vendor Name

NCEPC CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID

BID NUMBER: 2024-01-065B
CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/1/24 - 12/31/24

46b 5 Each Mop, Dust, Metal Frame, 5"x36", Waxie 650832 or approved equal 24418774/CW56765  $          2.96 Southwest
46c 5 Each Mop, Dust, Metal Frame, 5"x48", Waxie 650842 or approved equal 24418786/CW56766  $           4.12 Southwest
46d 5 Each Mop, Dust, Metal Frame, 5"x60" 24418783/CW56767  $           5.10 Southwest

47 15 Each
Mop, Dust, 60" Handle, Snap on dust mop handle for easy attachment and 

removal from frames. Allows for rigid or 360 degree rotation, 
CONTINENTAL #C801060, Premier 53306 or approved equal

24418776/CW56769  $          6.47 Southwest

48 145 Each
Mop, Handle, 60” Fiberglass, Quick Change, Waxie 650691, PREMIER 

#40108, Premier 40208 or approved equal
24418780/CW61063  $          8.35 Southwest

49 60 Each

Mop head Cotton Blended Yarn Dust Mop - 5" x 24", White; Launderable 
cotton/synthetic blend with polyester backing provides superior 

performance and durability. Yarn will not fray or unravel even with intensive 
laundering. Snap closures, CAMEO ED02024N or approved equal

SUPPLY SOLUTIONS 
ED02024N

 $          5.50 Supply Solution

50 20 Each

Mop head Cotton Blended Yarn Dust Mop - 5" x 36", White; Launderable 
cotton/synthetic blend with polyester backing provides superior 

performance and durability. Yarn will not fray or unravel even with intensive 
laundering. Snap closures, CAMEO ED02036N or approved equal

SUPPLY SOLUTIONS 
ED02036N

 $          7.00 Supply Solution

51 5 Each

Mop head Cotton Blended Yarn Dust Mop - 5" x 48", White; Launderable 
cotton/synthetic blend with polyester backing provides superior 

performance and durability. Yarn will not fray or unravel even with intensive 
laundering. Snap closures. ACS-M9148, BETTER BRUSH #170248 or 

approved equal

24418762/CW56755  $          8.30 Southwest

52 35 Each

Mop head Cotton Blended Yarn Dust Mop - 5" x 60", White; Launderable 
cotton/synthetic blend with polyester backing provides superior 

performance and durability. Yarn will not fray or unravel even with intensive 
laundering. Snap closures.

24418784/CW56756  $          9.29 Southwest

53 55 Each
Mop Head, Super Loop-Ended Construction, Blended White Yarn, 4-ply, 

High Quality, 5" Headband, Extra absorbent and durable, Medium size, 24-
oz. Waxie 650281, GOLDEN STAR AST34L5 or approved equal

ABCO LM202BLW  $          5.99 Pyramid
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NCEPC CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID

BID NUMBER: 2024-01-065B
CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/1/24 - 12/31/24

54 80 Each
Mop Head, Lint Free, High Tech Filament Yarn Glides, 24-oz Large, 1" 

headband, looped ends and tailband, GOLDEN STAR #2175411, Premier 
13503 or approved equal

SUPPLY SOLUTIONS 
EL12C3L

 $          6.50 Supply Solution

55 1,100 Each
Mop, Head, Waxie Blue Wonder, 4-ply cotton/rayon/polyester blend yarn. 

Tailbanded, Large, 5" headband. Waxie #650350, GOLDEN STAR 
AST34BL5 or approved equal

24420791/CW57755  $          6.75 Southwest

56 5 Each
Mop, Frame, Microfiber, 18", Lockable Flat Mop Frame for 18" mops, Frame 

length is 16", Maintex, Mfg. Item# W700018-1EA or approved equal
M700018 WIPER 

CENTRAL
 $          5.46 Padre USA

57 5 Case
Mop, X-Large Comet Blend Wet, 5" Headband, 4 ply blended 

cotton/rayon/polyester, 12 per Case, Golden Star Mfg. Item# AST34XL5 or 
approved equal

ABCO CLM303XLWB  $       83.04 Pyramid

58 5 Case
Mop Pad, Wet, Micro Fiber, 24", Blue, 12/case, Maintex, Mfg. Item# 

W830024B-1EA or approved equal
A&A 228711  $       34.50 Maintex

59 5 Each
Mop Pad, Replacment Wedge 5" X 10" Blue Washable #2650510 for 3M 

Scotchguard Applicator Kit or approved equal
SUPPLY SOLUTIONS 

EDM06011B
 $          3.40 Supply Solution

60 140 Each
Mop, Toilet Bowl, Full 4 1/2" absorbent mop head, acid-resistant 

polypropylene strands, 12" strong plastic handle, WILEN #WJ510000, 
Southwest 85101 or approved equal

ABCO 02000  $          0.73 Pyramid

61 5 Each

Mop Wringer, Down Press, Duramold construction body, high structural 
foam handle and linkage. All totally corrosion-resistant to virtually all 

cleaners, chemicals, germicides, waxes, disinfectants, and water. Fits 12-32 
oz mop heads. Fits 26, 35 and 44 quart buckets. Continental SW7, Delamo 

8026/35/44 DP WRG or approved equal

8026/35/44 DP WRG 
26/35/44-QT DP 
WRINGER ONLY

 $       52.46 Padre USA

62 Pads, Floor Machine

62a 60 Case
Pads, Floor Machine, 13" White Polish Pads, 5/case, 3M 4100 or approved 

equal
BWK4013WHI  $          6.92 Southwest

62b 50 Case
Pads, Floor Machine, 17" Black Strip Pads, 5/case, AMERICO 400117, ACS 

72-17 or approved equal
655459/CW22978  $          9.89 Southwest

62c 10 Case
Pads, Floor Machine, 17” Brown Strip Pads, 5/case, 3M 7100 or approved 

equal
ACS 71-17  $          9.98 Gale Supply

62d 20 Case
Pads, Floor Machine, 17” Red Buffer Pads, 5/case, 3M 5100 or approved 

equal
663604/CW22985  $          9.89 Southwest
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NCEPC CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID

BID NUMBER: 2024-01-065B
CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/1/24 - 12/31/24

62e 35 Case
Pads, Floor Machine, 17" White Polish Pads, 5/case, MAINTEX 2253170, 

ACS 41-17 or approved equal
663606/CW22987  $          9.89 Southwest

62f 1,500 Case
Pads, Floor Machine, 20" Black Strip Pads, 5/case, AMERICO 400120, ACS 

72-20 or approved equal
ACS 72-20  $        12.56 Gale Supply

62g 15 Case
Pads, Floor Machine, 20” Brown Strip Pads, 5/case, 3M 7100 or approved 

equal
ACS 71-20  $        12.59 Gale Supply

62h 350 Case
Pads, Floor Machine, 20" Red Strip Pads, 5/case, MAINTEX 2252200, ACS 

51-20 or approved equal
ACS 51-20  $        12.59 Gale Supply

62i 900 Case
Pads, Floor Machine, 20" White Polish Pads, 5/case, 3M 4100 or approved 

equal
ACS 41-20  $        12.59 Gale Supply

63 40 Each
Plunger, Toilet/Drain, Industrial/Professional designed for toilets and drains. 

20" wood handle, Waxie 030931 or approved equal
SUPPLY SOLUTIONS 

474012
 $          5.50 Supply Solution

64 980 Case

Rag, Premium quality WHITE ONLY cotton terry cleaning towel - pure 
absorbent, durable & rewashable, 16" X 19", 25 lb. case (approximately 170 

rags/case) Cameo #83225, Waxie #770095, PMC L75425 or approved 
equal

WIPER CENTRAL 
FNWTTD25N

 $       49.75 Gale Supply

65 25 Each
Sanitary Napkin Disposal Can, Wall Mount, All Plastic, White, with rigid 

removable plastic insert for ease in cleaning. 11.5"wX10"hX5.5"d. Waxie 
820710, HOSPECO 6140WP, ROCHESTER #25125200 or approved equal

SUPPLY SOLUTIONS 
4760

 $        15.50 Supply Solution

66 190 Case
Sanitary Napking Disposal Liners, Waxed Paper Liners, 9"W x 10"H with a 

3.25" gusset. 250 bags/case, Waxie 820715 or approved equal
820715 - Hospeco  $        14.75 Waxie

67 105 Case
Sanitary napkins,#4 type, beltless, designed for use in vending equipment, 
individually boxed, box size 3" W X 4.25" H X 1" D, 250/case, Rochester #4, 

Hospital Specialty #147, HOSPECO MT-4 #820020 or approved equal
539189/MT4  $        39.15 Southwest

68 100 Case
Sanitary tampons individually packaged in cardboard containers for use in 

Tampax or dual vending equipment. 500 per case/Hospital Specialty T-500 
or approved equal

539213/T500  $        71.95 Southwest

69 Scraper, Heavy Duty, 4" wide stainless steel blade

69a 20 Each
Scraper, Heavy Duty, 4" wide stainless steel blade, 6" Handle. Waxie 

290830 or approved equal
ABCO SCP7M601  $          7.99 Pyramid
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69b 95 Each
Scraper, Heavy Duty, 4" wide stainless steel blade, 48" Handle. Waxie 

290750 or approved equal
ABCO CT08010  $        10.99 Pyramid

70 25 Pack
Scraper, Blades, Replacement, Compatible with above item. Waxie 290842 

or approved equal
BETTER BRUSH 301204 

(PACK OF 10)
 $          4.99 Pyramid

71 20 Case
Scouring Pad, Heavy Duty, coarse pad for scouring, 6”x 9” dark green, 

60/case. AMERICO #226986, ACS S86 or approved equal
350484 - 3M  $          5.93 Waxie

72 75 Each
Sign, Floor, Caution Wet Floor, Yellow, approx 25" high, 2 sided easel style 
for easy storage, Imprinted on both sides in English, French, German, and 

Spanish. RUBBERMAID 611200 or approved equal
ABCO WS0001  $           7.29 Pyramid

73 880 Case
Soap, Foam, Lightly perfumed, 1000 ml/refill, 6 refills/case. Deb Stoko 

Refresh Azure FOAM AZU1L or approved equal. Must be able to provide 
free manual dispensers during the year, as required by the ordering district.

24452667/1122900  $       35.45 Southwest

74 1,100 Case
Soap, Foam, Pink, 2000 ml/refill, 2 refills/case. Gojo 5261-02 or approved 

equal. Must fit Gojo FMX-20 Manual Dispenser.
388600 - GOJO  $       39.03 Waxie

75 85 Case
Soap, Foam, Hand, Peach Luster, 4 One Gallon per Case, Maintex, Mfg. 

Item# 1817 or approved equal
SUPPLY SOLUTIONS 

049060401G
 $       24.00 Supply Solution

76 110 Case
Soap, Foaming, Hand, 4 Gallon/Case, Just Right, Mfg. Item# 1846 or 

approved equal
SUPPLY SOLUTIONS 

049060401G
 $       24.00 Supply Solution

77 110 Each
Sponge, Hydra W4PK Cellulose Sponge, 48/case, ACS 665 or approved 

equal
350020 - ACS  $          0.45 Waxie

78 160 Box
Sponge Scrubbing, Medium Duty, Cellulose sponge bonded to green 
synthetic pad, approximately 3-1/2” x 6-1/4”, Hydra #70CHD 10/box, 

MAINTEX #2268740, 5/box, CAMEO #74B 5/box or approved equal

ACS SC200 
(BOX OF 5)

 $           3.27 Pyramid

79 2,400 Each
Sponge Scrubbing, Light Duty, cellulose sponge bonded to white synthetic 

pad, approx. 3-3/4" x 6-3/4". Maintex #226960 or approved equal
350464 - 3M  $          0.66 Waxie

80 Squeegee, Window, Brass
80a 5 Each 6" Brass Window Squeegee. Waxie 290010 or approved equal 290010 - Ettore  $          3.83 Waxie
80b 5 Each 10" Brass Window Squeegee. Waxie 290030 or approved equal 290030 - Ettore  $          5.23 Waxie

80c 5 Each
12" Brass Window Squeegee. Waxie 290040, ETTORE 1131 or approved 

equal
290040 - Ettore  $          5.84 Waxie
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80d 5 Each 18" Brass Window Squeegee. Waxie 290070 or approved equal

ETTORE, MASTER 
BRASS CLIPPED 
CHANNEL WITH 

RUBBER 1144

 $          7.30 Padre USA

81 10 Each Squeegee, Brass Handle. Waxie 290120 or approved equal 290120 - Ettore  $          5.76 Waxie

82 5 Each
Squeegee, 12" Brass Window Squeegee Handle and Channel and Rubber 

Complete. CONTINENTAL #2512-22 or approved equal

ETTORE, MASTER 
BRASS SQUEEGEE 
COMPLETE, 1013

 $        13.69 Padre USA

83 40 Each
Squeegee, Floor, 22", Wipe & Dry, Galvanized steel. Waxie 297010 or 

approved equal
297010 - Ettore  $          6.39 Waxie

84 100 Roll
Tape, Caution, Barrier, 3” wide x 1000’ long, yellow with black letters, 

durable polyethylene, disposable. SEAL #CT300 or approved equal
CORDOVA T15101  $          5.73 Pyramid

85 1,100 Roll
Tape, Duct, Silver, 2" x 60yds, Mfg #MMM390, SHU #PC590, Southwest 

260245 or approved equal
SHURTAPE 1510015  $          3.89 Pyramid

86 17,250 Case

Tissue, Facial, White, Fully Bleached, High Quality, Two-Ply Soft, approx. size 
7.65” x 8.85”, 100 sheets per box, 30 boxes per case. Color indicator sheets 

signal the need for refilling. GEORGIA PACIFIC 48580 Angel Soft, KIMBERLY CLARK 
SC-21340 or approved equal

ROYALTY RP-FT30100V  $        12.95 Gale Supply

87 120 Case
Tissue, Facial, White, 2-ply, approx 8" x 9", 100 sheets/box, 30 box/case, 

Softeen by Princess Paper, Inc. Mfg #FT30/100, CAMEO #4800 or 
approved equal

MAINTEX 340200  $        17.65 Maintex

88 4,100 Case

Toilet Seat Cover, Half Folded, Fits standard toilet seat cover dispenser 
completely water soluble, biodegradable, machine glazed white tissue, 250 

covers per package, 20 packages per case, Hospital Specialty 851530, 
LIFEGUARD #4590 or approved equal

LIFEGUARD 4590  $        23.10 Gale Supply

89 5 Case
Toilet Tissue, 2-Ply, Coreless JRT Jr, 8.9" diameter, 3.75" wide, 1150’/roll, 12 

rolls/case, SCOTT 07006 or approved equal
SUPPLY SOLUTIONS 

REP-CJRT1150
 $       35.25 Supply Solution

90 1,050 Case

Toilet Tissue, Single Ply, Sr JRT Jumbo, 12" diameter, 3.5” wide, 4,000'/roll, 6 

rolls/case. Acclaim Rollsaver SR JRT #13105, Waxie #851090, CAMEO 
#SRT4000 or approved equal

ROYALTY RE-SRT40001  $        27.95 Gale Supply

91 95 Case
Toilet Tissue, 2-Ply, Truly Green, Jumbo Jr. 9" diameter, 1000 ft/roll, 12 

rolls/case, 100% recycled content. Green Seal Certified. Maintex # 3201200 
or approved equal

MOREX JRT1210002L  $        22.10 Gale Supply
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92 95 Case
Toilet Tissue, 2-Ply, Allied West US Series 4056, 9” Jumbo Jr. Roll, 12/1000 

(US04056) or approved equal
GEN1516  $        23.47 Southwest

93 210 Case Toilet Tissue, 2-Ply, White. CAMEO #4800 or approved equal. MOREX TP500V  $        34.10 Gale Supply

94 75 Case
Toilet Tissue, 2 Ply, Facial Quality, Individually Wrapped, 4" X 4.5" Sheet 

Size, 770 Sheets/Roll, 48 Rolls/Cs; MUST FIT ROLLMASTER DISPENSER, 
Rollmaster # 19027 or approved equal

SUPPLY SOLUTIONS RP-
SC75048

 $        36.00 Supply Solution

95 900 Case
Toilet Tissue, 2-Ply, Compact Coreless, High Capacity Rolls, 3.85" x 4.05" 

sheet size, 1,500 sheet/roll, 18 rolls/case, Georgia Pacific #19378 or 
approved equal

80590 OPTIMA ALLIED 
WEST

 $        28.82 Padre USA

96 540 Case

Toilet Tissue, 2-ply, Facial Quality, approx. size 4.09” x 4.0”, 506 sheets/roll, 

60 rolls/case. 3,074 sq ft per case. Kleenex Cottonelle 17713, CAMEO 
#LUC4560 or approved equal

ALLIED WEST 80560  $       30.90 Gale Supply

97 75 Case
Toilet Tissue, 2 ply white 9 in diameter tissue jumbo, 1000 sheets (12 

rolls/case), ANP #922JT30-BID, CAMEO LAVENDER #4610 or approved 
equal

SUPPLY SOLUTIONS RP-
JT10002V

 $       23.50 Supply Solution

98 150 Case
Toilet Tissue, 2 ply, Compact Coreless, high capacity rolls, 3.85" x 4.05" 

sheet size, 1000 sheet/roll 36 rolls per case, 850955 GEORGIA PACIFIC or 
approved equal

ROYALTY RP-SC10002V  $        31.95 Gale Supply

99 5 Case
Toilet Tissue, 2 Ply Bathroom Tissue, 4.2in x 3.54in sheet, size, 500 sheets 
per roll, 96 rolls/case, Truly Green, Mfg. Item# PH15096 or approved equal

3135 PADRE USA  $       38.50 Padre USA

100 130 Case
Toilet Tissue, Embossed White, 2 ply, 4.5"x4.0" sheet size. 550 sheets/rl, 

44,000 sheets/cs., 80 rls/cs, WAXIE TOILET PAPER ITEM # 851178 CLEAN 
AND SOFT or approved equal

MOREX TP805502V - 
380510

 $        41.75 Maintex

101 1,300 Case

Towel, Paper, Multi-fold, White, 9.2" x 9.4" sheet size, 250 sheets/package, 
16 packages/case, Soft, durable white multifold towel with absorbency 

pockets. Made with 60% recycled fiber and meets EPA standards with 40% 
post consumer waste. Scott/Kimberly Clark #01804, GOLDEN GATE 

#320425, CAMEO #4700 or approved equal

MOREX MFT162501  $        17.99 Gale Supply

102 5 Case

Towel, Paper, White, High Capacity, 1.75” core, 950 ft/roll, 6 rolls/case , 

meets EPA standards, FSC Certified, made out of 40% post consumer 
waste, Scott 02000 or approved equal

MOREX HWT610001  $       32.38 Maintex
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103 180 Case
Towel, Paper, Single-fold, Brown, 10.25" x 9.25 sheet size, 250 

sheets/package, 16 packages/case, GEORGIA PACIFIC ENVISION 23504, 
MOREX SFT123341K, Southwest 87210 or approved equal

SUPPLY SOLUTIONS RE-
SFT-K

 $        17.99 Supply Solution

104 40 Case
Towel, Paper, Brown, MAX2000, 700lf/roll, 6 rolls/case - 82165 MAX Must 

fit in towelmaster MAX 2000 dispenser - Waxie 850568, GEORGIA 
PACIFIC 82165 or approved equal

GEN1825  $       23.40 Southwest

105 5 Case
Towel, Paper, White, MAX2000, 700lf/roll, 6 rolls/case - 82765 MAX Must 

fit in towelmaster MAX 2000 dispenser - Waxie 850566, GEORGIA 
PACIFIC 82765 or approved equal

GEN1820  $        28.26 Southwest

106 1,100 Case
Towel, Paper, Natural, Universal, 1.8" core, 800 ft/roll, 6 Rolls/case, Maintex 

#SCA-RK800E, Southwest 87372 or approved equal
MOREX HWT68001K  $       20.49 Gale Supply

107 1,800 Case
Towel, Paper, Natural, 800N Orchid Paper natural roll towels. Green Seal 

Certified. 7.7" wide. 6 rolls/case, 800 feet/roll. Fits most universal roll towel 
dispensers. Maintex #320800N or approved equal

MOREX HWT68001K  $       20.49 Gale Supply

108 140 Each
Trash Can, Caddy, tool caddy bag for 32 and 44 gallon receptacles in yellow 

vinyl. Rubbermaid #2642 or approved equal
SUPPLY SOLUTIONS CB-

12POCKET-Y
 $        19.50 Supply Solution

109 35 Each
Trash Can, Dolly, All plastic construction, 5 Heavy Duty 3" swivel casters, 
Fits Brute 20, 32, 44 and 55 gallon containers. CARLISLE #3691103 or 

approved equal
MAINTEX 262768  $       25.88 Maintex

110 10 Each
Trash Can Dolly, Tandem, Black, to fit 20, 32, 40, 44 and 55 gallon trash 

cans. Rubbermaid #FG264600BLA or approved equal
730360 - Rubbermaid  $       97.53 Waxie

111

Trash Can, Plastic, Tough, Resists most acids and chemicals, withstands sub-
zero temperatures and steam cleaning, will not dent, rust, or leak. Seamless 

construction without lid Reinforced rims add strength and durability and 
built in handles allow easy, non-slip lifting and anti-jam nesting. Double-

ribbed base increases stability and dragging capacity. Color: Gray, 
Continental or approved equal

111a 140 Each Trash can plastic,20 gallon, CONTINENTAL 2000GY or approved equal
2000GY CONTINENTAL 

HUSKEE, 20/GAL, 1 EA
 $         21.18 Padre USA

111b 280 Each
Trash can plastic,32 gallon, CONTINENTAL 3200GY, RUBBERMAID 2632-

00GRAY or approved equal
730610 - Rubbermaid  $        26.12 Waxie
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111c 50 Each
Trash can plastic,44 gallon, CONTINENTAL #4444GY, CONTINENTAL - 

44TUFFGUY or approved equal

8844-GY 44 GAL 
STANDARD WASTE 

CAN, GREY NO PRINT
 $       37.50 Padre USA

112 25 Each
Trash can lid to fit item 143b, 32 gallon ,CONTINENTAL #3201GY or 

approved equal
8809-GY 32-GAL 

DYNAMO LID, GRAY
 $          8.25 Padre USA

113 450 Case
Trash Can Liner, 23" x 33", Low Density, .7 mil, Black, Flat Pack, 500 
liners/case, REPUBLIC PACK BLACK, REPUBLIC BAG REP-2333 or 

approved equal

INTEPLAST EC2433N 
5 MIC CLEAR

 $        18.88 Padre USA

114 490 Case
Trash Can Liner, 24" X 33", High Density, 8 micron, Natural, Coreless Roll, 

Star Seal Bottom, 20 rolls of 50 liners each, 1000/case, Waxie 704515, 
CAMEO #C243308-CR or approved equal

MED-X ROYALTY 
VHD243308N

 $        17.65 Med-X

115 85 Case
Trash Can Liner, 24 x 33, Natural, 5 Mil, High Density HDPE, 12-16 Gallons, 

Coreless Roll, 1,000 per Case, Maintex, Mfg. Item# N243306CR or 
approved equal

SUPPLY SOLUTIONS 
H243306N

 $        15.50 Supply Solution

116 110 Case

Trash Can Liner, 33” x 40” High Density, 11 micron, Natural, Star Seal 

Bottom, Coreless Roll, 500/case, Waxie 704530, HERITAGE 26640, 
Inteplast/ SSSH3340C11 or approved equal

UPC 334011N  $        21.75 UniPak

117 2,250 Case
Trash Can Liner, 33" x 44", Low Density, 1.5 mil, Flat Pack, 200/case. 

Republic 33441.5B, CAMEO #LD334415B or approved equal
ALLSTATE 33401.5MIL  $       24.99 Gale Supply

118 630 Case
Trash Can Liner, 33" x 44", CLEAR, Low Density, .90 mil, 200/case, 

REPUBLIC C334409, Allstate (flat pack)/ sssL3344C09 or approved equal
UPC 33449  $       20.25 UniPak

119 135 Case

Trash Can Liner, 40” x 48”, High Density, 16 micron, Natural, Star Seal 

Bottom, Coreless Roll, 250/case, Waxie 704500, FOP #CRHD4048X or 
approved equal

UPC 404816N  $        23.75 UniPak

120 1,000 Case

Trash Can Liner, 40” x 48”, High Density, 18 micron, Natural, 200 liners/case, 

ROLL PACK, Republic N404818CR, Heritage 704541SA, DJI 
#404818N200, Republic/ sssH4048C18 or approved equal

UPC 404818N  $        19.30 UniPak

121 2,750 Case
Trash Can Liner 40" X 48", High Density, 22 micron, Black, 150 liners/case, 

Maintex #249125, DJI #404822B150, Fortune BCRHD4048XH or approved 
equal

UPC 404822BK  $        17.90 UniPak

122 15 Each
Treads, 100% waterproof cover for work shoes, to reduce slip & fall 

accidents, Large, Waxie 791370 or approved equal
NO BID
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123 300 Each
Urinal Cartridge Kit - Sloan Waterfree for Falcon Urinals. Includes sealant 

package, a pair of disposable gloves, removal key, and disposable bag for old 
parts. Sloan Valve Co. Mfg # WES150, FALCON 96DF or approved equal

SUPPLY SOLUTIONS 
FWFC-1

 $       40.50 Supply Solution

124 800 Each
Urinal Screen, with Block, Scented, Deodorized Block contain cleaner, 

160700 FRESH #33240, AMERICAN SANITARY C-165 or approved equal
160700 - Fresh  $            1.31 Waxie

125 120 Each
Wastebasket, Plastic, Molded, 28 qt, 14 3/8" x 10 1/4" x 15", Colors: Beige, 

Black, Brown and Gray, Continental #2818 or approved equal
124867/CW56429  $           4.21 Southwest

126 75 Each
Wastebasket, Plastic, Molded, 41 qt, 11" x 19 7/8" x 15 1/4", Colors: Beige, 

Black, Brown and Gray, Continental #4114 or approved equal
125039/CW56433  $          6.85 Southwest

127 120 Each
Wastebasket, Plastic, Molded, Blue Medium Deskside Recycling Container 
with Universal Recycle Symbol, 28-1/8 qt Capacity, 14.4" Length x 10.25" 

Width x 15" Height; Rubbermaid FG295673 Blue or approved equal
758215/FG295673BW  $          5.84 Southwest

128 50 Each
Wastebasket, Plastic, Molded, Blue Large Deskside Recycle Container w/ 

Universal Recycle Symbol, 41.25qt; Rubbermaid FG295773 Blue or 
approved equal

756076/FG295773BLUE  $          9.99 Southwest
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