



North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

DATE: Oct 4, 2023

TO: NCEPC Member Districts and Associate Member Districts

FROM: Maribel Suarez
San Marcos Unified School District

RE: **Award of Xerographic and Print Shop Paper – Bid No. P2023-06**

The Following is the Pertinent Information Regarding this Bid:

Bid Mailing Date: 8/7/23

Bid List: 15 Vendors

Bid Bond: None required

Advertising Dates: 7/31/23 & 8/7/23

Addendums: 1

Bid Close: 8/31/23 at 3:00 pm

Bids Received: 5

Recommendation: Award the Xerographic & Print Shop Paper Bid as presented to Complete Office of California Inv, Kelly Spicer Paper, Liberty Paper, ODP and Southwest School Supply as provided in the Bid Award documents.

NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM

AWARDED VENDOR LIST

BID TITLE: XEROGRAPHIC & PRINT SHOP PAPER

SPONSORING DISTRICT: San Marcos Unified School District

BID NUMBER: P2023-06

DISTRICT CONTACT: Maribel Suarez, Buyer
Phone: (760) 752-1216

DELIVERY: 30 Working Days on Case, and 90 Working Days on Pallet or Carload Quantities

CONTRACT PERIOD: October 1, 2023 thru March 31, 2024

MINIMUM FREE FREIGHT - \$50.00

KELLY SPICER MIN \$375 ORDERS BELOW MIN A \$55 CHARGE WILL APPLY

VENDOR NAME	ADDRESS	PHONE/FAX NUMBER WEBSITE	CONTACT NAME
Complete Office of California Inc	11035 Technology Place, Ste 200 San Diego, CA 92127	858-435-7070 - Customer Service 619-654-7454 - Cell	Sarah Harper sharper@complete-office.com
Kelly Spicers	12310 E Slauson Ave Santa Fe Springs, CA 90670	800-774-2377 - Toll Free 562-693-0868 - Fax 714-883-7277 - Direct	Jason Christopher Jeff Scuderi jason.christopher@spicers.com jeff.scuderi@spicers.com
Liberty Paper	5025 Hampton St Los Angeles, CA 90058	866-507-2737 x2102	Kristin Perez kristen@libertypp.com
ODP	6600 N Military Trail Boca Raton, Fl 33496	888-777-4044 - Toll Free 858-705-3640 - Direct	Brad Moen Brad.Moen@officedepot.com
Southwest School Supply	3790 De Forest Circle Jurupa Valley, CA 91752	800-227-7159 - Toll Free 909-980-7159 - Fax	Aja Stickler Bid Manager biddesk@southwestschool.com

**North County Educational Purchasing Consortium
ATTACHMENT B**

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
Bid No: P2023-06

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District
Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216
maribel.suarez@smusd.org

Minimum Order \$50
Kelly Spicer Min Order \$375 orders under the minimum a \$55 charge will apply.

SECTION A

XEROGRAPHIC PAPER									
Item#	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description		Mfr/Product Name	Vendor Stock #	Price per Case (10 reams per case)	Price per Pallet (see description for # of cases)	Price per Carload (21 palletd per carload)	Awarded Vendor
1	665	Super Premium No. 4 high-speed multi-use dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 96% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	Boise x-9 High Bright	X9HB2011	\$ 33.88			Complete Office
	131		Pallet	Boise x-9 High Bright	7138341		\$ 1,345.07		ODP Business Solutions
	24		Carload	GEMINI	GEM811W			\$ 26,208.00	
2	236	Super Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 14". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 96% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 30 cases in a pallet	Case	OD MULTI-PURPOSE	OFD940635	\$ 57.85			Complete Office
	0		Pallet	GEMINI	GEM814W		\$ 1,485.00		Liberty Paper
	0		Carload	DOMTAR	940635			\$ 34,358.70	
3	7	Super Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11", 3 hole-drilled. Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 96% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	OD MULTI-PURPOSE	OFD9A601	\$ 46.18			Complete Office
	0		Pallet	DOMTAR	951031OD		\$ 1,846.00		ODP Business Solutions
	0		Carload	DOMTAR	951031OD			\$ 35,961.00	
4	826	Super Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 11" x 17". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 96% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	OD MULTI-PURPOSE	OFD940643	\$ 46.18			Complete Office
	53		Pallet	GEMINI	GEM1117W		\$ 1,700.00		Liberty Paper
	0		Carload	DOMTAR	117095OD			\$ 32,399.40	
5	645	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Xerox #3R2047. NO Substitute 40 cases in a pallet	Case	XEROX VITALITY	OFD940643	\$ 39.75			Complete Office
	15		Pallet	XEROX VITALITY	OFD940643(40)	\$ 1,590.00			Complete Office
	14		Carload	XEROX 3R2047	3R2047			\$ 32,399.40	
6	0	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	NATURAL CHOICE	1500877	\$ 36.88			Kelly Spicers Paper
	0		Pallet	NATURAL CHOICE	1500877		\$ 1,306.40		Kelly Spicers Paper
	4		Carload	NATURAL CHOICE	1500877			\$ 24,511.20	

**North County Educational Purchasing Consortium
ATTACHMENT B**

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
Bid No: P2023-06

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District
Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216
maribel.suarez@smusd.org

Minimum Order \$50
Kelly Spicer Min Order \$375 orders under the minimum a \$55 charge will apply.

SECTION A

XEROGRAPHIC PAPER										
Item#	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description		Mfr/Product Name	Vendor Stock #	Price per Case (10 reams per case)	Price per Pallet (see description for # of cases)	Price per Carload (21 palletd per carload)	Awarded Vendor	
7	80	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 14". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Xerox #3R2051. No substitute. Bid Per Case Price. 30 cases in a pallet.	Case	XEROX VITALITY	3R2051CT	\$ 63.75			Complete Office	
	0		Pallet	XEROX VITALITY	3R02051 A		\$ 1,778.90		ODP Business Solutions	
8	0	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 14". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 30 cases in a pallet	Case	BOISE	OX9004	\$ 46.20			Complete Office	
	0		Pallet	BOISE	151352		\$ 1,788.90		ODP Business Solutions	
9	32	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11", 3 hole-drilled. Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Xerox #3R2641. No substitute. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	XEROX VITALITY	3R2641	\$ 46.70			Complete Office	
	0		Pallet	XEROX VITALITY	3R2642		\$ 1,856.40		ODP Business Solutions	
10	0	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11", 3 hole-drilled. Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet.	Case	BOISE	OX9001P	33.85			Complete Office	
	0		Pallet	BOISE	196589		1455.07		ODP Business Solutions	
11	30	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 11" x 17". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet.	Case	BOISE	OX9007	\$ 33.85			Complete Office	
	0		Pallet	BOISE	382458		\$ 1,455.07		ODP Business Solutions	
12	2081	Premium No. 4 colored high-speed xerographic paper or xerographic bond, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11". Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	DOMTAR	BLUE 24540059	\$ 62.00			Southwest	
					CANARY 24540058					GOLDENROD 24540063
	2		Pallet		BLUE 3R11050				ODP Business Solutions	
					CANARY 3R11053					GOLDENROD 3R05861
13	1779	PREMIUM COLORED- ATTACHMENT WITH COLORS AND PART #'S Premium No. 4 colored xerographic paper or xerographic bond, pastel colors, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11". Price Xerox only. No Substitute. Bid Per Case. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	XEROX	BLUE 901631	\$ 75.00				Southwest

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
Bid No: P2023-06

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District
Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216
maribel.suarez@smusd.org

Minimum Order \$50

Kelly Spicer Minimum Order \$375 orders under the minimum a \$55 charge will apply.

SECTION B

PRINT SHOP PAPER

Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std.	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000	Awarded Vendor
TEXT									
1		Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ Text, Wt. - 24/60, Finish - Smooth, 8.5 X 11. No Subs							Southwest
1A	141	Celestial Blue #22661	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHTS	22661	REAM	500	\$ 10.40	\$ 20.80	Southwest
1B	4,311	Cosmic Orange #22651	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHTS	22651	REAM	500	\$ 10.40	\$ 20.80	Southwest
1C	7,031	Fireball Fuchsia #22681	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHTS	22681	REAM	500	\$ 10.40	\$ 20.80	Southwest
1D	70	Galaxy Gold #22571	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHTS	22571	REAM	500	\$ 10.40	\$ 20.80	Southwest
1E	141	Gamma Green #22541	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHTS	22541	REAM	500	\$ 10.40	\$ 20.80	Southwest
1F	326	Lift-Off Lemon #22631	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHTS	22631	REAM	500	\$ 10.40	\$ 20.80	Southwest
1G	4,541	Lunar Blue #22521	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHTS	22521	REAM	500	\$ 10.40	\$ 20.80	Southwest
1H	11	Martian Green #22061	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHTS	22061	REAM	500	\$ 10.40	\$ 20.80	Southwest
1I	160	Orbit Orange #22561	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHTS	22561	REAM	500	\$ 10.40	\$ 20.80	Southwest
1J	6	Plasma Pink #22119	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHTS	22119	REAM	500	\$ 10.40	\$ 20.80	Southwest
1K	145	Planetary Purple #22671	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHTS	22671	REAM	500	\$ 10.40	\$ 20.80	Southwest
1L	266	Pulsar Pink #22621	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHTS	22621	REAM	500	\$ 10.40	\$ 20.80	Southwest
1M	141	Re-Entry Red #22551	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHTS	22551	REAM	500	\$ 10.40	\$ 20.80	Southwest
1N	5,205	Rocket Red #22641	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHTS	22641	REAM	500	\$ 10.40	\$ 20.80	Southwest
1O	801	Solar Yellow #22531	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHTS	22531	REAM	500	\$ 10.40	\$ 20.80	Southwest
1P	6	Sunburst Yellow #22591	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHTS	22591	REAM	500	\$ 10.40	\$ 20.80	Southwest
1Q	451	Terra Green #22581	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHTS	22581	REAM	500	\$ 10.40	\$ 20.80	Southwest
1R	56	Terrestrial Teal #22479	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHTS	22479	REAM	500	\$ 10.40	\$ 20.80	Southwest
2		Equivalent to Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ Text, Wt. - 24/60, Finish - Smooth, 8.5 X 11.							
2A	0	Celestial Blue #22661	NEENAH	379595	REAM	500	\$ 7.94		ODP Business Solutions
2B	5,000	Cosmic Orange #22651	NEENAH	255815	REAM	500	\$ 7.97		ODP Business Solutions
2C	5,000	Fireball Fuchsia #22681	NEENAH	458121	REAM	500	\$ 7.94		ODP Business Solutions
2D	0	Galaxy Gold #22571	NEENAH	255664	REAM	500	\$ 7.97		ODP Business Solutions
2E	5,000	Gamma Green #22541	NEENAH	515403	REAM	500	\$ 7.94		ODP Business Solutions
2F	5,000	Lift-Off Lemon #22631	NEENAH	457981	REAM	500	\$ 7.97		ODP Business Solutions
2G	5,000	Lunar Blue #22521	NEENAH	675041	REAM	500	\$ 7.97		ODP Business Solutions
2H	0	Martian Green #22061	NEENAH	515403	REAM	500	\$ 7.97		ODP Business Solutions
2I	5,000	Orbit Orange #22561	NEENAH	255815	REAM	500	\$ 7.97		ODP Business Solutions
2J	0	Plasma Pink #22119	NEENAH	420919	REAM	500	\$ 7.94		ODP Business Solutions
2K	5,000	Planetary Purple #22671	NEENAH	696815	REAM	500	\$ 7.97		ODP Business Solutions
2L	5,000	Pulsar Pink #22621	NEENAH	420919	REAM	500	\$ 7.94		ODP Business Solutions
2M	5,000	Re-Entry Red #22551	NEENAH	420927	REAM	500	\$ 7.97		ODP Business Solutions
2N	0	Rocket Red #22641	NEENAH	458051	REAM	500	\$ 11.52		ODP Business Solutions
2O	5,000	Solar Yellow #22531	NEENAH	420935	REAM	500	\$ 7.97		ODP Business Solutions
2P	0	Sunburst Yellow #22591	NEENAH	42367	REAM	500	\$ 8.14		ODP Business Solutions
2Q	0	Terra Green #22581	NEENAH	364065	REAM	500	\$ 8.25		ODP Business Solutions
2R	0	Terrestrial Teal #22479			REAM	500	NO BID		ODP Business Solutions

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
 Bid No: P2023-06

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District
 Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216
maribel.suarez@smusd.org

Minimum Order \$50
 Kelly Spicer Minimum Order \$375 orders under the minimum a \$55 charge will apply.

SECTION B

PRINT SHOP PAPER

Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std.	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000	Awarded Vendor
3		Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ COLORS, Text, 11x17, Wt. 60#, Smooth Finish, Colors No Sub							
3A	5	Cosmic Orange #22653	ASTROBRIGHTS	22653	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
3B	0	Fireball Fuchsia #22683	ASTROBRIGHTS	22683	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
3C	5	Gamma Green #22543	ASTROBRIGHTS	22543	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
3D	0	Lift-Off Lemon #22633	ASTROBRIGHTS	22633	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
3E	55	Lunar Blue #22523	ASTROBRIGHTS	22523	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
3F	55	Orbit Orange #22563	ASTROBRIGHTS	22563	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
3G	55	Pulsar Pink #22623	ASTROBRIGHTS	22623	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
3H	60	Re-Entry Red #22553	ASTROBRIGHTS	22553	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
3I	55	Solar Yellow #22533	ASTROBRIGHTS	22533	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
3J	55	Terra Green #22583	ASTROBRIGHTS	22583	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
3K	5	Terrestrial Teal #22473	ASTROBRIGHTS	22873	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
4		Equivalent to Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ COLORS, Text, 11x17, Wt. 60#, Smooth Finish, Colors							
4A	0	Cosmic Orange #22653	ASTROBRIGHTS	22653	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
4B	0	Fireball Fuchsia #22683	ASTROBRIGHTS	22683	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
4C	0	Gamma Green #22543	ASTROBRIGHTS	22543	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
4D	0	Lift-Off Lemon #22633	ASTROBRIGHTS	22633	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
4E	0	Lunar Blue #22523	ASTROBRIGHTS	22523	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
4F	0	Orbit Orange #22563	ASTROBRIGHTS	22563	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
4G	0	Pulsar Pink #22623	ASTROBRIGHTS	22623	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
4H	0	Re-Entry Red #22553	ASTROBRIGHTS	22553	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
4I	0	Solar Yellow #22533	ASTROBRIGHTS	22533	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
4J	0	Terra Green #22583	ASTROBRIGHTS	22583	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
4K	0	Terrestrial Teal #22473	ASTROBRIGHTS	22873	REAM	500	\$ 32.11	\$ 64.22	Kelly SpicersPaper
5	6	Astroparche, Neenah Paper, Text, 8.5x11, Wt. 60#, Vellum Finish, Color Blue, No Sub	NEENAH	27141	REAM	500	\$ 34.35	\$ 68.70	Kelly SpicersPaper
6	0	Equivalent to Astroparche, Neenah Paper, Text, 8.5x11, Wt. 60#, Vellum Finish, Color Blue	NEENAH	27141	REAM	500	\$ 34.35	\$ 68.70	Kelly SpicersPaper
7	25	Int. Paper Hammermill Radiant White #104604, Text Laser Print, 8.5x11, Wt. 24/60, Smooth Finish, 98 Brightness, No Sub	HAMMERMILL	1500706	REAM	500	\$ 10.21	\$ 20.42	Kelly SpicersPaper
8	0	Equivalent to Int. Paper Hammermill Radiant White #104604, Text Laser Print, 8.5x11, Wt. 24/60, Smooth Finish, 98 Brightness,	HAMMERMILL	1500706	REAM	500	\$ 10.21	\$ 20.42	Kelly SpicersPaper
COVER & INDEX									
9	30,100	Neenah CLASSIC CREST Rcy 100 Bright White #14108, Cover, Wt. 80#, White, 8.5x11, Finish smooth, Brightness 95. No Sub	HAMMERMILL	14108	PKG	250	\$ 50.45	\$ 201.80	Kelly SpicersPaper
10	0	Equivalent to Neenah CLASSIC CREST Rcy 100 Bright White #14108, Cover, Wt. 80#, White, 8.5x11, Finish smooth, Brightness 95.	HAMMERMILL	14108	PKG	250	\$ 50.45	\$ 201.80	Kelly SpicersPaper

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
Bid No: P2023-06

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District
Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216
maribel.suarez@smusd.org

Minimum Order \$50

Kelly Spicer Minimum Order \$375 orders under the minimum a \$55 charge will apply.

SECTION B

PRINT SHOP PAPER

Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std.	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000	
11	0	Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ Cover, Wt. 65#, Finish smooth, 8.5x11, Colors, No Sub							Southwest
11A	10,022	Celestial Blue #22861	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22861	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
11B	2,012	Cosmic Orange #22851	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22851	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
11C	1,534	Fireball Fuchsia #22881	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22881	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
11D	0	Galaxy Gold #22771	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22771	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
11E	44	Gamma Green #22741	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22741	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
11F	0	Lift-Off Lemon #22831	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22831	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
11G	12,075	Lunar Blue #22721	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22721	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
11H	10,022	Martian Green #22071	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22071	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
11I	3,050	Orbit Orange #22761	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22761	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
11J	0	Plasma Pink #22129	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22129	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
11K	18	Planetary Purple #22871	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22871	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
11L	5,020	Pulsar Pink #22821	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22821	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
11M	6,045	Re-Entry Red #22751	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22751	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
11N	2,000	Rocket Red #22841	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22841	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
11O	8,077	Solar Yellow #22731	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22731	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
11P	0	Sunburst Yellow #22791	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22791	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
11Q	1,546	Terra Green #22781	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22109	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
11R	42	Terrestrial Teal #22109	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22109	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
12		Equivalent to Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ Cover, Wt. 65#, Finish smooth, 8.5x11, Colors							Southwest
12A	0	Celestial Blue #22861	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22861	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
12B	5,000	Cosmic Orange #22851	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22851	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
12C	5,000	Fireball Fuchsia #22881	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22881	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
12D	0	Galaxy Gold #22771	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22771	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
12E	5,000	Gamma Green #22741	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22741	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
12F	5,000	Lift-Off Lemon #22831	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22831	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
12G	5,000	Lunar Blue #22721	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22721	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
12H	0	Martian Green #22071	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22071	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
12I	5,000	Orbit Orange #22761	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22761	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
12J	0	Plasma Pink #22129	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22129	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
12K	5,000	Planetary Purple #22871	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22871	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
12L	5,000	Pulsar Pink #22821	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22821	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
12M	5,000	Re-Entry Red #22751	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22751	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
12N	5,000	Rocket Red #22841	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22841	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
12O	0	Solar Yellow #22731	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22731	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
12P	0	Sunburst Yellow #22791	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22791	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
12Q	0	Terra Green #22781	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22109	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest
12R	0	Terrestrial Teal #22109	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22109	PKG	250	\$ 10.40	\$ 41.60	Southwest

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
Bid No: P2023-06

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District
Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216
maribel.suarez@smusd.org

Minimum Order \$50

Kelly Spicer Minimum Order \$375 orders under the minimum a \$55 charge will apply.

SECTION B

PRINT SHOP PAPER

Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std.	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000	
13		Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™, Cover, Wt. 65#, Finish smooth, 23x35, Colors listed, No sub							Kelly SpicersPaper
13A	3	Lunar Blue #22724	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22724	PKG	500	\$ 249.95	\$ 499.99	Kelly SpicersPaper
13B	3	Re-Entry Red #22754	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22757	PKG	500	\$ 249.95	\$ 499.99	Kelly SpicersPaper
13C	3	Solar Yellow #22734	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22734	PKG	500	\$ 249.95	\$ 499.99	Kelly SpicersPaper
13D	3	Terra Green #22784	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22784	PKG	500	\$ 249.95	\$ 499.99	Kelly SpicersPaper
13E	3	Orbit Orange #22764	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22764	PKG	500	\$ 249.95	\$ 499.99	Kelly SpicersPaper
13F	3	Terrestrial Teal# 21854	ASTROBRIGHTS™	21854	PKG	500	\$ 249.95	\$ 499.99	
14		Equivalent to Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™, Cover, Wt. 65#, Finish smooth, 23x35, Colors listed.							Kelly SpicersPaper
14A	0	Lunar Blue #22724	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22724	PKG	500	\$ 249.95	\$ 499.99	Kelly SpicersPaper
14B	0	Re-Entry Red #22754	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22757	PKG	500	\$ 249.95	\$ 499.99	Kelly SpicersPaper
14C	0	Solar Yellow #22734	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22734	PKG	500	\$ 249.95	\$ 499.99	Kelly SpicersPaper
14D	0	Terra Green #22784	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22784	PKG	500	\$ 249.95	\$ 499.99	Kelly SpicersPaper
14E	1	Orbit Orange #22764	ASTROBRIGHTS™	22764	PKG	500	\$ 249.95	\$ 499.99	Kelly SpicersPaper
14F	1	Terrestrial Teal# 21854	ASTROBRIGHTS™	21854	PKG	500	\$ 249.95	\$ 499.99	Kelly SpicersPaper
15	379	Int. Paper Springhill #016000 or Wausau, Paper Exact Vellum Cover, 8.5 x 11 White, Wt. 67#, Finish Vellom Bristol, Brightness 92, Bristol #82211 No Sub	Int. Paper Springhil	16000	PKG	250	\$ 8.63	\$ 34.52	Kelly SpicersPaper
16	300	Equivalent to Int. Paper Springhill #016000 or Wausau, Paper Exact Vellum Cover, 8.5 x 11 White, Wt. 67#, Finish Vellom Bristol, Brightness 92, Bristol #82211	DOMTAR	759119	PKG	250	\$ 8.40	\$ 33.60	Southwest
17		Int. Paper Springhill, Cover, Wt.67#, Finish Vellom Bristol, 8.5x11, Colors listed. No Sub							Kelly SpicersPaper
17A	80	Blue #026000	Int. Paper Springhil	26000	PKG	250	\$ 10.76	\$ 43.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
17B	60	Canary #036000	Int. Paper Springhil	36000	PKG	250	\$ 10.76	\$ 43.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
17C	8	Cream #097000	Int. Paper Springhil	97000	PKG	250	\$ 10.76	\$ 43.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
17D	38	Goldenrod #086000	Int. Paper Springhil	86000	PKG	250	\$ 10.76	\$ 43.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
17E	74	Green #046000	Int. Paper Springhil	46000	PKG	250	\$ 10.76	\$ 43.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
17F	58	Ivory #056000	Int. Paper Springhil	56000	PKG	250	\$ 10.76	\$ 43.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
17G	0	Gray #066000	Int. Paper Springhil	66000	PKG	250	\$ 10.76	\$ 43.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
17H	56	Pink #076000	Int. Paper Springhil	76000	PKG	250	\$ 10.76	\$ 43.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std.	Standard Pkg Price		Awarded Vendor
18		Equivalent to Int. Paper Springhill, Cover, Wt.67#, Finish Vellom Bristol, 8.5x11, Colors listed.							
18A	60,055	Blue #026000	Int. Paper Springhil	026000	Case	2000	\$ 43.04		Kelly SpicersPaper
18B	40,058	Canary #036000	Int. Paper Springhil	036000	Case	2000	\$ 43.04		Kelly SpicersPaper
18D	10,000	Goldenrod #086000	Int. Paper Springhil	086000	Case	2000	\$ 43.04		Kelly SpicersPaper
18E	40,855	Green #046000	Int. Paper Springhil	046000	Case	2000	\$ 43.04		Kelly SpicersPaper
18F	10,100	Ivory #056000	Int. Paper Springhil	056000	Case	2000	\$ 43.04		Kelly SpicersPaper
18G	10,005	Gray #066000	Int. Paper Springhil	066000	Case	2000	\$ 43.04		Kelly SpicersPaper
18I	30,100	Pink #076000	Int. Paper Springhil	076000	Case	2000	\$ 43.04		Kelly SpicersPaper

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
Bid No: P2023-06

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District
Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216
maribel.suarez@smusd.org

Minimum Order \$50
 Kelly Spicer Minimum Order \$375 orders under the minimum a \$55 charge will apply.

SECTION B

PRINT SHOP PAPER

19		Int. Paper Springhill, Cover, Wt. 67#, Finish Vellum Bristol, 11x17, Colors listed. No Sub							
19A	40	Blue #026004	Int. Paper Springhil	026004	PKG	250	\$ 22.76	\$ 91.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
19B	85	Canary #036004	Int. Paper Springhil	036004	PKG	250	\$ 22.76	\$ 91.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
19C	30	Green #046004	Int. Paper Springhil	046004	PKG	250	\$ 22.76	\$ 91.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
19D	20	Pink #076004	Int. Paper Springhil	076004	PKG	250	\$ 22.76	\$ 91.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
19E	25	Goldenrod #086004	Int. Paper Springhil	086004	PKG	250	\$ 22.76	\$ 91.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
19F	85	White# 016004	Int. Paper Springhil	016004	PKG	250	\$ 22.76	\$ 91.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
20		Equivalent to Int. Paper Springhill, Cover, Wt. 67#, Finish Vellum Bristol, 11x17, Colors listed.							
20A	500	Blue #026004	Int. Paper Springhil	026004	PKG	250	\$ 22.76	\$ 91.04	
20B	500	Canary #036004	Int. Paper Springhil	036004	PKG	250	\$ 22.76	\$ 91.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
20C	500	Green #046004	Int. Paper Springhil	046004	PKG	250	\$ 22.76	\$ 91.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
20D	500	Pink #076004	Int. Paper Springhil	076004	PKG	250	\$ 22.76	\$ 91.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
20E	500	Goldenrod #086004	Int. Paper Springhil	086004	PKG	250	\$ 22.76	\$ 91.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
20F	5,000	White# 016004	Int. Paper Springhil	016004	PKG	250	\$ 22.76	\$ 91.04	Kelly SpicersPaper
21	0	Color Copy Digital Photo White, Cover, Wt. 60#, Finish smooth, 8.5x11, Brightness 100, Int. Paper Hammermill # 122549 No Sub	Int. Paper Springhil	122549	PKG	250	\$ 10.75	\$ 43.00	Kelly SpicersPaper
22	8	Equivalent to Color Copy Digital Photo White, Cover, Wt. 60#, Finish smooth, 8.5x11, Brightness 100, Int. Paper Hammermill # 122549	Int. Paper Springhil	122549	PKG	250	\$ 10.75	\$ 43.00	Kelly SpicersPaper
23	10,006	Color Copy Digital Cover, Finish Vellum Bristol, Wt. 80#, White, 11x17, Brightness 100, Int. Paper Hammermill #120037 No Sub	Int. Paper Springhil	120037	PKG	250	\$ 30.55	\$ 122.20	Kelly SpicersPaper
24	6	Equivalent to Color Copy Digital Cover, Finish Vellum Bristol, Wt. 80#, White, 11x17, Brightness 100, Int. Paper Hammermill #120037	Int. Paper Springhil	120037	PKG	250	\$ 30.55	\$ 122.20	Kelly SpicersPaper
Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000	Awarded Vendor
25		Int. Paper Springhill Colors or Equivalent, Index Digital, Wt. 90#, Finish Bristol, 8.5x11, Colors as listed. No Sub							
25A	24	Cherry #075100	Int. Paper Springhil	075100	PKG	250	\$ 12.00	\$ 48.00	
25B	24	Salmon #085100	Int. Paper Springhil	085100	PKG	250	\$ 12.00	\$ 48.00	Kelly SpicersPaper
26		Equivalent to Int. Paper Springhill Colors or Equivalent, Index Digital, Wt. 90#, Finish Bristol, 8.5x11, Colors as listed.							
26A	24	Cherry #075100	Int. Paper Springhil	075100	PKG	250	\$ 12.00	\$ 48.00	Kelly SpicersPaper
26B	24	Salmon #085100	Int. Paper Springhil	085100	PKG	250	\$ 12.00	\$ 48.00	Kelly SpicersPaper
WRITING									
27		BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP, Writing, Finish bond, 8.5 x11, Wt. 20							
27A	22,050	Blue # 103309	HAMMERMILL	103309	REAM	500	\$ 7.50	\$ 15.00	Southwest
27B	150,050	Canary # 103341	HAMMERMILL	103341	REAM	500	\$ 7.50	\$ 15.00	Southwest
27C	0	Cream # 168030	HAMMERMILL	168030	REAM	500	\$ 7.50	\$ 15.00	Southwest
27D	45	Goldenrod # 103168	HAMMERMILL	103168	REAM	500	\$ 7.50	\$ 15.00	Southwest
27E	30,010	Green # 103366	HAMMERMILL	103366	REAM	500	\$ 7.50	\$ 15.00	Southwest
27F	0	Lilac # 102269	HAMMERMILL	102269	REAM	500	\$ 7.50	\$ 15.00	Southwest
27G	50	Pink # 103382	HAMMERMILL	103382	REAM	500	\$ 7.50	\$ 15.00	Southwest
27H	0	Salmon # 103119	HAMMERMILL	103119	REAM	500	\$ 7.50	\$ 15.00	Southwest

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
Bid No: P2023-06

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District
Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216
maribel.suarez@smusd.org

Minimum Order \$50

Kelly Spicer Minimum Order \$375 orders under the minimum a \$55 charge will apply.

SECTION B

PRINT SHOP PAPER

28		Equivalent to BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP, Writing, Finish bond, 8.5 x11,							
28A	0	Blue # 103309	DOMTAR	345637	REAM	500	\$ 5.08	\$ 10.17	ODP Business Solutions
28B	0	Canary # 103341	DOMTAR	345660	REAM	500	\$ 5.08	\$ 10.17	ODP Business Solutions
28C	0	Cream # 168030	NEENAH INC	424090	REAM	250	\$ 7.50	\$ 40.86	ODP Business Solutions
28D	0	Goldenrod # 103168	DOMTAR	345686	REAM	500	\$ 5.09	\$ 10.18	ODP Business Solutions
28E	0	Green # 103366	DOMTAR	345645	REAM	500	\$ 5.08	\$ 10.17	ODP Business Solutions
28F	0	Lilac # 102269	DOMTAR	478156	REAM	500	\$ 5.09	\$ 10.18	ODP Business Solutions
28G	0	Pink # 103382	DOMTAR	345652	REAM	500	\$ 5.08	\$ 10.17	ODP Business Solutions
28H	0	Salmon # 103119	DOMTAR	478123	REAM	500	\$ 5.09	\$ 10.18	ODP Business Solutions

Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000	
29		BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP, Writing, Finish bond, 11 x17, Wt. 20							
29A	1,000	Blue # 102137	HAMMERMILL	102137	REAM	500	\$ 17.50	\$ 35.00	Southwest
29B	800	Canary # 102152	HAMMERMILL	102152	REAM	500	\$ 17.50	\$ 35.00	Southwest
29C	400	Green # 102186	HAMMERMILL	102186	REAM	500	\$ 17.50	\$ 35.00	Southwest
30		Equivalent to BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP, Writing, Finish bond, 11 x17,							
30a	0	Blue # 102137	HAMMERMILL	102137	REAM	500	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	Southwest
30B	0	Canary # 102152	HAMMERMILL	102152	REAM	500	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	Southwest
30D	0	Green # 102186	HAMMERMILL	102186	REAM	500	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	Southwest

31	90,000	BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP White #103192, Writing, Finish bond,Wt. 20, White, 11x17, Brightness 96.	HAMMERMILL	103192	REAM	500	\$ 13.95		Complete Office
32	0	Equivalent to BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP White #103192, Writing, Finish bond,Wt. 20, White, 11x17, Brightness 96	HAMMERMILL	103192	REAM	500	\$ 13.95		Complete Office
33	10	Opaque Domtar Husky # 5462 Offset, Finish smooth, White, 8.5x11, Wt. 60#, Brightness 94. No Sub		5462	REAM	500	\$ 10.30	\$ 20.60	Kelly SpicersPaper
34	0	Equivalent to Opaque Domtar Husky # 5462, Offset, Finish smooth, White, 8.5x11, Wt. 60#, Brightness 94.		5462	REAM	500	\$ 10.30	\$ 20.60	Kelly SpicersPaper

CARBONLESS SETS (NCR, NO SUB)

Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000	
35	20	Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5887, Carbonless, 2 parts, Canary /White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.		5887	REAM	500	\$ 18.62	\$ 37.24	Kelly SpicersPaper
36	0	Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5900, Carbonless, 3 parts, Pink/Canary/White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92. No sub		5900	REAM	500	\$ 20.94	\$ 41.88	Kelly SpicersPaper
37	25	Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5900, Carbonless, 3 parts, Pink/Canary/White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.		5900	REAM	500	\$ 20.94	\$ 41.88	Kelly SpicersPaper

CARBONLESS SETS (OTHER THAN NCR)

38	90	Pre-collated, heavyweight,STRAIGHT Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5909, Carbonless, 3 parts, White/Canary/Pink, 8.5x11, Brightness white 92. No Sub		5909	500	500	\$ 20.94	\$ 41.88	Kelly SpicersPaper
-----------	----	--	--	------	-----	-----	----------	----------	--------------------

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
 Bid No: P2023-06

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District
 Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216
maribel.suarez@smusd.org

Minimum Order \$50
 Kelly Spicer Minimum Order \$375 orders under the minimum a \$55 charge will apply.

SECTION B

PRINT SHOP PAPER									
39	0	Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight, STRAIGHT Sequence Appleton Superior # 5909, Carbonless, 3 parts, White/Canary/Pink, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.		5909	500	500	\$ 20.94	\$ 41.88	Kelly SpicersPaper
CARBONLESS SETS FOR USE IN HIGH-SPEED COPIER									
40	40	Pre-collated, REVERSE Sequence Glatfelter Excel One # 16557, Carbonless, 2 parts, Canary/White, 8.5x11, Wt. 20 No Sub		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
41	0	Equivalent to Pre-collated, REVERSE Sequence Glatfelter Excel One # 16557 Carbonless, 2 parts, Canary/White, 8.5x11, Wt. 20		5887	REAM	500	\$ 18.62	\$ 37.24	Kelly SpicersPaper
ENVELOPES									
Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Envelopess Per Std. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000	
42	200	#10 REGULAR with gum seal Southland #10 , Finish woven, Wt. 24, White		7296	Box	500	\$ 27.06		Kelly SpicersPaper
43	0	Equivalent to #10 REGULAR with gum seal Southland #10 , Finish woven, Wt. 24, White		7296	Box	500	\$ 27.06		Kelly SpicersPaper
Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price		
44	157	80# Gloss Cover 12" x 18"	4002860	1105732	Case	575	\$ 61.52		Kelly SpicersPaper
45	15	80# Gloss Text 12" x 18"	4002854	1100240	Case	1200	\$ 68.63		Kelly SpicersPaper
46	20	130# Gloss Cover 13" x 19"	4992870	1107404	Case	350	\$ 70.35		Kelly SpicersPaper
47	5	Photo Paper 9mil 54" x 100' 3" Core	36990000243C	7001096	Roll	1	\$ 185.12		Kelly SpicersPaper
48	5	Ultraflex SuperPrint Plus FL 13oz 63" X 164' Matte 3" Core or equal	JFM160050	7002418	Roll	1	\$ 227.02		Kelly SpicersPaper
49	5	Equivalent Ultraflex SuperPrint Plus FL 13oz 63" X 164' Matte 3" Core or equal	JFM160050	7002418	Roll	1	\$ 227.02		Kelly SpicersPaper
50	3	Ultraflex SuperPrint Plus FL 13oz 54" X 164' Matte 3" Core or qual	JFM137050	7002377	Roll	1	\$ 193.72		Kelly SpicersPaper
51	5	Ultraflex SuperPrint Plus FL 13oz 38" X 164' Matte 3" Core or equal	JFM0965050	7002056	Roll	1	\$ 136.34		Kelly SpicersPaper
52	5	Magnate Vivid Matte Vinyl 4.5mil 54" X 150' Perm 3"Core or equal	QM-VSMV-54	7005371	Roll	1	\$ 184.28		Kelly SpicersPaper
53	50	#10 gum sealed Window Envelope, White Wove, 24#, White, Diagonal Seamed	49079	3004855	Box	500	\$ 27.06		Kelly SpicersPaper
54	50	Superior Reverse Pink/White 2pt, 8.5" X 11" or equal	5896	2600164	Ream	500	\$ 18.62		Kelly SpicersPaper
55	20	Superior Reverse Pink/White 2pt, 8.5" X 14" or equal	5897	2500165	Ream	500	\$ 23.66		Kelly SpicersPaper
56	20	Superior Reverse Canary/White 2pt, 8.5" X 14" or equal	5889	2500056	Ream	500	\$ 23.66		Kelly SpicersPaper
57	20	Superior Reverse Pink/Canary/White 3pt, 8.5" X 14" equal	5902	2500156	Ream	500	\$ 26.60		Kelly SpicersPaper