



## North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

DATE: December 9, 2020

TO: NCEPC Member Districts and Associate Member Districts

FROM: Maribel Suarez  
San Marcos Unified School District

RE: **Award of Xerographic and Print Shop Paper – Bid No. P2020-11C**

---

The Following is the Pertinent Information Regarding this Bid:

Districts' Bid Requirements Received: Eleven (11) Districts.

Bid Mailing Date: 10/12/20

Bid List: 4 Vendors

Bid Bond: None required

Advertising Dates: 10-12-20 and 10-19-20

Addendums: 3

Bid Close: November 18, 2020, 3:00 pm

Bids Received: 6

**Recommendation:** Award the Xerographic & Print Shop Paper Bid as presented to Kelly Paper Liberty Paper, Office Depot, Spicers Paper, and Southwest School Supply as provided in the Bid Award documents.

# NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM

## AWARDED VENDOR LIST

**BID TITLE: XEROGRAPHIC & PRINT SHOP PAPER**      **SPONSORING DISTRICT:** San Marcos Unified School District

**BID NUMBER:** P2020-11C

**DISTRICT CONTACT:** Maribel Suarez, Buyer

Phone: (760) 752-1216 Fax: (760) 591-0907

**DELIVERY:** 10 Working Days on Case & Pallet, 21 Working Days on Carload Quantities

**CONTRACT PERIOD:** January 1, 2021 thru December 31, 2021

**MINIMUM FREE FREIGHT - \$50.00**

VENDOR NAME	ADDRESS	PHONE/FAX NUMBER WEBSITE	CONTACT NAME
Kelly Paper	1033 Cudahy Pl San Diego, CA 92110	800-675-3559 - Toll Free 844-979-7833 - Fax 619-422-1114 Chula Vista Office	Chuy Hernandez Sales Rep <a href="mailto:jesus.hernandez@kellypaper.com">jesus.hernandez@kellypaper.com</a>
Liberty Paper	5025 Hampton Street Los Angeles, CA 90058	866-507-2737 x2102-Toll Free 323-582-3434 Office - 323-973-4562	Kristen Perez Contract Administrator <a href="mailto:kristen@libertypp.com">kristen@libertypp.com</a>
Office Depot	6600 N Military Trail Boca Raton, FL 33496	888-263-3423 - Toll Free 562-426-9075 - Fax 858-705-3640 - Direct	Brad Moen Senior Key Accounts Manager-Public Sector Partnerships-West <a href="mailto:brad.moen@officedepot.com">brad.moen@officedepot.com</a>
Spicers Paper	12310 E Slauson Ave Santa Fe Springs, CA 90670	800-774-2377 - Toll Free 562-693-0868 - Fax 714-883-7277 - Direct	Jason Christopher Jeff Scuderi <a href="mailto:jason.christopher@spicers.com">jason.christopher@spicers.com</a> <a href="mailto:jeff.scuderi@spicers.com">jeff.scuderi@spicers.com</a>
Southwest School Supply	3790 De Forest Circle Jurupa Valley, CA 91752	800-227-7159 - Toll Free 909-980-7159 - Fax	Aja Stickler Bid Manager <a href="mailto:biddesk@southwestschool.com">biddesk@southwestschool.com</a>

**North County Educational Purchasing Consortium**

**Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper**

**Bid No: P2020-11C**

**Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District**

**Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216**

[maribel.suarez@smusd.org](mailto:maribel.suarez@smusd.org)

**SECTION A**

XEROGRAPHIC PAPER									
Item#	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description		Mfr/Product Name	Vendor Stock #	Price per Case (10 reams per case)	Price per Pallet (see description for # of cases)	Price per Carload (21 pallets per carload)	Awarded Vendor
1	9092	Super Premium No. 4 high-speed multi-use dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 96% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	Discovery	5315SW	\$ 26.29			Southwest
	0		Pallet	Ulimite	1501048		\$ 1,030.00		Spicers Paper
	7		Carload	Ulimite	150148			\$ 19,656.00	Spicers Paper
2	130	Super Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 14". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 96% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 30 cases in a pallet	Case	Domtar Lettermark 3986	5315WE14CS	\$ 42.50			Southwest
	0		Pallet	Double A	1500820		\$ 1,191.00		Spicers Paper
	0		Carload	Double A	1500820			\$ 23,782.50	Spicers Paper
3	709	Super Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11", 3 hole-drilled. Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 96% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	Office Depot Blue Top	940601	\$ 38.05			Office Depot
	0		Pallet	Domtar Lettermark	5315WE3H		\$ 1,420.00		Southwest
	0		Carload	Domtar Kelly Copy	1500782			\$ 28,602.00	Kelly Paper
4	160	Super Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 11" x 17". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 96% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	Domtar Imageprint	665809	\$ 33.86			Office Depot
	0		Pallet	Double A	1500821		\$ 1,322.40		Spicers Paper
	4		Carload	Double A	1500821			\$ 26,569.20	Spicers Paper
5	25	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Xerox #3R2047. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	Xerox Vitality	275474	\$ 31.03			Office Depot
	0		Pallet	Xerox Vitality	3R02047		\$ 1,270.00		Office Depot
	4		Carload	Premier	PRE811W			\$ 19,471.20	Liberty
6	0	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	Norpac Avalon 100227	1501072	\$ 27.43			Kelly Paper
	0		Pallet	Natural Choice	1500877		\$ 987.60		Spicers Paper
	3		Carload	Natural Choice	1500877			\$ 17,732.40	Spicers Paper
7	40	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 14". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Xerox #3R2051. No substitute. Bid Per Case Price. 30 cases in a pallet.	Case	Xerox Vitality	345611	\$ 42.00			Office Depot
	0		Pallet	Xerox 3R2051	1500831		\$ 1,585.80		Spicers Paper

**North County Educational Purchasing Consortium**

**Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper**  
**Bid No: P2020-11C**

**Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District**  
**Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216**  
[maribel.suarez@smusd.org](mailto:maribel.suarez@smusd.org)

**SECTION A**

XEROGRAPHIC PAPER									
Item#	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description		Mfr/Product Name	Vendor Stock #	Price per Case (10 reams per case)	Price per Pallet (see description for # of cases)	Price per Carload (21 pallets per carload)	Awarded Vendor
8	0	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 14". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 30	Case	Boise X-9	196589	\$ 39.87			Office Depot
			Pallet	Pacesetter	1500815		\$ 1,248.00		Spicers Paper
9	32	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11", 3 hole-drilled. Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Xerox #3R2641. No substitute. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	Xerox Vitality	887547	\$ 33.09			Office Depot
			Pallet	Domtar Xerox 3R2641	3502746		\$ 1,680.00		Kelly Paper
10	0	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11", 3 hole-drilled. Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet.	Case	Boise X-9	196589	\$ 33.27			Office Depot
			Pallet	Pacesetter 3HP	1500813		\$ 1,550.80		Spicers Paper
11	10	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 11" x 17". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet.	Case	Boise X-9	196652	\$ 31.28			Office Depot
			Pallet	Orca	1500821		\$ 1,308.80		Spicers Paper
12	2540	Premium No. 4 colored high-speed xerographic paper or xerographic bond, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11". Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet	Case			\$ 41.95			Spicers Paper
			Pallet				\$ 1,678.00		Spicers Paper
13	305	PREMIUM COLORED- ATTACHMENT WITH COLORS AND PART #'S Premium No. 4 colored xerographic paper or xerographic bond, pastel colors, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11". PriceXerox only. No Substitute. Bid Per Case. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	Xerox Vitality		\$ 38.50			Office Depot

**North County Educational Purchasing Consortium**

**Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper**  
**Bid No: P2020-11C**

**Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District**  
**Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216**  
[maribel.suarez@smusd.org](mailto:maribel.suarez@smusd.org)

**SECTION A**

XEROGRAPHIC PAPER									
Item#	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description		Mfr/Product Name	Vendor Stock #	Price per Case (10 reams per case)	Price per Pallet (see description for # of cases)	Price per Carload (21 pallets per carload)	Awarded Vendor
	0		Pallet	Xerox	5321BE 5321GN 5321PK 5321CY 5321GD 5321GY 5321CHY 5321TN		\$ 1,748.00		Southwest
14	0	Premium No. 4 xerographic paper or xerographic bond, pastels colors, 20#, 8 1/2" x 14". Xerox only. No Substitute Bid Per Case Price. 30 cases in a pallet.	Case		BLUE-345710 IVORY-345777 GREEN-345728 PINK-345736 GOLDENROD-345769	NO BID			
	0		Pallet				NO BID		
15	10	Premium No. 4 xerographic paper or xerographic bond, pastels colors, 20#, 8 1/2" x 14". Bid Per Case Price. 30 cases per pallet.	Case		BLUE-1500691 CANARY-1500692 CREAM-1500809 GOLDEN ROD-1500693 GREEN- 1500694 ORCHID- 1500214 IVORY-1500295 PINK-1500696	\$ 62.81			Spicers Paper
	0		Pallet		BLUE-1500691 CANARY-1500692 CREAM-1500809 GOLDEN ROD-1500693 GREEN- 1500694 ORCHID- 1500214 IVORY-1500295 PINK-1500696		\$ 1,884.30		Spicers Paper

**North County Educational Purchasing Consortium**

**Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper**  
**Bid No: P2020-11C**

**Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District**  
**Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216**  
[maribel.suarez@smusd.org](mailto:maribel.suarez@smusd.org)

**SECTION B**

**PRINT SHOP PAPER**

Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000 Sheets	Awarded Vendor
<b>TEXT</b>									
<b>1</b>		<b>Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ Text, Wt. - 24/60, Finish - Smooth, 8.5 X 11. No Subs</b>							
1A	120	Celestial Blue #22661	Astrobrights	1302475	REAM	500	\$ 7.05	\$ 14.10	Kelly Paper
1B	355	Cosmic Orange #22651	Astrobrights	1302751	REAM	500	\$ 7.05	\$ 14.10	Kelly Paper
1C	25	Fireball Fuchsia #22681	Astrobrights	1302757	REAM	500	\$ 7.05	\$ 14.10	Kelly Paper
1D	40	Galaxy Gold #22571	Astrobrights	1302761	REAM	500	\$ 7.05	\$ 14.10	Kelly Paper
1E	125	Gamma Green #22541	Astrobrights	1302765	REAM	500	\$ 7.05	\$ 14.10	Kelly Paper
1F	390	Lift-Off Lemon #22631	Astrobrights	1302988	REAM	500	\$ 7.05	\$ 14.10	Kelly Paper
1G	446	Lunar Blue #22521	Astrobrights	1302770	REAM	500	\$ 7.05	\$ 14.10	Kelly Paper
1H	0	Martian Green #22061	Astrobrights	1303007	REAM	500	\$ 7.05	\$ 14.10	Kelly Paper
1I	231	Orbit Orange #22561	Astrobrights	1302773	REAM	500	\$ 7.05	\$ 14.10	Kelly Paper
1J	0	Plasma Pink #22119	Astrobrights	1302779	REAM	500	\$ 7.05	\$ 14.10	Kelly Paper
1K	145	Planetary Purple #22671	Astrobrights	1302776	REAM	500	\$ 7.05	\$ 14.10	Kelly Paper
1L	250	Pulsar Pink #22621	Astrobrights	1302996	REAM	500	\$ 7.05	\$ 14.10	Kelly Paper
1M	105	Re-Entry Red #22551	Astrobrights	1302781	REAM	500	\$ 7.05	\$ 14.10	Kelly Paper
1N	205	Rocket Red #22641	Astrobrights	1302785	REAM	500	\$ 7.05	\$ 14.10	Kelly Paper
1O	612	Solar Yellow #22531	Astrobrights	1302789	REAM	500	\$ 7.05	\$ 14.10	Kelly Paper
1P	0	Sunburst Yellow #22591	Astrobrights	1302797	REAM	500	\$ 7.05	\$ 14.10	Kelly Paper
1Q	471	Terra Green #22581	Astrobrights	1302800	REAM	500	\$ 7.05	\$ 14.10	Kelly Paper
1R	140	Terrestrial Teal #22479	Astrobrights	1303000	REAM		\$ 7.05	\$ 14.10	Kelly Paper
<b>2</b>		<b>Equivalent to Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ Text, Wt. - 24/60, Finish - Smooth, 8.5 X 11.</b>							
2A	0	Celestial Blue #22661	22661	1302745	REAM	500	\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	Spicers Paper
2B	0	Cosmic Orange #22651	22651	1302751	REAM	500	\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	Spicers Paper
2C	0	Fireball Fuchsia #22681	22681	1302757	REAM	500	\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	Spicers Paper
2D	0	Galaxy Gold #22571	22571	1302761	REAM	500	\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	Spicers Paper
2E	0	Gamma Green #22541	22541	1302765	REAM	500	\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	Spicers Paper
2F	0	Lift-Off Lemon #22631	21011	1302988	REAM	500	\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	Spicers Paper
2G	0	Lunar Blue #22521	22521	1302770	REAM	500	\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	Spicers Paper
2H	0	Martian Green #22061	21801	1303007	REAM	500	\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	Spicers Paper
2I	0	Orbit Orange #22561	22561	1302773	REAM	500	\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	Spicers Paper
2J	0	Plasma Pink #22119	22119	1302779	REAM	500	\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	Spicers Paper
2K	0	Planetary Purple #22671	22671	132776	REAM	500	\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	Spicers Paper
2L	0	Pulsar Pink #22621	21031	1302996	REAM	500	\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	Spicers Paper
2M	0	Re-Entry Red #22551	22551	1302781	REAM	500	\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	Spicers Paper
2N	0	Rocket Red #22641	22641	1302785	REAM	500	\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	Spicers Paper
2O	0	Solar Yellow #22531	22531	1302789	REAM	500	\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	Spicers Paper
2P	0	Sunburst Yellow #22591	22591	1302797	REAM	500	\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	Spicers Paper
2Q	0	Terra Green #22581	22581	1302800	REAM	500	\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	Spicers Paper
2R	0	Terrestrial Teal #22479	21849	1303000	REAM	500	\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	Spicers Paper
<b>3</b>		<b>Boise Fireworx, Text, Wt. 24/60, 8.5x11, Finish Smooth Colors. No Sub</b>							
3A	0	Crackling Canary	NO BID	NO BID	REAM	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
3B	0	Bottle Rocket Blue	NO BID	NO BID	REAM	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
3C	0	Popper-Mint Green	NO BID	NO BID	REAM	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
3D	0	Echo Orchid	NO BID	NO BID	REAM	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper  
 Bid No: P2020-11C

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District  
 Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216  
[maribel.suarez@smusd.org](mailto:maribel.suarez@smusd.org)

**SECTION B**

PRINT SHOP PAPER									
Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000 Sheets	Awarded Vendor
<b>4</b>		<b>Equivalent to Boise Fireworx, Text, Wt. 24/60, 8.5x11, Finish Smooth Colors</b>							
4A	0	Crackling Canary	NO BID	NO BID	REAM	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
4B	0	Bottle Rocket Blue	NO BID	NO BID	REAM	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
4C	0	Popper-Mint Green	NO BID	NO BID	REAM	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
4D	0	Echo Orchid	NO BID	NO BID	REAM	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
<b>5</b>		<b>Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ COLORS, Text, 11x17, Wt. 60#, Smooth Finish, Colors No Sub</b>							
5A	5	Cosmic Orange #22653	22653	1302752	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
5B	0	Fireball Fuchsia #22683	22683	1302758	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
5C	5	Gamma Green #22543	2253	1302766	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
5D	0	Lift-Off Lemon #22633	21013	1302991	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
5E	60	Lunar Blue #22523	22523	1302771	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
5F	60	Orbit Orange #22563	22563	1302774	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
5G	60	Pulsar Pink #22623	21033	1302997	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
5H	63	Re-Entry Red #22553	22553	132782	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
5I	60	Solar Yellow #22533	22533	1302790	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
5J	5	Terra Green #22583	22583	1302801	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
5K	60	Terrestrial Teal #22473	21873	1302803	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
<b>6</b>		<b>Equivalent to Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ COLORS, Text, 11x17, Wt. 60#, Smooth Finish, Colors</b>							
6A	0	Cosmic Orange #22653	22653	1302752	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
6B	0	Fireball Fuchsia #22683	22683	1302758	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
6C	0	Gamma Green #22543	2253	1302766	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
6D	0	Lift-Off Lemon #22633	21013	1302991	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
6E	0	Lunar Blue #22523	22523	1302771	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
6F	0	Orbit Orange #22563	22563	1302774	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
6G	0	Pulsar Pink #22623	21033	1302997	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
6H	0	Re-Entry Red #22553	22553	132782	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
6I	0	Solar Yellow #22533	22533	1302790	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
6J	0	Terra Green #22583	22583	1302801	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
6K	0	Terrestrial Teal #22473	21873	1302803	REAM	500	\$ 15.67	\$ 31.34	Spicers Paper
<b>7</b>		<b>Wausau Paper, Text, Wt. 60#, Vellum Finish, 8.5x11, Opaque Colors No Sub</b>							
7A	0	Gold #62411	NO BID	NO BID	REAM	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
7B	0	Gray #62401	NO BID	NO BID	REAM	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
7C	0	Ivory #62351	NO BID	NO BID	REAM	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
<b>8</b>		<b>Equivalent to Wausau Paper, Text, Wt. 60#, Vellum Finish, 8.5x11, Opaque Colors Or Equivalent</b>							Spicers Paper
8A	0	Gold #62411	24034	1301449	REAM	500	\$ 5.46	\$ 10.92	Spicers Paper
8B	0	Gray #62401	24038	1301505	REAM	500	\$ 5.46	\$ 10.92	Spicers Paper
8C	0	Ivory #62351	24039	1301451	REAM	500	\$ 5.46	\$ 10.92	Spicers Paper
<b>9</b>	0	<b>Astroparche, Neenah Paper, Text, 8.5x11, Wt. 60#, Vellum Finish, Color Blue, Item #27141 No sub</b>	27141	2002041	REAM	500	\$ 9.12	\$ 18.24	Spicers Paper
<b>10</b>	0	<b>Equivalent to Astroparche, Neenah Paper, Text, 8.5x11, Wt. 60#, Vellum Finish, Color Blue, Item #27141</b>	27142 <sup>19</sup>	2002041	REAM	500	\$ 9.12	\$ 18.24	Spicers Paper

**North County Educational Purchasing Consortium**

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper  
 Bid No: P2020-11C

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District  
 Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216  
[maribel.suarez@smusd.org](mailto:maribel.suarez@smusd.org)

**SECTION B**

PRINT SHOP PAPER									
Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000 Sheets	Awarded Vendor
11	5	Astroparche, Neenah Paper, Text, 8.5x11, Wt. 60#, Vellum Finish, Color Blue, No Sub	27143	2002041	REAM	500	\$ 9.12	\$ 18.24	Spicers Paper
12	0	Equivalent to Astroparche, Neenah Paper, Text, 8.5x11, Wt. 60#, Vellum Finish, Color Blue	27144	2002041	REAM	500	\$ 9.12	\$ 18.24	Spicers Paper
13	20	Int. Paper Hammermill Radiant White #104604, Text Laser Print, 8.5x11, Wt. 24/60, Smooth Finish, 98 Brightness, No Sub	104604	150076	REAM	500	\$ 6.46	\$ 12.92	Spicers Paper
14	0	Equivalent to Int. Paper Hammermill Radiant White #104604, Text Laser Print, 8.5x11, Wt. 24/60, Smooth Finish, 98 Brightness,	NPL1124	1500791	REAM	500	\$ 6.46	\$ 12.92	Spicers Paper
COVER & INDEX									
15	0	Neenah CLASSIC CREST Rcy 100 Bright White #14108, Cover, Wt. 80#, White, 8.5x11, Finish smooth, Brightness 95. No Sub	14108	2002184	PKG	250	\$ 19.91	\$ 79.64	Spicers Paper
16	0	Equivalent to Neenah CLASSIC CREST Rcy 100 Bright White #14108, Cover, Wt. 80#, White, 8.5x11, Finish smooth, Brightness 95.	14108	2002184	PKG	250	\$ 19.91	\$ 79.64	Spicers Paper
17	0	Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ Cover, Wt. 65#, Finish smooth, 8.5x11, Colors, No Sub							
17A	0	Celestial Blue #22861	Astrobrights	1302671	PK	250	\$ 6.98	\$ 27.92	Kelly Paper
17B	104	Cosmic Orange #22851	Astrobrights	132675	PK	250	\$ 6.98	\$ 27.92	Kelly Paper
17C	87	Fireball Fuchsia #22881	Astrobrights	1302757	PK	250	\$ 6.98	\$ 27.92	Kelly Paper
17D	168	Galaxy Gold #22771	Astrobrights	1302761	PK	250	\$ 6.98	\$ 27.92	Kelly Paper
17E	100	Gamma Green #22741	Astrobrights	1302765	PK	250	\$ 6.98	\$ 27.92	Kelly Paper
17F	0	Lift-Off Lemon #22831	Astrobrights	1302988	PK	250	\$ 6.98	\$ 27.92	Kelly Paper
17G	197	Lunar Blue #22721	Astrobrights	1302770	PK	250	\$ 6.98	\$ 27.92	Kelly Paper
17H	0	Martian Green #22071	Astrobrights	1303007	PK	250	\$ 6.98	\$ 27.92	Kelly Paper
17I	127	Orbit Orange #22761	Astrobrights	1302773	PK	250	\$ 6.98	\$ 27.92	Kelly Paper
17J	0	Plasma Pink #22129	Astrobrights	1302779	PK	250	\$ 6.98	\$ 27.92	Kelly Paper
17K	28	Planetary Purple #22871	Astrobrights	1302776	PK	250	\$ 6.98	\$ 27.92	Kelly Paper
17L	2	Pulsar Pink #22821	Astrobrights	1302996	PK	250	\$ 6.98	\$ 27.92	Kelly Paper
17M	158	Re-Entry Red #22751	Astrobrights	1302781	PK	250	\$ 6.98	\$ 27.92	Kelly Paper
17N	0	Rocket Red #22841	Astrobrights	1302785	PK	250	\$ 6.98	\$ 27.92	Kelly Paper
17O	237	Solar Yellow #22731	Astrobrights	1302789	PK	250	\$ 6.98	\$ 27.92	Kelly Paper
17P	24	Sunburst Yellow #22791	Astrobrights	1302797	PK	250	\$ 6.98	\$ 27.92	Kelly Paper
17Q	40	Terra Green #22781	Astrobrights	137800	PK	250	\$ 6.98	\$ 27.92	Kelly Paper
17R	8	Terrestrial Teal #22109	Astrobrights	1302000	PK	250	\$ 6.98	\$ 27.92	Kelly Paper
18		Equivalent to Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ Cover, Wt. 65#, Finish smooth, 8.5x11, Colors							
18A	0	Celestial Blue #22861	22861	1302671	PK	250	\$ 7.10	\$ 28.40	Spicers Paper
18B	0	Cosmic Orange #22851	22851	1302675	PK	250	\$ 7.10	\$ 28.40	Spicers Paper
18C	0	Fireball Fuchsia #22881	22881	1302683	PK	250	\$ 7.10	\$ 28.40	Spicers Paper
18D	0	Galaxy Gold #22771	22771	1302687	PK	250	\$ 7.10	\$ 28.40	Spicers Paper
18E	0	Gamma Green #22741	22741	1302690	PK	250	\$ 7.10	\$ 28.40	Spicers Paper
18F	0	Lift-Off Lemon #22831	22831	1302977	PK	250	\$ 7.10	\$ 28.40	Spicers Paper
18G	0	Lunar Blue #22721	22721	1302696	PK	250	\$ 7.10	\$ 28.40	Spicers Paper
18H	0	Martian Green #22071	22071	1302698	PK	250	\$ 7.10	\$ 28.40	Spicers Paper
18I	0	Orbit Orange #22761	22761	130273	PK	250	\$ 7.10	\$ 28.40	Spicers Paper
18J	0	Plasma Pink #22129	22129	1302709	PK	250	\$ 7.10	\$ 28.40	Spicers Paper
18K	0	Planetary Purple #22871	2287120	1302706	PK	250	\$ 7.10	\$ 28.40	Spicers Paper



**North County Educational Purchasing Consortium**

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper  
 Bid No: P2020-11C

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District  
 Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216  
[maribel.suarez@smusd.org](mailto:maribel.suarez@smusd.org)

**SECTION B**

PRINT SHOP PAPER									
Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000 Sheets	Awarded Vendor
18L	0	Pulsar Pink #22821	22821	1302711	PK	250	\$ 7.10	\$ 28.40	Spicers Paper
18M	0	Re-Entry Red #22751	22751	1302712	PK	250	\$ 7.10	\$ 28.40	Spicers Paper
18N	0	Rocket Red #22841	22841	1302717	PK	250	\$ 7.10	\$ 28.40	Spicers Paper
18O	0	Solar Yellow #22731	22731	1302720	PK	250	\$ 7.10	\$ 28.40	Spicers Paper
18P	0	Sunburst Yellow #22791	22791	1302728	PK	250	\$ 7.10	\$ 28.40	Spicers Paper
18Q	0	Terra Green #22781	22781	1302731	PK	250	\$ 7.10	\$ 28.40	Spicers Paper
18R	0	Terrestrial Teal #22109	22109	1302733	PK	250	\$ 7.10	\$ 28.40	Spicers Paper
<b>19</b>		<b>Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™, Cover, Wt. 65#, Finish smooth, 23x35, Colors listed, No sub</b>							
19A	1	Lunar Blue #22724	22724	1302702	PKG	500	\$ 132.50	\$ 265.00	Spicers Paper
19B	1	Re-Entry Red #22754	22754	1302716	PKG	500	\$ 132.50	\$ 265.00	Spicers Paper
19C	1	Solar Yellow #22734	22734	1302724	PKG	500	\$ 132.50	\$ 265.00	Spicers Paper
19D	1	Terra Green #22784	22784	1302740	PKG	500	\$ 132.50	\$ 265.00	Spicers Paper
19E	1	Orbit Orange #22764	22764	1302705	PKG	500	\$ 132.50	\$ 265.00	Spicers Paper
19F	1	Terrestrial Teal# 21854	21854	1302741	PKG	500	\$ 132.50	\$ 265.00	Spicers Paper
<b>20</b>		<b>Equivalent to Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™, Cover, Wt. 65#, Finish smooth, 23x35, Colors listed.</b>							
20A	0	Lunar Blue #22724	22724	1302702	PKG	500	\$ 132.50	\$ 265.00	Spicers Paper
20B	0	Re-Entry Red #22754	22754	1302716	PKG	500	\$ 132.50	\$ 265.00	Spicers Paper
20C	0	Solar Yellow #22734	22734	1302724	PKG	500	\$ 132.50	\$ 265.00	Spicers Paper
20D	0	Terra Green #22784	22784	1302740	PKG	500	\$ 132.50	\$ 265.00	Spicers Paper
20E	1	Orbit Orange #22764	22764	1302705	PKG	500	\$ 132.50	\$ 265.00	Spicers Paper
20F	1	Terrestrial Teal# 21854	21854	1302741	PKG	500	\$ 132.50	\$ 265.00	Spicers Paper
<b>21</b>	1,455	<b>Int. Paper Springhill #016000 or Wausau, Paper Exact Vellum Cover, 8.5 x 11 White, Wt. 67#, Finish Vellom Bristol, Brightness 92, Bristol #82211 No Sub</b>	16000	1301693	PKG	250	\$ 4.53	\$ 18.12	Spicers Paper
<b>22</b>	56	<b>Equivalent to Int. Paper Springhill #016000 or Wausau, Paper Exact Vellum Cover, 8.5 x 11 White, Wt. 67#, Finish Vellom Bristol, Brightness 92, Bristol #82211</b>	16000	1301693	PKG	250	\$ 4.53	\$ 18.12	Spicers Paper
<b>23</b>		<b>Int. Paper Springhill, Cover, Wt.67#, Finish Vellom Bristol, 8.5x11, Colors listed. No Sub</b>							
23A	322	Blue #026000	26000	1301694	PKG	250	\$ 4.50	\$ 18.00	Spicers Paper
23B	322	Canary #036000	36000	1301700	PKG	250	\$ 4.50	\$ 18.00	Spicers Paper
23C	40	Cream #097000	97000	1301701	PKG	250	\$ 4.50	\$ 18.00	Spicers Paper
23D	56	Goldenrod #086000	86008	1301695	PKG	250	\$ 4.50	\$ 18.00	Spicers Paper
23E	236	Green #046000	46000	130438	PKG	250	\$ 4.50	\$ 18.00	Spicers Paper
23F	48	Ivory #056000	56000	1301697	PKG	250	\$ 4.50	\$ 18.00	Spicers Paper
23G	16	Gray #066000	66000	1301696	PKG	250	\$ 4.50	\$ 18.00	Spicers Paper
23H	122	Orchid #057000	57000	1301717	PKG	250	\$ 4.50	\$ 18.00	Spicers Paper
23I	96	Pink #076000	76000	1301698	PKG	250	\$ 4.50	\$ 18.00	Spicers Paper
23J	32	Tan #096000	96000	1301699	PKG	250	\$ 4.50	\$ 18.00	Spicers Paper
<b>24</b>		<b>Equivalent to Int. Paper Springhill, Cover, Wt.67#, Finish Vellom Bristol, 8.5x11, Colors listed.</b>	Domtar	5335XXCS					
24A	5	Blue #026000	814042	5335BECS	CASE	2000	\$ 34.40	\$ 17.20	Southwest
24B	8	Canary #036000	81044	5335CYCS	CASE	2000	\$ 34.40	\$ 17.20	Southwest
24C	0	Cream #097000	81212 <sub>21</sub>	5335CMCS	CASE	2000	\$ 34.40	\$ 17.20	Southwest

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper  
 Bid No: P2020-11C

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District  
 Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216  
[maribel.suarez@smusd.org](mailto:maribel.suarez@smusd.org)

**SECTION B**

PRINT SHOP PAPER									
Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Stnd. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Stnd. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000 Sheets	Awarded Vendor
24D	5	Goldenrod #086000	81057	5335DGCS	CASE	2000	\$ 34.40	\$ 17.20	Southwest
24E	5	Green #046000	81040	5335GNCS	CASE	2000	\$ 34.40	\$ 17.20	Southwest
24F	0	Ivory #056000	81046	5335IYCS	CASE	2000	\$ 34.40	\$ 17.20	Southwest
24G	5	Gray #066000	81043	5335GYCS	CASE	2000	\$ 34.40	\$ 17.20	Southwest
24H	0	Orchid #057000	82890	5335ODCS	CASE	2000	\$ 34.40	\$ 17.20	Southwest
24I	18	Pink #076000	81041	5335PKCS	CASE	2000	\$ 34.40	\$ 17.20	Southwest
24J	0	Tan #096000	81060	5335TNCS	CASE	2000	\$ 34.40	\$ 17.20	Southwest
<b>25</b>		<b>Int. Paper Springhill, Cover, Wt. 67#, Finish Vellum Bristol, 11x17, Colors listed. No Sub</b>							
25A	36	Blue #026004	IP Springhill	1301713	PKG	250	\$ 10.08	\$ 40.32	Kelly Paper
25B	60	Canary #036004	IP Springhill	1301714	PKG	250	\$ 10.08	\$ 40.32	Kelly Paper
25C	24	Green #046004	IP Springhill	1301553	PKG	250	\$ 10.08	\$ 40.32	Kelly Paper
25D	16	Pink #076004	IP Springhill	1301724	PKG	250	\$ 10.08	\$ 40.32	Kelly Paper
25E	20	Goldenrod #086004	IP Springhill	1301715	PKG	250	\$ 10.08	\$ 40.32	Kelly Paper
25F	8	Tan #096004	IP Springhill	130NA	PKG	250	\$ 10.08	\$ 40.32	Kelly Paper
25G	60	White# 016004	IP Springhill	1301712	PKG	250	\$ 10.08	\$ 40.32	Kelly Paper
<b>26</b>		<b>Equivalent to Int. Paper Springhill, Cover, Wt. 67#, Finish Vellum Bristol, 11x17, Colors listed.</b>							
26A	0	Blue #026004	26004	1301713	PKG	250	\$ 11.02	\$ 44.08	Spicers Paper
26B	0	Canary #036004	36004	1301714	PKG	250	\$ 11.02	\$ 44.08	Spicers Paper
26C	0	Green #046004	46004	1301553	PKG	250	\$ 11.02	\$ 44.08	Spicers Paper
26D	0	Pink #076004	76004	1301724	PKG	250	\$ 11.02	\$ 44.08	Spicers Paper
26E	0	Goldenrod #086004	86004	1301715	PKG	250	\$ 11.02	\$ 44.08	Spicers Paper
26F	0	Tan #096004	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	PKG	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	
26G	0	White# 016004	16004	1301712	PKG	250	\$ 11.02	\$ 44.08	Spicers Paper
<b>27</b>	0	<b>Color Copy Digital Photo White, Cover, Wt. 60#, Finish smooth, 8.5x11, Brightness 100, Int. Paper Hammermill # 122549 No Sub</b>	122549	1500743	PKG	250	\$ 6.93	\$ 27.72	Spicers Paper
<b>28</b>	0	<b>Equivalent to Color Copy Digital Photo White, Cover, Wt. 60#, Finish smooth, 8.5x11, Brightness 100, Int. Paper Hammermill # 122549</b>	12-211	<b>1500917</b>	PKG	250	\$ 7.30	\$ 29.20	Spicers Paper
<b>29</b>	0	<b>Color Copy Digital Cover, Finish Vellum Bristol, Wt. 80#, White, 11x17, Brightness 100, Int. Paper Hammermill #120037 No Sub</b>	IP Hammermill	1500802	PKG	250	\$ 19.63	\$ 78.52	Kelly Paper
<b>30</b>	0	<b>Equivalent to Color Copy Digital Cover, Finish Vellum Bristol, Wt. 80#, White, 11x17, Brightness 100, Int. Paper Hammermill #120037</b>	12-215	<b>1500910</b>	PKG	<b>250</b>	\$ 19.43	\$ 77.72	Spicers Paper
<b>31</b>		<b>Int. Paper Springhill Colors or Equivalent, Index Digital, Wt. 90#, Finish Bristol, 8.5x11, Colors as listed. No Sub</b>							
31A	0	Cherry #075100	75100	131748	PKG	250	\$ 5.30	\$ 21.20	Spicers Paper
31B	0	Salmon #085100	85100	131748	PKG	250	\$ 5.30	\$ 21.20	Spicers Paper
<b>32</b>		<b>Equivalent to Int. Paper Springhill Colors or Equivalent, Index Digital, Wt. 90#, Finish Bristol, 8.5x11, Colors as listed.</b>							
32A	24	Cherry #075100	75100	131748	PKG	250	\$ 5.30	\$ 21.20	Spicers Paper
32B	24	Salmon #085100	85100	131748	PKG	250	\$ 5.30	\$ 21.20	Spicers Paper
<b>33</b>	0	<b>Int. Paper Springhill # 015101 or Equivalent, Index Digital, White, Finish Smooth, Wt. 90#, 8.5x11, brightness 92. No Sub</b>	IP Springhill	1301742	PKG	250	\$ 5.00	\$ 20.00	Kelly Paper

**North County Educational Purchasing Consortium**

**Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper**  
**Bid No: P2020-11C**

**Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District**  
**Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216**  
[maribel.suarez@smusd.org](mailto:maribel.suarez@smusd.org)

**SECTION B**

<b>PRINT SHOP PAPER</b>									
<b>Item No.</b>	<b>Estimated Usage</b>	<b>Item Specification/Description</b>	<b>Mfr/Brand #</b>	<b>Vendor Stock #</b>	<b>Std. Pkg UOM</b>	<b># Of Sheets Per Std. Pkg</b>	<b>Standard Pkg Price</b>	<b>Price Per 1,000 Sheets</b>	<b>Awarded Vendor</b>
34	0	Equivalent to Int. Paper Springhill # 015101 or Equivalent, Index Digital, White, Finish Smooth, Wt. 90#, 8.5x11, brightness 92.	15101	1301742	PKG	250	\$ 5.44	\$ 21.76	Spicers Paper
<b>WRITING</b>									
35		<b>BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP, Writing, Finish bond, 8.5 x11, Wt. 20 Colors listed No Sub</b>							
35A	30	Blue # 103309	103309	1500680	REAM	500	\$ 4.54	\$ 9.08	Spicers Paper
35B	0	Buff # 103325	103325	1500721	REAM	500	\$ 4.54	\$ 9.08	Spicers Paper
35C	30	Canary # 103341	103341	1500681	REAM	500	\$ 4.54	\$ 9.08	Spicers Paper
35D	0	Cherry # 102210	12210	1500682	REAM	500	\$ 4.54	\$ 9.08	Spicers Paper
35E	0	Cream # 168030	168030	1500683	REAM	500	\$ 4.54	\$ 9.08	Spicers Paper
35F	10	Goldenrod # 103168	103168	1500684	REAM	500	\$ 4.54	\$ 9.08	Spicers Paper
35G	30	Green # 103366	103366	1500686	REAM	500	\$ 4.54	\$ 9.08	Spicers Paper
35H	0	Ivory # 103176	103176	1500687	REAM	500	\$ 4.54	\$ 9.08	Spicers Paper
35I	0	Lilac # 102269	102269	1500738	REAM	500	\$ 4.54	\$ 9.08	Spicers Paper
35J	20	Orchid # 103770	103770	1500722	REAM	500	\$ 4.54	\$ 9.08	Spicers Paper
35K	0	Pink # 103382	103382	1500688	REAM	500	\$ 4.54	\$ 9.08	Spicers Paper
35L	0	Salmon # 103119	103119	1500689	REAM	500	\$ 4.54	\$ 9.08	Spicers Paper
35M	10	Tan # 102863	102863	1500690	REAM	500	\$ 4.54	\$ 9.08	Spicers Paper
35N	0	Turquoise # 103820	103820	1500739	REAM	500	\$ 4.54	\$ 9.08	Spicers Paper
36		<b>Equivalent to BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP, Writing, Finish bond, 8.5 x11, Wt. 20 Colors listed</b>	Domtar	5320XX					
36A	0	Blue # 103309	81199	5320BE	RAEM	500	\$ 4.25	\$ 9.50	Southwest
36B	0	Buff # 103325	81204	5320BF	RAEM	500	\$ 4.25	\$ 9.50	Southwest
36C	0	Canary # 103341	81196	5230CY	RAEM	500	\$ 4.25	\$ 9.50	Southwest
36D	0	Cherry # 102210	81205	5320CHY	RAEM	500	\$ 4.25	\$ 9.50	Southwest
36E	0	Cream # 168030	81207	DOM81207	RAEM	500	\$ 4.25	\$ 9.50	Southwest
36F	0	Goldenrod # 103168	81203	5320GD	RAEM	500	\$ 4.25	\$ 9.50	Southwest
36G	0	Green # 103366	81197	2320IY	RAEM	500	\$ 4.25	\$ 9.50	Southwest
36H	0	Ivory # 103176	81201	5320GN	RAEM	500	\$ 4.25	\$ 9.50	Southwest
36I	0	Lilac # 102269	81200	5320OD	RAEM	500	\$ 4.25	\$ 9.50	Southwest
36J	0	Orchid # 103770	81200	5320OD	RAEM	500	\$ 4.25	\$ 9.50	Southwest
36K	0	Pink # 103382	81198	5320PK	RAEM	500	\$ 4.25	\$ 9.50	Southwest
36L	0	Salmon # 103119	81209	5320SN	RAEM	500	\$ 4.25	\$ 9.50	Southwest
36M	0	Tan # 102863	81202	5320TN	RAEM	500	\$ 4.25	\$ 9.50	Southwest
36N	0	Turquoise # 103820	103820	5320TE	RAEM	500	\$ 4.25	\$ 9.50	Southwest
37		<b>BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP, Writing, Finish bond, 11 x17, Wt. 20 Colors listed No Sub</b>							
37a	160	Blue # 102137	102137	1500697	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
37B	0	Buff # 102145	102145	1500723	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
37C	80	Canary # 102152	102152	1500698	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
37D	20	Cream #168050	168050	1500699	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
37E	40	Goldenrod # 102160	102160	1500724	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
37F	0	Gray #102178	102178	1500700	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
37G	40	Green # 102186	102186	1500701	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
37H	10	Ivory # 102285	102285	1500702	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
37I	0	Lilac # 102269	102269	1500740	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
37J	40	Orchid # 103804	103804	1500723	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
37K	80	Pink # 102368	102368	7500703	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
37L	30	Salmon # 102103	102103	7500704	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
37M	40	Tan # 102376	102376 <sup>23</sup>	7500705	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper

**North County Educational Purchasing Consortium**

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper  
 Bid No: P2020-11C

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District  
 Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216  
[maribel.suarez@smusd.org](mailto:maribel.suarez@smusd.org)

**SECTION B**

PRINT SHOP PAPER									
Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000 Sheets	Awarded Vendor
<b>38</b>		<b>Equivalent to BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP, Writing, Finish bond, 11 x17, Wt. 20 Colors listed No Sub</b>							
38a	0	Blue # 102137	102137	1500697	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
38B	0	Buff # 102145	102145	1500723	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
38C	0	Canary # 102152	102152	1500698	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
38D	0	Cream #168050	168050	1500699	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
38E	0	Goldenrod # 102160	102160	1500724	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
38F	0	Gray #102178	102178	1500700	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
38G	0	Green # 102186	102186	1500701	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
38H	0	Ivory # 102285	102285	1500702	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
38I	0	Lilac # 102269	102269	1500740	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
38J	0	Orchid # 103804	103804	1500723	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
38K	0	Pink # 102368	102368	7500703	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
38L	0	Salmon # 102103	102103	7500704	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
38M	0	Tan # 102376	102376	7500705	REAM	500	\$ 9.47	\$ 18.94	Spicers Paper
<b>39</b>	20	<b>BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP White #103291 or Equivalent, Writing, Finish bond,White, 8.5x14, Wt. 20, Brightness 96. No Sub</b>	IP Hammermill	1500810	REAM	500	\$ 6.40	\$ 12.80	Kelly Paper
<b>40</b>	0	<b>Equivalent to BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP White #103291 or Equivalent, Writing, Finish bond,White, 8.5x14, Wt. 20, Brightness 96.</b>	DA851420	1500820	CASE	5000	\$ 46.26	\$ 9.25	Spicers Paper
<b>41</b>	10	<b>BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP White #103192, Writing, Finish bond,Wt. 20, White, 11x17, Brightness 96.</b>	IP Hammermill	1500718	REAM	500	\$ 9.33	\$ 18.66	Kelly Paper
<b>42</b>	0	<b>Equivalent to BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP White #103192, Writing, Finish bond,Wt. 20, White, 11x17, Brightness 96</b>	DA111720	1500821	CASE	2500	\$ 36.37	\$ 14.55	Spicers Paper
<b>43</b>	0	<b>Opaque Domtar Husky # 5462 Offset, Finish smooth, White, 8.5x11, Wt. 60#, Brightness 94. No Sub</b>	5642	1301165	REAM	500	\$ 5.22	\$ 10.44	Spicers Paper
<b>44</b>	0	<b>Equivalent to Opaque Domtar Husky # 5462, Offset, Finish smooth, White, 8.5x11, Wt. 60#, Brightness 94.</b>	5642	1301165	REAM	500	\$ 5.22	\$ 10.44	Spicers Paper
CARBONLESS SETS (NCR, NO SUB)									
<b>45</b>	100	<b>Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5887, Carbonless, 2 parts, Canary /White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92. No Sub.</b>	5887	2500154	REAM	500	\$ 9.15	\$ 18.30	Spicers Paper
<b>46</b>	0	<b>Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5887, Carbonless, 2 parts, Canary /White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.</b>	5887	2500154	REAM	500	\$ 9.15	\$ 18.30	Spicers Paper
<b>47</b>	0	<b>Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5896, Carbonless, 2 parts, Pink/White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92. No sub</b>	5897	2500164	REAM	500	\$ 9.15	\$ 18.30	Spicers Paper
<b>48</b>	0	<b>Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5896, Carbonless, 2 parts, Pink/White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.</b>	5896	2500164	REAM	500	\$ 9.15	\$ 18.30	Spicers Paper

**North County Educational Purchasing Consortium**

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper  
 Bid No: P2020-11C

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District  
 Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216  
[maribel.suarez@smusd.org](mailto:maribel.suarez@smusd.org)

**SECTION B**

PRINT SHOP PAPER									
Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000 Sheets	Awarded Vendor
49	0	Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5900, Carbonless, 3 parts, Pink/Canary/White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92. No sub	5900	2500429	REAM	500	\$ 10.30	\$ 20.60	Spicers Paper
50	0	Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5900, Carbonless, 3 parts, Pink/Canary/White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.	5900	2500429	REAM	500	\$ 10.30	\$ 20.60	Spicers Paper
51	0	Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5915, Carbonless, 4 parts, Gold/Pink/Canary/White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92. No Sub	5915	2500276	REAM	500	\$ 11.00	\$ 22.00	Spicers Paper
52	0	Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5915, Carbonless, 4 parts, Gold/Pink/Canary/White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.	5915	2500276	REAM	500	\$ 11.00	\$ 22.00	Spicers Paper
CARBONLESS SETS (OTHER THAN NCR)									
53	30	Pre-collated, heavyweight, STRAIGHT Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5909, Carbonless, 3 parts, White/Canary/Pink, 8.5x11, Brightness white 92. No Sub	5909	2500173	PKG	500	\$ 10.30	\$ 20.60	Spicers Paper
54	0	Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight, STRAIGHT Sequence Appleton Superior # 5909, Carbonless, 3 parts, White/Canary/Pink, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.	5909	2500173	PKG	500	\$ 10.30	\$ 20.60	Spicers Paper
55	0	Pre-collated, heavyweight, STRAIGHT Sequence Appleton Superior # 5925, Carbonless, 4 parts, White/Canary/Pink/Gold, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92. No Sub	5925	2500277	PKG	500	\$ 11.00	\$ 22.00	Spicers Paper
56	0	Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight, STRAIGHT Sequence Appleton Superior # 5925, Carbonless, 4 parts, White/Canary/Pink/Gold, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.	5925	2500277	REAM	500	\$ 11.00	\$ 22.00	Spicers Paper
CARBONLESS SETS FOR USE IN HIGH-SPEED COPIER									
57	0	Pre-collated, REVERSE Sequence Glatfelter Excel One # 165571, Carbonless, 2 parts, Canary/White, 8.5x11, Wt. 20 No Sub	NO BID	NO BID	REAM	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
58	0	Equivalent to Pre-collated, REVERSE Sequence Glatfelter Excel One # 16557 Carbonless, 2 parts, Canary/White, 8.5x11, Wt. 20	5887	2500154	PKG	500	\$ 9.15	\$ 18.30	Spicers Paper
59	0	Pre-collated, Straight/ forward Sequence. Glatfelter Excel One # 16606 Carbonless, 3 parts, White/Canary/Pink, 8.5x11, Wt. 20 No sub	NO BID	NO BID	REAM	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
60	0	Equivalent to Pre-collated, Straight/ forward Sequence. Glatfelter Excel One # 16606 Carbonless, 3 parts, White/Canary/Pink, 8.5x11, Wt. 20	5909	2500173	PKG	500	\$ 10.38	\$ 20.60	Spicers Paper
ENVELOPES									
61	0	#10 REGULAR with gum seal Southland #10 , Finish woven, Wt. 24, White	72964	3005609	BX	500	\$ 9.34	\$ 18.68	Spicers Paper
62	0	Equivalent to #10 REGULAR with gum seal Southland #10 , Finish woven, Wt. 24, White	Printmaster	3006641	BX	500	\$ 7.10	\$ 14.20	Kelly Paper

**North County Educational Purchasing Consortium**

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper  
 Bid No: P2020-11C

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District  
 Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216  
[maribel.suarez@smusd.org](mailto:maribel.suarez@smusd.org)

**SECTION B**

PRINT SHOP PAPER									
Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000 Sheets	Awarded Vendor
63	0	#10 WINDOW with gum seal Southland #10P, Finish woven, Wt. 24, White	72970	3005621	BX	500	\$ 11.40	\$ 22.80	Spicers Paper
64	0	Equivalent to #10 WINDOW with gum seal Southland #10P, Finish woven, Wt. 24, White	Printmaster	3006646	BX	500	\$ 8.50	\$ 17.00	Kelly Paper
Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM		Roll Price		Awarded Vendor
MISCELLANEOUS									
65	0	Presentation Paper Kelly Paper #10033B, Presentation Paper, Finish digital white, Wt. 45#, 36"x100', Wide format, 2" Core, No Sub.	10033B	7000015	ROLL	1	\$ 56.10		Spicers Paper
66	0	Equivalent to Presentation Paper Kelly Paper #10033B, Presentation Paper, Finish digital white, Wt. 45#, 36"x100', Wide format, 2" Core	10033B	7000015	ROLL	1	\$ 56.10		Spicers Paper
67	0	Laminate, Pressure Sensitive, 4 mil, Finish matte, 38"x150'	Que-Media	7000959	ROLL		\$ 86.11		Kelly Paper
ADHESIVE									
Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Gallons Per Std. Pkg	Price Per Gallon	Price Per Case	Awarded Vendor
68	0	Fanapart High-Strength Padding Adhesive Special Cans Appleton # 2115. No Sub	2115	7503482	GAL	4	\$ 47.50	\$ 190.00	Spicers Paper
69	0	Equivalent to Fanapart High-Strength Padding Adhesive Special Cans Appleton # 2115.	2115	7503482	GAL	4	\$ 47.50	\$ 190.00	Spicers Paper