



North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

February 5, 2020

To: NCEPC President, Member and Associate Member Districts

From: San Marcos Unified School District, Maribel Suarez, Bid Administrator

RE: **AMENDMENT #1** – Xerographic & Print Shop Paper Bid, # P2019-15C

Changes

- **Correction to Pricing:**

A typo was made by the bid administrator on Line #46 awarded to Kelly Paper. The price sheet presented to the board for award on line #46 was \$9.90 for 500 sheet and \$18.90 for 1000 sheets. The price submitted by vendor on their bid was \$11.16 for 500 sheets and \$22.32 for 1000 sheets. Kelly Paper is still the low bidder for line #46.

- **Item Number Correction:**

Line#12 5320XX needs correction. Correct item should be SSS5320XXCS

RECOMMENDATION

Please approve the changes to make corrections as listed on this amendment. Replace bid pages with the corrected bid pages.

NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM

AWARDED VENDOR LIST

BID TITLE: XEROGRAPHIC & PRINT SHOP PAPER **SPONSORING DISTRICT:** San Marcos Unified School District

BID NUMBER: P2019-15C

DISTRICT CONTACT: Maribel Suarez, Buyer

Phone: (760) 752-1216 Fax: (760) 591-0907

DELIVERY: 10 Working Days on Case & Pallet, 21 Working Days on Carload Quantities

CONTRACT PERIOD: January 1, 2020 thru December 31, 2020

MINIMUM FREE FREIGHT - \$50.00

VENDOR NAME	ADDRESS	PHONE/FAX NUMBER WEBSITE	CONTACT NAME
Kelly Paper	1033 Cudahy Pl San Diego, CA 92110	800-675-3559 - Toll Free 844-979-7833 - Fax 619-422-1114 Chula Vista Office	Chuy Hernandez Sales Rep jesus.hernandez@kellypaper.com
Liberty Paper	5025 Hampton Street Los Angeles, CA 90058	866-507-2737 x2102-Toll Free 323-582-3434 Office - 323-973-4562	Kristen Perez Contract Administrator kristen@libertypp.com
Office Depot	6600 N Military Trail Boca Raton, FL 33496	888-263-3423 -Toll Free 562-426-9075 - Fax 858-705-3640 - Direct	Brad Moen Vertical Market Mgr-Public Sector-West brad.moen@officedepot.com
Southwest School Supply	3790 De Forest Circle Jurupa Valley, CA 91752	800-227-7159 - Toll Free 909-980-7159 - Fax	Aja Stickler Bid Manager biddesk@southwestschool.com
Veritiv	2005 Harmony Grove Rd Escondido, CA 92029	833-897-5773 - Toll Free 858-292-5914 - Fax	George Wasser Sales Rep George.Wasser@veritivcorp.com

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
Bid No: P2019-15C
 Amendment -1

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District
Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216
maribel.suarez@smusd.org

SECTION A

XEROGRAPHIC PAPER									
Item#	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	UOM	Mfr/Product Name	Vendor Stock #	Price per Case (10 reams per case)	Price per Pallet (see description for # of cases)	Price per Carload (21 pallets per carload)	Awarded Vendor
1	3417	Super Premium No. 4 high-speed multi-use dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 96% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	GLOBAL OFFICE PAPER	1500793	\$ 28.13			KELLY PAPER
	490		Pallet	GLOBAL OFFICE PAPER	1500793		\$ 1,060.00		KELLY PAPER
	24		Carload	MARQUEE	MAR811			\$ 20,924.40	LIBERTY PAPER
2	166	Super Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 14". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 96% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 30 cases in a pallet	Case	DOMTAR IMAGEPRINT	665773	\$ 43.06			OFFICE DEPOT
	2		Pallet	KELLY COPY DOMTAR	1500236		\$ 1,374.00		KELLY PAPER
	0		Carload	KELLY COPY DOMTAR	1500236			\$ 28,224.00	KELLY PAPER
3	4	Super Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11", 3 hole-drilled. Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 96% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	KELLY COPY DOMTAR	1500782	\$ 38.59			KELLY PAPER
	0		Pallet	KELLY COPY DOMTAR	1500782		\$ 1,489.60		KELLY PAPER
	0		Carload	KELLY COPY DOMTAR	1500782			\$ 30,256.80	KELLY PAPER
4	169	Super Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 11" x 17". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 96% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	DOMTAR IMAGEPRINT	665809	\$ 33.86			OFFICE DEPOT
	1		Pallet	KELLY COPY DOMTAR	1500237		\$ 1,440.00		KELLY PAPER
	0		Carload	KELLY COPY DOMTAR	1500237			\$ 29,568.00	KELLY PAPER
5	0	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Xerox #3R2047. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	XEROX VITALITY	275474	\$ 31.03			OFFICE DEPOT
	67		Pallet		3R2047		\$ 1,419.60		OFFICE DEPOT
	2		Carload		3R2047			\$ 28,131.60	OFFICE DEPOT
6	2684	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	GLOBAL OFFICE PAPER	1500793	\$ 28.13			KELLY PAPER
			Pallet	GLOBAL OFFICE PAPER	1500793	\$ 1,060.00			KELLY PAPER

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper

Bid No: P2019-15C

Amendment -1

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District

Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216

maribel.suarez@smusd.org

SECTION A

XEROGRAPHIC PAPER									
	4		Carload	PREMIER	PRE811W			\$ 20,496.00	LIBERTY PAPER
7	68	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 14". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Xerox #3R2051. No substitute. Bid Per Case Price. 30 cases in a pallet.	Case	XEROX VITALITY	345611	\$ 42.06			OFFICE DEPOT
	0		Pallet	XEROX	1500775		\$ 1,413.00		KELLY PAER
8	90	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 14". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 30 cases in a pallet	Case	BOISE X-9	196643	\$ 39.87			OFFICE DEPOT
	0		Pallet	BOISE X-9	OX9004-SKD-DA		\$ 1,244.70		OFFICE DEPOT
9	53	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11", 3 hole-drilled. Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Xerox #3R2641. No substitute. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	XEROX VITALITY	887547	\$ 33.09			OFFICE DEPOT
	0		Pallet	XEROX VITALITY	5322WE3H		\$ 1,530.40		SOUTHWEST
10	208	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic paper, white, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11", 3 hole-drilled. Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min. Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet.	Case	BOISE X-9	196589	\$ 33.27			OFFICE DEPOT
	30		Pallet	BOISE X-9	OX9001-P-SKD-DA		\$ 1,299.60		OFFICE DEPOT
11	221	Premium No. 4 high-speed xerographic dual purpose paper, white, 20#, 11" x 17". Designed for xerographic reproduction, also suitable for offset or spirit duplicating. Brightness: 92% min; Opacity: 88% min Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet.	Case	BOISE X-9	196652	\$ 31.28			OFFICE DEPOT
	0		Pallet	BOISE X-9	OX9007-SKD-DA		\$ 1,299.60		OFFICE DEPOT
12	1026	Premium No. 4 colored high-speed xerographic paper or xerographic bond, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11". Bid Per Case Price. 40 cases in a pallet	Case	DOMTAR	5320XXCS BLUE BUFF CANARY GOLDEN ROD GREEN GRAY IVORY PINK SALMON TAN CREAM ORCHID CHERRY	\$ 43.49			SOUTHWEST
	0		Pallet	COLORWORKS	BLUE CANARY GOLDEN ROD GREEN PINK		\$ 1,556.00		LIBERTY PAPER

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper

Bid No: P2019-15C

Amendment -1

SECTION A

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District

Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216

maribel.suarez@smusd.org

XEROGRAPHIC PAPER									
13	135	PREMIUM COLORED- ATTACHMENT WITH COLORS AND PART #'S Premium No. 4 colored xerographic paper or xerographic bond, pastel colors, 20#, 8 1/2" x 11". PriceXerox only. No Substitute. Bid Per Case. 40 cases in a pallet.	Case	XEROX VITALITY COLOR	BLUE-345637 YELLOW-345660 GREEN-345645 IVORY-345694 PINK-345652 GOLDEN ROD-345686 *Must order in multiples of 10 to receive the unit of measure per case.	\$ 38.56			OFFICE DEPOT
	86		Pallet	XEROX	VARIOUS 5321XX		\$ 1,748.00		SOUTHWEST
14	5	Premium No. 4 xerographic paper or xerographic bond, pastels colors, 20#, 8 1/2" x 14". Xerox only. No Substitute Bid Per Case Price. 30 cases in a pallet. *Must order in multiples of 10 to receive the unit of measure per case, example 50 each = 5 case.	Case	XEROX VITALITY COLOR	BLUE-345710 IVORY-345777 GREEN-345728 PINK-345736 GOLDENROD-345769 *Must order in multiples of 10 to receive the unit of measure per case.	\$ 50.00			OFFICE DEPOT
	0		Pallet				NO BID		
15	1	Premium No. 4 xerographic paper or xerographic bond, pastels colors, 20#, 8 1/2" x 14". Bid Per Case Price. 30 cases per pallet.	Case	IP HAMMERMILL	BLUE-1500691 CANARY-1500692 CREAM-1500809 GOLDEN ROD-1500693 GREEN- 1500694 ORCHID- 1500214 IVORY-1500295 PINK-1500696	\$ 75.50			KELLY PAPER
	0		Pallet	IP HAMMERMILL	BLUE-1500691 CANARY-1500692 CREAM-1500809 GOLDEN ROD-1500693 GREEN- 1500694 ORCHID- 1500214 IVORY-1500295 PINK-1500696		\$ 2,122.50		KELLY PAPER

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
Bid No: P2019-15C
 Amendment -1

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District
Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216
maribel.suarez@smusd.org

SECTION B

PRINT SHOP PAPER

Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000 Sheets	Awarded Vendor
4		Equivalent to Boise Fireworx, Text, Wt. 24/60, 8.5x11, Finish Smooth Colors	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4A	2,500	Crackling Canary	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4B	2,500	Bottle Rocket Blue	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4C	2,500	Popper-Mint Green	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4D	2,500	Echo Orchid	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
5		Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ COLORS, Text, 11x17, Wt. 60#, Smooth Finish, Colors No Sub	ASTROBRIGHT						
5A	2,500	Cosmic Orange #22653	22653	1302752	REAM	500	\$ 15.87	\$ 31.74	KELLY PAPER
5B	2,500	Fireball Fuchsia #22683	22683	22683	CASE	2500	\$ 79.35	\$ 31.74	KELLY PAPER
5C	2,500	Gamma Green #22543	22543	1302766	REAM	500	\$ 15.87	\$ 31.74	KELLY PAPER
5D	2,500	Lift-Off Lemon #22633	21013	1302991	REAM	500	\$ 15.87	\$ 31.74	KELLY PAPER
5E	10,000	Lunar Blue #22523	22523	1302771	REAM	500	\$ 15.87	\$ 31.74	KELLY PAPER
5F	7,500	Orbit Orange #22563	22563	1302770	REAM	500	\$ 15.87	\$ 31.74	KELLY PAPER
5G	2,500	Pulsar Pink #22623	21033	1302997	REAM	500	\$ 15.87	\$ 31.74	KELLY PAPER
5H	7,500	Re-Entry Red #22553	22553	1302782	REAM	500	\$ 15.87	\$ 31.74	KELLY PAPER
5I	2,500	Solar Yellow #22533	22533	1302790	REAM	500	\$ 15.87	\$ 31.74	KELLY PAPER
5J	3,500	Terra Green #22583	25583	1302801	REAM	500	\$ 15.87	\$ 31.74	KELLY PAPER
5K	2,500	Terrestrial Teal #22473	21873	1302803	REAM	500	\$ 15.87	\$ 31.74	KELLY PAPER
6		Equivalent to Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™ COLORS, Text, 11x17, Wt. 60#, Smooth Finish, Colors	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6A	12,500	Cosmic Orange #22653	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6B	12,500	Fireball Fuchsia #22683	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6C	12,500	Gamma Green #22543	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6D	12,500	Lift-Off Lemon #22633	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6E	5,000	Lunar Blue #22523	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6F	3,750	Orbit Orange #22563	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6G	1,250	Pulsar Pink #22623	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6H	3,750	Re-Entry Red #22553	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6I	1,250	Solar Yellow #22533	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6J	1,750	Terra Green #22583	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6K	1,250	Terrestrial Teal #22473	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7		Wausau Paper, Text, Wt. 60#, Vellum Finish, 8.5x11, Opaque Colors No Sub	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7A	1,000	Gold #62411	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7B	1,000	Gray #62401	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7C	1,000	Ivory #62351	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8		Equivalent to Wausau Paper, Text, Wt. 60#, Vellum Finish, 8.5x11, Opaque Colors Or Equivalent							
8A	500	Gold #62411	IP SPRING HAMMERMILL 24037	1301449	REAM	500	\$ 6.40	\$ 12.80	KELLY PAPER
8B	500	Gray #62401	SPRING HAMMERMILL	10002060	REAM	500	\$ 5.56	\$ 11.12	VERITIV
8C	500	Ivory #62351	SPRING HAMMERMILL	10002057	REAM	500	\$ 5.56	\$ 11.12	VERITIV
9		Astroparche, Neenah Paper, Text, 8.5x11, Wt. 60#, Vellum Finish, Color Blue, Item #27141 No sub	ASTROBRIGHT	200241	REAM	500	\$ 11.57	\$ 23.14	KELLY PAPER

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
Bid No: P2019-15C
 Amendment -1

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District
Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216
maribel.suarez@smusd.org

SECTION B

PRINT SHOP PAPER

Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000 Sheets	Awarded Vendor	
18I	32,500	Orbit Orange #22761	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
18J	1,000	Plasma Pink #22129	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
18K	6,500	Planetary Purple #22871	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
18L	65,000	Pulsar Pink #22821	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
18M	40,000	Re-Entry Red #22751	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
18N	2,000	Rocket Red #22841	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
9O	69,000	Solar Yellow #22731	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
18P	6,500	Sunburst Yellow #22791	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
18Q	9,000	Terra Green #22781	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
18R	1,000	Terrestrial Teal #22109	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
19		Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™, Cover, Wt. 65#, Finish smooth, 23x35, Colors listed, No sub	NEENAH ASTROBRIGHT							
19A	500	Lunar Blue #22724	22724	3102702	PKG	100	\$ 27.00	\$ 270.00	KELLY PAPER	
19B	500	Re-Entry Red #22754	22754	1302716	PKG	100	\$ 27.00	\$ 270.00	KELLY PAPER	
19C	500	Solar Yellow #22734	22734	1302724	PKG	100	\$ 27.00	\$ 270.00	KELLY PAPER	
19D	74,500	Terra Green #22784	22784	1302740	PKG	100	\$ 27.00	\$ 270.00	KELLY PAPER	
20		Equivalent to Wausau Paper ASTROBRIGHTS™, Cover, Wt. 65#, Finish smooth, 23x35, Colors listed.	NO BID							
20A	250	Lunar Blue #22724	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
20B	250	Re-Entry Red #22754	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
20C	250	Solar Yellow #22734	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
20D	37,250	Terra Green #22784	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
21		Int. Paper Springhill #016000 or Wausau, Paper Exact Vellum Cover, 8.5 x 11 White, Wt. 67#, Finish Vellom Bristol, Brightness 92, Bristol #82211 No Sub	IP 01600							
	578,750		IP 01600	1301693	PKG	250	\$ 4.58	\$ 18.32	KELLY PAPER	
22		Equivalent to Int. Paper Springhill #016000 or Wausau, Paper Exact Vellum Cover, 8.5 x 11 White, Wt. 67#, Finish Vellom Bristol, Brightness 92, Bristol #82211	DOMTAR 82880							
	289,375		DOMTAR 82880	5335WE	PKG	250	\$ 4.76	\$ 19.04	SOUTHWEST	
23		Int. Paper Springhill, Cover, Wt.67#, Finish Vellom Bristol, 8.5x11, Colors listed. No Sub	IP							
23A	686,000	Blue #026000	26000	1301694	PKG	250	\$ 4.54	\$ 18.16	KELLY PAPER	
23B	586,000	Canary #036000	36000	1301700	PKG	250	\$ 4.54	\$ 18.16	KELLY PAPER	
23C	2,000	Cream #097000	97000	1301701	PKG	250	\$ 4.54	\$ 18.16	KELLY PAPER	
23D	46,000	Goldenrod #086000	86008	1301695	PKG	250	\$ 4.54	\$ 18.16	KELLY PAPER	
23E	485,000	Green #046000	46000	1301438	PKG	250	\$ 4.54	\$ 18.16	KELLY PAPER	
23F	70,000	Ivory #056000	56000	1301697	PKG	250	\$ 4.54	\$ 18.16	KELLY PAPER	
23G	48,000	Gray #066000	66000	1301696	PKG	250	\$ 4.54	\$ 18.16	KELLY PAPER	
23H	48,000	Orchid #057000	57000	1301717	PKG	250	\$ 4.54	\$ 18.16	KELLY PAPER	
23I	202,000	Pink #076000	76000	1301698	PKG	250	\$ 4.54	\$ 18.16	KELLY PAPER	
23J	6,000	Tan #096000	96000	1301699	PKG	250	\$ 4.54	\$ 18.16	KELLY PAPER	
24		Equivalent to Int. Paper Springhill, Cover, Wt.67#, Finish Vellom Bristol, 8.5x11, Colors listed.	DOMTAR							
24A	343,000	Blue #026000	81042	5335BE	CASE	2000	\$ 34.46	\$ 17.23	SOUTHWEST	
24B	293,000	Canary #036000	81044	5335CY	CASE	2000	\$ 34.46	\$ 17.23	SOUTHWEST	
24C	1,000	Cream #097000	81212	5335CM	CASE	2000	\$ 34.46	\$ 17.23	SOUTHWEST	

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
 Bid No: P2019-15C

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District
 Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216
maribel.suarez@smusd.org

Amendment -1
SECTION B

PRINT SHOP PAPER									
Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000 Sheets	Awarded Vendor
24D	23,000	Goldenrod #086000	81057	5335GD	CASE	2000	\$ 34.46	\$ 17.23	SOUTHWEST
24E	242,500	Green #046000	81040	5335GN	CASE	2000	\$ 34.46	\$ 17.23	SOUTHWEST
24F	35,000	Ivory #056000	81046	5335IY	CASE	2000	\$ 34.46	\$ 17.23	SOUTHWEST
24G	24,000	Gray #066000	81043	5335GY	CASE	2000	\$ 34.46	\$ 17.23	SOUTHWEST
24H	24,000	Orchid #057000	82890	5335OD	CASE	2000	\$ 34.46	\$ 17.23	SOUTHWEST
24I	100,000	Pink #076000	81041	5335OD	CASE	2000	\$ 34.46	\$ 17.23	SOUTHWEST
24J	6,000	Tan #096000	81060	5335TN	CASE	2000	\$ 34.46	\$ 17.23	SOUTHWEST
25		Int. Paper Springhill, Cover, Wt. 67#, Finish Vellum Bristol, 11x17, Colors listed. No Sub							
25A	4,000	Blue #026004	IP SPRINGHILL	10002322	PKG	250	\$ 10.00	\$ 40.00	VERITIV
25B	4,000	Canary #036004	IP SPRINGHILL	10002320	PKG	250	\$ 10.00	\$ 40.00	VERITIV
25C	4,000	Green #046004	IP SPRINGHILL	10002323	PKG	250	\$ 10.00	\$ 40.00	VERITIV
26		Equivalent to Int. Paper Springhill, Cover, Wt. 67#, Finish Vellum Bristol, 11x17, Colors listed.							
26A	2,000	Blue #026004	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
26B	2,000	Canary #036004	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
26C	2,000	Green #046004	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
27	10,000	Color Copy Digital Photo White, Cover, Wt. 60#, Finish smooth, 8.5x11, Brightness 100, Int. Paper Hammermill # 122549 No Sub	IP HAMMERMILL	10003508	PKG	250	\$ 6.39	\$ 27.56	VERITIV
28	5,000	Equivalent to Color Copy Digital Photo White, Cover, Wt. 60#, Finish smooth, 8.5x11, Brightness 100, Int. Paper Hammermill # 122549	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
29	18,000	Color Copy Digital Cover, Finish Vellum Bristol, Wt. 80#, White, 11x17, Brightness 100, Int. Paper Hammermill #120037 No Sub	IP HAMMERMILL	10426154	PKG	250	\$ 19.43	\$ 77.72	VERITIV
30	9,000	Equivalent to Color Copy Digital Cover, Finish Vellum Bristol, Wt. 80#, White, 11x17, Brightness 100, Int. Paper Hammermill #120037	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
31		Int. Paper Springhill Colors or Equivalent, Index Digital, Wt. 90#, Finish Bristol, 8.5x11, Colors as listed. No Sub	A S						
31A	6,000	Cherry #075100		1000221	PKG	250	\$ 5.31	\$ 21.24	VERITIV
31B	12,000	Salmon #085100		1000222	PKG	250	\$ 5.31	\$ 21.24	VERITIV
32		Equivalent to Int. Paper Springhill Colors or Equivalent, Index Digital, Wt. 90#, Finish Bristol, 8.5x11, Colors as listed.	DOMTAR						
32A	3,000	Cherry #075100	81055	5360CHY	PK	250	\$ 4.89	\$ 19.56	SOUTHWEST
32B	6,000	Salmon #085100	81053	5360SN	PK	250	\$ 4.89	\$ 19.56	SOUTHWEST
33	50,000	Int. Paper Springhill # 015101 or Equivalent, Index Digital, White, Finish Smooth, Wt. 90#, 8.5x11, brightness 92. No Sub	A S	10077328	PKG	250	\$ 5.05	\$ 20.20	VERITIV
34	25,000	Equivalent to Int. Paper Springhill # 015101 or Equivalent, Index Digital, White, Finish Smooth, Wt. 90#, 8.5x11, brightness 92.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
WRITING									
35		BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP, Writing, Finish bond, 8.5 x11, Wt. 20 Colors listed No Sub	A S						
35A	146,000	Blue # 103309		100035465001	REAM	500	\$ 4.56	\$ 9.12	VERITIV

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper

Bid No: P2019-15C

Amendment -1

SECTION B

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District

Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216

maribel.suarez@smusd.org

PRINT SHOP PAPER									
Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000 Sheets	Awarded Vendor
35B	35,000	Buff # 103325		100035485001	REAM	500	\$ 4.56	\$ 9.12	VERITIV
35C	390,000	Canary # 103341		100035495001	REAM	500	\$ 4.56	\$ 9.12	VERITIV
35D	5,000	Cherry # 102210		100035515001	REAM	500	\$ 4.56	\$ 9.12	VERITIV
35E	15,000	Cream # 168030		100085185	REAM	500	\$ 4.56	\$ 9.12	VERITIV
35F	40,000	Goldenrod # 103168		10003552	REAM	500	\$ 4.56	\$ 9.12	VERITIV
35G	165,000	Green # 103366		100035555001	REAM	500	\$ 4.56	\$ 9.12	VERITIV
35H	20,000	Ivory # 103176		100035575001	REAM	500	\$ 4.56	\$ 9.12	VERITIV
35I	10,000	Lilac # 102269		10003560	REAM	500	\$ 4.56	\$ 9.12	VERITIV
35J	20,000	Orchid # 103770		100035595001	REAM	500	\$ 4.56	\$ 9.12	VERITIV
35K	140,000	Pink # 103382		100035615001	REAM	500	\$ 4.56	\$ 9.12	VERITIV
35L	20,000	Salmon # 103119		100035625001	REAM	500	\$ 4.56	\$ 9.12	VERITIV
35M	20,000	Tan # 102863		100035645001	REAM	500	\$ 4.56	\$ 9.12	VERITIV
35N	10,000	Turquoise # 103820		10003565	REAM	500	\$ 4.56	\$ 9.12	VERITIV
36		Equivalent to BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP, Writing, Finish bond, 8.5 x11, Wt. 20 Colors listed	DOMTAR						
36A	73,000	Blue # 103309	81199	5320BE	RAEM	500	\$ 4.40	\$ 8.80	SOUTHWEST
36B	17,500	Buff # 103325	81204	5320BF	RAEM	500	\$ 4.40	\$ 8.80	SOUTHWEST
36C	195,000	Canary # 103341	81196	5320CY	RAEM	500	\$ 4.40	\$ 8.80	SOUTHWEST
36D	2,500	Cherry # 102210	81205	5320CHY	RAEM	500	\$ 4.40	\$ 8.80	SOUTHWEST
36E	7,500	Cream # 168030	81207	DOM81207	RAEM	500	\$ 4.40	\$ 8.80	SOUTHWEST
36F	20,000	Goldenrod # 103168	81203	5320GD	RAEM	500	\$ 4.40	\$ 8.80	SOUTHWEST
36G	82,500	Green # 103366	81197	5320GN	RAEM	500	\$ 4.40	\$ 8.80	SOUTHWEST
36H	10,000	Ivory # 103176	81201	5320IY	RAEM	500	\$ 4.40	\$ 8.80	SOUTHWEST
36I	5,000	Lilac # 102269	81200	5320OD	RAEM	500	\$ 4.40	\$ 8.80	SOUTHWEST
36J	10,000	Orchid # 103770	81200	5320OD	RAEM	500	\$ 4.40	\$ 8.80	SOUTHWEST
36K	70,000	Pink # 103382	81198	5320PK	RAEM	500	\$ 4.40	\$ 8.80	SOUTHWEST
36L	10,000	Salmon # 103119	81206	5320SN	RAEM	500	\$ 4.40	\$ 8.80	SOUTHWEST
36M	10,000	Tan # 102863	81202	5320TN	RAEM	500	\$ 4.40	\$ 8.80	SOUTHWEST
36N	5,000	Turquoise # 103820	103820	5320TE	RAEM	500	\$ 4.40	\$ 8.80	SOUTHWEST
37	5,000	BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP White #103291 or Equivalent, Writing, Finish bond,White, 8.5x14, Wt. 20, Brightness 96. No Sub	A S	103057415001	REAM	500	\$ 5.60	\$ 11.20	VERITIV
38	2,500	Equivalent to BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP White #103291 or Equivalent, Writing, Finish bond,White, 8.5x14, Wt. 20, Brightness 96.	KELLY COPY 19922 DOMTAR	1500236	CASE	5000	\$ 53.70	\$ 10.74	KELLY PAPER
39	115,000	BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP White #103192, Writing, Finish bond,Wt. 20, White, 11x17, Brightness 96.	IP HAMMERMILL 103192	1500718	REAM	500	\$ 9.33	\$ 18.66	KELLY PAPER
40	57,500	Equivalent to BOND/COPY Int. Paper Hammermill Fore MP White #103192, Writing, Finish bond,Wt. 20, White, 11x17, Brightness 96	KELLY COPY DOMTAR 1923	1500237	CASE	2500	\$ 37.30	\$ 14.92	KELLY PAPER
41	20,000	Opaque Domtar Husky # 5462 Offset, Finish smooth, White, 8.5x11, Wt. 60#, Brightness 94. No Sub	HUSKY 5462	1301165	REAM	500	\$ 5.36	\$ 10.72	
42	10,000	Equivalent to Opaque Domtar Husky # 5462, Offset, Finish smooth, White, 8.5x11, Wt. 60#, Brightness 94.	STARBRITE	10911409	REAM	500	\$ 4.93	\$ 9.86	VERITIV

CARBONLESS SETS (NCR, NO SUB)

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
 Bid No: P2019-15C
 Amendment -1

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District
 Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216
maribel.suarez@smusd.org

SECTION B

PRINT SHOP PAPER									
Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000 Sheets	Awarded Vendor
43	80,000	Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5887, Carbonless, 2 parts, Canary /White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92. No Sub.	NCR SUPERIOR 5880	2500147	REAM	500	\$ 9.80	\$ 19.80	KELLY PAPER
44	40,000	Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5887, Carbonless, 2 parts, Canary /White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.	PIXELLE EXCELONE	10558131	REAM	500	\$ 9.50	\$ 19.00	VERITIV
45	5,000	Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5896, Carbonless, 2 parts, Pink/White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92. No sub	NCR SUPERIOR 5896	2500164	REAM	500	\$ 9.80	\$ 19.80	KELLY PAPER
45	2,500	Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5896, Carbonless, 2 parts, Pink/White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
46	125,000	Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5900, Carbonless, 3 parts, Pink/Canary/White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92. No sub	NCR SUPERIOR 5901	2500160	REAM	500	\$ 11.16	\$ 22.32	KELLY PAPER
47	62,500	Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5900, Carbonless, 3 parts, Pink/Canary/White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
48	25,000	Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5915, Carbonless, 4 parts, Gold/Pink/Canary/White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92. No Sub	NCR SUPERIOR 9915	2500276	REAM	500	\$ 11.91	\$ 23.82	KELLY PAPER
49	12,500	Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight, REVERSE Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5915, Carbonless, 4 parts, Gold/Pink/Canary/White, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.	PIXELLE EXCELONE	10558954	REAM	500	\$ 11.42	\$ 22.84	VERITIV

CARBONLESS SETS (OTHER THAN NCR)

50	13,000	Pre-collated, heavyweight, STRAIGHT Sequence Appleton NCR Superior # 5909, Carbonless, 3 parts, White/Canary/Pink, 8.5x11, Brightness white 92. No Sub	NCR SUPERIOR 5909	2500173	PKG	500	\$ 11.16	\$ 22.32	KELLY PAPER
51	6,500	Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight, STRAIGHT Sequence Appleton Superior # 5909, Carbonless, 3 parts, White/Canary/Pink, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
52	10,000	Pre-collated, heavyweight, STRAIGHT Sequence Appleton Superior # 5925, Carbonless, 4 parts, White/Canary/Pink/Gold, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92. No Sub	NCR SUPERIOR 5925	2500277	PKG	500	\$ 11.91	\$ 23.82	KELLY PAPER
53	5,000	Equivalent to Pre-collated, heavyweight, STRAIGHT Sequence Appleton Superior # 5925, Carbonless, 4 parts, White/Canary/Pink/Gold, 8.5x11, Brightness White 92.	PIXELLE EXCELONE	10559002	REAM	500	\$ 11.42	\$ 22.84	VERITIV

CARBONLESS SETS FOR USE IN HIGH-SPEED COPIER

54	30,000	Pre-collated, REVERSE Sequence Glatfelter Excel One # 165571, Carbonless, 2 parts, Canary/White, 8.5x11, Wt. 20 No Sub	PIXELLE EXCELONE	10558131	REAM	500	\$ 9.50	\$ 19.00	VERITIV
----	--------	--	------------------	----------	------	-----	---------	----------	---------

North County Educational Purchasing Consortium

Bid Title: Xerographic & Print Shop Paper
 Bid No: P2019-15C
 Amendment -1

Sponsoring District: San Marcos Unified School District
 Bid Administrator: Maribel Suarez (760)752-1216
maribel.suarez@smusd.org

SECTION B

PRINT SHOP PAPER									
Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Sheets Per Std. Pkg	Standard Pkg Price	Price Per 1,000 Sheets	Awarded Vendor
55	15,000	Equivalent to Pre-collated, REVERSE Sequence Glatfelter Excel One # 16557 Carbonless, 2 parts, Canary/White, 8.5x11, Wt. 20	NCR SUPERIOR 5888	2500147	PKG	500	\$ 9.90	\$ 19.80	KELLY PAPER
56	40,000	Pre-collated, Straight/ forward Sequence. Glatfelter Excel One # 16606 Carbonless, 3 parts, White/Canary/Pink, 8.5x11, Wt. 20 No sub	PIXELLE EXCELONE	10558961	REAM	500	\$ 10.68	\$ 21.36	VERITIV
57	20,000	Equivalent to Pre-collated, Straight/ forward Sequence. Glatfelter Excel One # 16606 Carbonless, 3 parts, White/Canary/Pink, 8.5x11, Wt. 20	NCR SUPERIOR 5909	2500173	PKG	500	\$ 11.16	\$ 22.32	KELLY PAPER

ENVELOPES

58	52,500	#10 REGULAR with gum seal Southland #10 , Finish woven, Wt. 24, White	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
59	26,250	Equivalent to #10 REGULAR with gum seal Southland #10 , Finish woven, Wt. 24, White	COLORBRITE	1326010	BX	500	\$ 7.18	\$ 14.36	SOUTHWEST
60	52,500	#10 WINDOW with gum seal Southland #10P, Finish woven, Wt. 24, White	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
61	26,250	Equivalent to #10 WINDOW with gum seal Southland #10P, Finish woven, Wt. 24, White	COLORBRITE	1327010W	BX	500	\$ 8.58	\$ 17.16	SOUTHWEST
Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM		Roll Price		Awarded Vendor

MISCELLANEOUS

62	6	Presentation Paper Kelly Paper #10033B, Presentation Paper, Finish digital white, Wt. 45#, 36"x100', Wide format, 2" Core, No Sub.	ALAMEDA KELLY PRESENTATION	70000015	ROLL		\$ 56.40		KELLY PAPER
63	3	Equivalent to Presentation Paper Kelly Paper #10033B, Presentation Paper, Finish digital white, Wt. 45#, 36"x100', Wide format, 2" Core	RB CONRESTING 46 COATED BOND	10650341	ROLL		\$ 46.50		VERITIV
64	8	Laminate, Pressure Sensitive, 4 mil, Finish matte, 38"x150'	QUEMEDIA	7000015	ROLL		\$ 103.80		KELLY PAPER

ADHESIVE

Item No.	Estimated Usage	Item Specification/Description	Mfr/Brand #	Vendor Stock #	Std. Pkg UOM	# Of Gallons Per Std. Pkg	Price Per Gallon	Price Per Case	Awarded Vendor
65	180	Fanapart High-Strength Padding Adhesive Special Cans Appleton # 2115. No Sub	FANAPART 2115 APPLETON	7503482	GAL	1	\$ 191.35	\$ 765.54	KELLY PAPER
66	90	Equivalent to Fanapart High-Strength Padding Adhesive Special Cans Appleton # 2115.	PRESSLINE ALLIED	7503614	GAL	1	\$ 60.70	\$ 242.70	KELLY PAPER