

## AMENDMENT NO. 2

Date: July 29, 2019

To: NCEPC Members and Associate Members

From: Hali Smalley, Bid Administrator  
San Marcos Unified School District

RE: K-6 Elementary Art Supplies Bid, #P2018-04C

---

### Corrections to Vendor Stock Numbers

**Line Item # 53, Paper, Construction, 9" x 12", Assorted Colors:** Vendor stock number error corrected to 338855

**Line Item # 53, Paper, Construction, 9" x 12", Light Green:** Vendor stock number error corrected to 338343

### Discontinued Item

**Line Item #53, Paper, Construction, 9" x 12", Light Red:** Manufacturer Pacon discontinued this color in October, 2015. Awarded Vendor Office Depot provided notification on June 4, 2019, that they depleted their stock of this color. The Light Red color for this item is discontinued without replacement. No other bids were received for this item.

### Change to Vendor Contact

Awarded Vendor List reflects new Office Depot contact Brad Moen.

**RECOMMENDATION** Please approve the changes as listed on this amendment.

**AMENDMENT NO. 1**

Date: March 27, 2019

Sent Via Email

To: NCEPC Members and Associate Members

From: Hali Smalley, Bid Administrator  
San Marcos Unified School District

RE: K-6 Elementary Art Supplies Bid, #P2018-04C

---

**Line #19, Modeling Clay:**

School Specialty has discontinued School Smart item 00750, and has replaced it with Dixon Prang item #740, at the same price of \$0.78.

NOTE: I have also updated contact names for Nasco and School Specialty on the Awarded Vendor List.

Revised Bid Award and Awarded Vendor Lists are attached reflecting these changes.

If you have any questions, please call me at (760) 752-1217.

# NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM

## AWARDED VENDOR LIST

**BID TITLE:** K-6 ELEMENTARY ART SUPPLIES

**SPONSORING DISTRICT:** San Marcos Unified School District

**BID NUMBER:** P2018-04C

**DISTRICT CONTACT:** Hali Smalley, Sr. Buyer

Phone: (760) 752-1217 Fax: (760) 591-0907

**CONTRACT PERIOD:** Jan. 1, 2019 - Dec. 31, 2019

**MINIMUM FREE FREIGHT:** \$50.00

VENDOR NAME	ADDRESS	PHONE/FAX NUMBER WEBSITE	CONTACT NAME
Nasco	901 Janesville Ave. Ft. Atkinson, WI 53538 <b>Must Reference Quote #43238</b>	800-558-9595 800-372-1236 - Fax 920-568-5550 - Direct	Michelle Au Interim Contract Sales Supervisor <a href="mailto:mau@enasco.com">mau@enasco.com</a>
Office Depot	6600 N Military Trail  Boca Raton, FL 33496	888-777-4044  858-353-0489 - Fax 858-705-3640 -Direct	Brad Moen Vertical Market Manager-Public Sector Partnerships-West <a href="mailto:brad.moen@officedepot.com">brad.moen@officedepot.com</a>
School Specialty	PO Box 1579 Appleton, WI 54912-1579 <b>Must Reference Bid #7789063848</b>	888-388-3224 - Toll Free 888-388-6344 - Fax 760-484-1025 - Direct Cell	Egbert Oostburg Territory Sales Manager <a href="mailto:egbert.oostburg@schoolspecialty.com">egbert.oostburg@schoolspecialty.com</a>
Southwest School & Office Supply	3790 De Forest Circle Jurupa Valley, CA 91752	800-227-7159 - Toll Free 909-980-7159 - Fax 909-980-7777 - Direct	Aja Stickler Bid Manager <a href="mailto:aja@southwestschool.com">aja@southwestschool.com</a>

## NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM - BID AWARD

BID TITLE: K-6 ELEMENTARY ART SUPPLIES	SPONSORING DISTRICT: SAN MARCOS UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT	MINIMUM: FREE SHIPPING \$50.00
BID NUMBER: P2018-04C	DISTRICT CONTACT: HALI SMALLEY	LIQUIDATED DAMAGES: 2.5% PER DAY
CONTRACT PERIOD: 01-01-19 through 12-31-19	PH: (760) 752-1217 FAX: (760) 591-0907	DELIVERY: 14 CALENDAR DAYS A.R.O.

ITEM NO.	ESTIMATED USAGE	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION	Vendor	Manufacturer & Mfg Model #	Vendor Stock #	Price
1	50	Doz	Brushes, art enamel, 1", Imperial #3160-1	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	Z31601	\$4.250
2	6	Doz	Brushes, easel, size 1/4", Crayola #1261-004, Imperial #3261-SP4, School Smart	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	Z3261SP04	\$2.240
3	500	Doz	Brushes, easel, size 1/2", Imperial #3261-SP12, School Smart	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	Z3261SP12	\$2.720
4	75	Doz	Brushes, easel, size 5/8", long handle, Imperial #3261-SP16,	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	Z3261SP16	\$3.900
5	75	Doz	Brushes, easel, size 3/4", Imperial #3261-SP18, School Smart	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	Z3261SP18	\$3.660
6	60	Doz	Brushes, easel, size 1, Imperial #3261-SP20	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	Z3261SP20	\$4.100
7	60	Doz	Brushes, water color, camel hair, size 2, Imperial #3127-2, School Smart 248306	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	Z312702	\$0.910
8	6	Doz	Brushes, water color, camel hair, size 3, Imperial #3127-3, School Smart	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	Z312703	\$1.540
9	5	Doz	Brushes, water color, camel hair, size 4, Imperial #3127-4, School Smart 248307	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	Z312704	\$1.390
10	1	Doz	Brushes, water color, camel hair, size 6, Imperial #3127-6, School Smart 248308	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	Z312706	\$1.360
11	10	Doz	Brushes, water color, camel hair, size 7, Imperial #3127-7	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	Z312707	\$2.380
12	35	Doz	Brushes, water color, camel hair, size 8, Imperial #3127-8, School Smart	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	Z312708	\$1.820
13	30	Doz	Brushes, water color, camel hair, size 9, Imperial #3127-9	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	Z312709	\$2.630
14	30	Doz	Brushes, water color, camel hair, size 10, Imperial #3127-10, School Smart 248310	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	Z312710	\$2.290
15	50	Doz	Brushes, water color, camel hair, size 12, Imperial #3127-12, School Smart 248311	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	Z312712	\$2.760
16	75	Box	Chalk, colored, 3-3/16" x 7/16", assorted, 12 colors/box, Prang Ambrite #53012, BIN #51-0403 AST, Sargent 22-4132, Art & Craft MSDS (removed School Smart 248311)	NASCO	SARGENT 22-4132	9728181	\$1.350
17	15	Box	Chalk, colored, oversized 4" x1", 12 assorted color set, Prang Freart #15360, Art & Craft MSDS	SOUTHWEST	PRANG 15360	915360	\$9.400

ITEM NO.	ESTIMATED USAGE	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION	Vendor	Manufacturer & Mfg Model #	Vendor Stock #	Price	
18	25	Box	Charcoal squares, 12/box, charcoal vine, 2-1/2' X 3/8" sticks, Sargent SMI #4115	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SARGENT 22-4115	410239	\$3.100	
19	1,100	Each	Clay, modeling, four 1/4lb sticks/box, permanently pliable, 4 colors red, green, blue, yellow, individually wrapped sticks, Dixon #740, Crayola #206, School Smart, Art & Craft MSDS	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	DIXON PRANG #740	221532	\$0.780	
20	15	Box	Clay, low fire, Cone 6, moist, red, 50 lb/box, Laguna #EM207, Imperial #3360RD, Sax, Amaco Sedona #67 AP Non-Toxic Label Required, Art & Craft MSDS	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SAX 45027M	400237	\$13.010	
21	85	Box	Clay, low fire, Cone 6, moist, white, 50 lb/box, Sax, Laguna #EM210, Imperial #3360WE, AP Non-Toxic Label Required, Art & Craft MSDS	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SAX 45147T	200366	\$14.110	
22	587	Box	Crayons, 4" x 7/16" Large Primary Multicultural flesh tone, 8 colors/box, BIN #52-080W, Dixon #38020, Art & Craft MSDS	OFFICE DEPOT	CRAYOLA 52-080W	949206	\$0.640	
23	1600	Box	Crayons, 3-5/8" x 5/16" Multicultural flesh tone, standard size, 8 colors/box, BIN #52-008W, Dixon #38018, Art & Craft MSDS	OFFICE DEPOT	CRAYOLA 52-008W	949164	\$0.320	
24	25,847	Box	Crayons, 4" x 7/16", Large Primary, 8 assorted colors/box, Crayola BIN #52-0080, Dixon #00900, Art & Craft MSDS	OFFICE DEPOT	CRAYOLA 52-0080	950188	\$0.480	
25	22,944	Box	Crayons, 4" x 7/16", Large Primary, 16 assorted colors/box, Dixon #25116, BIN #52-0336 Art & Craft MSDS	OFFICE DEPOT	CRAYOLA 52-0336	949677	\$1.360	
26	7,501	Box	Crayons, 3-5/8" x 5/16", 8 colors/box, 12 box/carton, BIN #52-0008, Art & Craft MSDS	OFFICE DEPOT	CRAYOLA 52-0008	950162	\$0.240	
27	79,616	Box	Crayons, 3-5/8" x 5/16", 16 colors/box, BIN #52-0016, Dixon #00100, Art & Craft MSDS	OFFICE DEPOT	CRAYOLA 52-0016	949362	\$0.390	
28	808	Box	Crayons, 3-5/8" x 5/16", 64 colors/box, Crayola BIN #52-0064, #8, Art & Craft MSDS	OFFICE DEPOT	CRAYOLA 52-0064	119594	\$2.060	
29	5128	Box	Crayons, 4" x 7/16", Large Triangular, 8 colors/box, BIN #52-4008, Art & Craft MSDS	OFFICE DEPOT	CRAYOLA 52-4008	722770	\$0.770	
30	50	Doz	Eraser, art gum, #2, 2" x 1", Sanford #73027, Classroom Select #73028, School Smart 077360; SAX	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SAX GUM ERASERS #3	438476	\$2.910	
31	110	Each	Glitter, 3/4 oz, shaker top jar, Ross, Imperial #3450-XX, Pacon Spectra, Charles Leonard, Art & Craft MSDS		CHARLES LEONARD		\$0.600	
				Silver	SOUTHWEST	41745		3450SR
				Black	SOUTHWEST	41720		3450BK
				Copper	SOUTHWEST	41780		3450CR
				Gold	SOUTHWEST	41770		3450GD
				Kelly Green	SOUTHWEST	41725		3450GN
				Multi	SOUTHWEST	41700		3450MI
				Purple	SOUTHWEST	41760		3450PE
				Red	SOUTHWEST	41730		3450RD
Royal Blue	SOUTHWEST	41715	3450BE					

ITEM NO.	ESTIMATED USAGE	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION	Vendor	Manufacturer & Mfg Model #	Vendor Stock #	Price	
32	250	Each	Glitter, 1 lb, Glitterex #3440, Classroom Select, Pacon-Spectra, School Smart, AP Certified Art & Craft MSDS		GLITTEREX		\$2.790	
				Blue	SOUTHWEST	3440BE		3440BE
				Gold	SOUTHWEST	3440GD		3440GD
				Multi	SOUTHWEST	3440MI		3440MI
				Red	SOUTHWEST	3440RD		3440RD
		Silver	SOUTHWEST	3440SR	3440SR			
33	50,108	Each	Glue, white, polyvinyl, washable, plastic bottle, 4 oz, 12/carton, Borden #E304, Elmer's/Ross #114, Sargent 22-1201, Art & Craft MSDS	SOUTHWEST	ELMERS E304	103604	\$0.570	
34	2,500	Each	Glue, white, polyvinyl, washable, plastic bottle, POINTED TIP, 8 oz, 12/carton, Borden #E308, Elmer's/Ross #0008-BD, Sargent 22-1203, Art & Craft MSDS	NASCO	SARGENT 22-1203	9728595	\$0.880	
35	225	Each	Glue, white, polyvinyl, washable, 1 gallon size, 2/carton, Borden #E340, Rich Art #SG128, School Smart, Art & Craft MSDS	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SCHOOL SMART WG1GLS	1565727	\$5.710	
36	1	Each	Ink, India drawing, black, 1 oz, Higgins #44001, Sanford #SAN-44201, Art & Craft MSDS	SOUTHWEST	HIGGINS 44201	3470BK	\$2.350	
37	4,250	Set	Markers, Bold Colors, Ultra-Clean Washable, Broad Line Conical tip for both thick and thin lines, 8 colors/set includes plum, golden yellow, primrose, azure, copper, emerald, teal and raspberry. B&S #58-78328018. Art & Craft MSDS	OFFICE DEPOT	CRAYOLA 58-7832	950147	\$1.450	
38	6,500	Set	Markers, Classic Colors, Ultra-Clean Washable, Broad Line Conical tip for both thick and thin lines; 8 colors/set B&S #58-78088019, Dixon Prang #80680. Art & Craft MSDS	SOUTHWEST	PRANG 80680	376008	\$1.320	
39	7,500		Markers, Classic Colors, NON-WASHABLE, Water Soluble, Water-Based Ink. MADE IN AMERICA. Broad Line Conical tip for both thick and thin lines; 8 colors/set. Crayola #58-7708, Dixon Prang #80128. AP Certified Non-Toxic. Art & Craft MSDS	OFFICE DEPOT	CRAYOLA 58-7708	502336	\$1.250	
40	1,000	Set	Markers, Washable Broad line conical tip for both thick and thin lines; 12 colors/set, Must wash from skin, clothing and painted walls; B&S 58-7812; Art & Craft MSDS	OFFICE DEPOT	CRAYOLA 58-7812	361200	\$2.200	

ITEM NO.	ESTIMATED USAGE	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION	Vendor	Manufacturer Mfg Model # &	Vendor Stock #	Price	
41	350	Set	Markers, Multicultural Colors, Ultra-Clean Washable, Broad Line Conical tip for both thick and thin lines; Must wash from skin, clothing and painted walls; 8 colors/set includes golden beige, tawny, beige, bronze, mahogany, tan, sienna and terracotta. B&S #58-78018013, Art & Craft MSDS	OFFICE DEPOT	CRAYOLA 58-7801	950121	\$1.710	
42	1,600	Set	Markers, Tropical Colors, Ultra-Clean Washable, Broad Line Conical tip for both thick and thin lines; Must wash from skin, clothing and painted walls; 8 colors/set includes tropical violet, parrot pink, sandy tan, blue lagoon, dolphin gray, wild orchid, sea foam green and coral reef. B&S #58-78168011. Art & Craft MSDS	OFFICE DEPOT	CRAYOLA 58-7816	950139	\$1.450	
43	2,225	Doz	Markers, Bulk, Broad Line Conical tip, All Colors, Crayola Original ; 12 markers/box. #58-770080xx, AP Certified; Art & Craft MSDS	SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA 58-7700 Black Blue Brown Green Orange Red Violet Yellow	3745bk 3745be 3745bn 3745gn 3745oe 3745rd 3745vt 3745yw	\$2.350	
44	2,500	Doz	Markers, Scented, Chisel Tip for bold and fine lines; thick barrel. Assorted Colors; 12 colors & flavors/set to include flavors: Magenta-Raspberry, Pink-Watermelon, Red-Cherry, Orange-Orange, Yellow-Banana, Green-Mint, Dark Green-Apple, Turquoise-Fruit Punch, Blue-Blueberry, Purple-Grape, Brown-Cinnamon & Black-Licorice. Ink won't bleed through paper. Mr. Sketch, Sanford 20072. AP Certified. Non-Toxic Art & Craft MSDS	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	MR. SKETCH 1905069	059364	\$5.100	
45	125	Jar	Paint, finger, liquid, 16 oz, Crayola, Prang, School Smart, Color-Brite #SC 3515-XX, Sargent Art-Time, Art & Craft MSDS		SCHOOL SMART			
				Blue	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SS241-030	2002424	\$1.360
				Black	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SS241-055	2002420	
				Brown	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SS241-050	2002421	
				Green	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SS241-045	2002416	
				Orange	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SS241-015	2002415	
				Red	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SS241-020	2002423	
				Violet	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SS241-040	2002417	
				White	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SS241-005	2002419	
Yellow	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SS241-010	2002418					

ITEM NO.	ESTIMATED USAGE	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION	Vendor	Manufacturer & Mfg Model #	Vendor Stock #	Price	
46	8,100	Jar	Paint, Tempera, liquid, 16 oz, plastic bottle complete with dispensing tops,paint bottle must have a seal; all colors available, Sunburst #3500-XX, Crayola Arista II, Art & Craft MSDS		SUNBURST			
				Black	SOUTHWEST	3500BK	3500BK	\$1.200
				Blue	SOUTHWEST	3500BE	3500BE	
				Brown	SOUTHWEST	3500BN	3500BN	
				Green	SOUTHWEST	3500GN	3500GN	
				Magenta	SOUTHWEST	3500MA	3500MA	
				Orange	SOUTHWEST	3500OE	3500OE	
				Peach	SOUTHWEST	3500PH	3500PH	
				Red	SOUTHWEST	3500RD	3500RD	
				Turquoise	SOUTHWEST	3500TE	3500TE	
				Violet	SOUTHWEST	3500VT	3500VT	
				White	SOUTHWEST	3500WE	3500WE	
				Yellow	SOUTHWEST	3500YW	3500YW	
47	9,500	Set	Paint, Water Color, 8 oval pans, assorted, with brush, 12 sets/carton, Prang #00800, B&S #53-0080, Sargent 66-8000, Art & Craft MSDS	SOUTHWEST	SARGENT 66-8000	35638	\$0.610	
48	10	Set	Paint, Water Color, replacement strips, oval, 8 colors for Prang #08200, (3 strips per set) Art & Craft MSDS	NASCO	PRANG	2100225A	\$1.530	
49	225	Rolls	Paper, Art Craft, 36" wide x 1000', 50lb, Duo-Finish. Pacon-Spectra ArtKraft, Color-Brite #5560					
				Autumn Gold	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 5560GD	5560GD	\$50.310
				Black	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	ARTKRAFT 0067301	006261	\$43.200
				Bright Green	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 5560BGN	5560BGN	\$50.260
				Brown	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	ARTKRAFT 0067021	006243	\$41.160
				Canary	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 5560CY	5560CY	\$49.810
				Dark Blue	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	ARTKRAFT 0067181	006258	\$39.970
				Emerald Green	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	ARTKRAFT 0067141	006255	\$37.000
				Flame	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 5560FRD	5560FRD	\$51.680
				Gray	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	ARTKRAFT 0067891	247813	\$49.320
				Light Blue	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 5560AQ	5560AQ	\$50.400
				Light Green	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	ARTKRAFT 0067121	006549	\$48.930
				Orange	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 5560OE	5560OE	\$49.740
				Pink	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 5560PK	5560PK	\$48.440
				Purple	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 5560PE	5560PE	\$49.260
				Scarlet	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 5560ST	5560ST	\$45.570
Sky Blue	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 5560SBE	5560SBE	\$49.210				
White	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	ARTKRAFT 0067001	006240	\$38.150				



ITEM NO.	ESTIMATED USAGE	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION	Vendor	Manufacturer & Mfg Model #	Vendor Stock #	Price
50	575	Rolls	Paper, Art Craft, 36" wide x 1000', 40lb, FIRE/FLAME RETARDANT, All colors. Pacon-Decorol, Southwest Private Label #SSS5550xx				
			Black	OFFICE DEPOT	PACON 101209	173518	\$68.670
			Blue	OFFICE DEPOT	PACON 101206	173427	\$73.880
			Dark Brown	SOUTHWEST	SW 5550BH	SSS5550BH	\$71.840
			Emerald	SOUTHWEST	SW 5550FGN	SSS5550FGN	\$77.990
			Orange	OFFICE DEPOT	PACON 101200	173377	\$75.720
			Pink	OFFICE DEPOT	PACON 101204	173294	\$71.450
			Purple	SOUTHWEST	SW 5550PE	SSS5550PE	\$71.750
			Red	OFFICE DEPOT	PACON 101203	173534	\$74.780
			Sky Blue	OFFICE DEPOT	PACON 101205	173310	\$71.510
			White	SOUTHWEST	SW 5550WE	SSS5550WE	\$57.390
			Yellow	SOUTHWEST	SW 5550YW	SSS5550YW	\$72.740
51	30	Rolls	Paper, Butcher, white, 36" wide roll, 50 lb, Crown Imperial #5575-36, APC #5036 WK, School Smart 086654	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SCHOOL SMART 5036VVK	086654	\$36.400
52	1	Rolls	Paper, Butcher, white, 24" wide roll, 50 lb, Crown Imperial #5575-24, APC #5024 WK	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	557524	\$31.160

ITEM NO.	ESTIMATED USAGE	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION	Vendor	Manufacturer & Mfg Model #	Vendor Stock #	Price
53	8,050	Pkg	Paper, Construction, 9"x12", 50 sheets/pkg, 100% vat-dyed sulphite, acid free, 76# basis, 50% recycled fiber content and recyclable. All colors including assorted (brightness and range of colors important) Pacon Tru-Ray, Imperial Color-Brite		PACON TRU-RAY		
			Assorted	OFFICE DEPOT	103031	338855	\$1.120
			Black	OFFICE DEPOT	103029	338665	
			Blue	OFFICE DEPOT	103022	338483	
			Brilliant Lime	OFFICE DEPOT	103423	229872	
			Chartreuse	OFFICE DEPOT	103005	338707	
			Dark Brown	OFFICE DEPOT	103024	338566	
			Dark Green	OFFICE DEPOT	103021	338467	
			Festive Green	OFFICE DEPOT	103006	338723	
			Festive Red	OFFICE DEPOT	103431	338764	
			Gold	OFFICE DEPOT	NO BID	NO BID	
			Gray	OFFICE DEPOT	103027	338624	
			Holiday Green	OFFICE DEPOT	102960	347780	
			Holiday Red	OFFICE DEPOT	102993	347806	
			Light Green	OFFICE DEPOT	103015	338343	
			Light Red	OFFICE DEPOT	103044	338285	
			Lilac	OFFICE DEPOT	103018	338426	
			Magenta	OFFICE DEPOT	103000	338228	
			Multi Cultural	OFFICE DEPOT	9509	350019	
			Orange	OFFICE DEPOT	103002	338442	
			Pink	OFFICE DEPOT	103012	338301	
			Pumpkin	OFFICE DEPOT	103424	230235	
			Purple	OFFICE DEPOT	103019	230136	
			Red	OFFICE DEPOT	103030	338681	
			Royal Blue	OFFICE DEPOT	103017	338400	
			Salmon	OFFICE DEPOT	103010	338269	
			Shocking Pink	OFFICE DEPOT	103013	230003	
			Sky Blue	OFFICE DEPOT	103016	338384	
			Tan	OFFICE DEPOT	103023	338525	
			Turquoise	OFFICE DEPOT	103007	338749	
Violet	OFFICE DEPOT	103009	338244				
Warm Brown	OFFICE DEPOT	103025	338582				
White	OFFICE DEPOT	103026	338608				
Yellow	OFFICE DEPOT	103004	338541				



ITEM NO.	ESTIMATED USAGE	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION	Vendor	Manufacturer & Mfg Model #	Vendor Stock #	Price
55	150	Pkg	Paper, Construction, 24"x36", 50 sheets/pkg, 100% vat-dyed sulphite, acid free, 76# basis, 50% recycled fiber content and recycable. All colors including assorted (brightness and range of colors important) Pacon Tru-Ray, Imperial Color-Brite  Assorted (10 colors) Black White  Only above colors available		PACON TRU-RAY		
				OFFICE DEPOT	103127-5	338202	\$9.390
				OFFICE DEPOT	103125-5	230557	
				OFFICE DEPOT	103122-5	230490	
56	50	Pkg	Paper, Drawing, manila, 9"x12", 60 lb, Everett, Sax, Imperial #5295-09, American Paper #609, Pacon	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SAX 609M	085570	\$4.390
57	80	Pkg	Paper, Drawing, manila, 12"x18", 500 sheets/pkg, 55 lb basis, Everett #EVP46726, Imperial #5290-12 60#, American #5612M, SAX 085574 (removed "4 pkg/bundle")	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	529012	\$8.620
58	5	Pkg	Paper, Drawing, manila, 18"x24", 56 lb basis, Imperial #5290-18, Everett #EVP46729, American #5618M, School Smart 085568	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	529018	\$16.800
59	100	Pkg	Paper, Drawing, white, 9"x12", 60 lb, Everett #EVP46151, Riverside #C3173, Imperial #5300-09, American #609W; SAX 053931	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SAX X4861SS-5987	053931	\$5.520
60	400	Pkg	Paper, Drawing, white, 12"x18", 60 lb basis, 500 sheets/pkg, 4 pkg/bundle, Everett #C3174, Imperial #5300-12, American #612W, SAX 053934	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SAX X4863SS-5987	053934	\$11.120
61	20	Pkg	Paper, Drawing, white, 12"x18", 80 lb basis, Riverside/Everett "Tru-Rite" #C3182/46-172, Imperial 5305-12, SAX 053946	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SAX X4883SS-5987	053946	\$14.270
62	70	Pkg	Paper, Drawing, white, 18"x24", 60 lb basis, Riverside/Everett "Tru-Rite" #C3175, Imperial #5300-18, American #618W, SAX 053937	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SAX X4865SS-5987	053937	\$22.050
63	20	Pkg	Paper, Finger Paint, 16"x22", Everett #40-102, Pioneer, Imperial #5390, Pacon, American #1622, School Smart 085376	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SCHOOL SMART 1622-SS	085376	\$2.560

ITEM NO.	ESTIMATED USAGE	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION	Vendor	Manufacturer & Mfg Model #	Vendor Stock #	Price	
64	2,500	Qr	Paper, Tissue, 20"x30" sheets, quire folded, colored, 24 sheets/quire, all colors, Bemis Jason, Crystal Standard, Satin Wrap #5920, Pacon Kolorfast		PACON			
				Apple Green	SOUTHWEST	58110	5920agn	\$1.320
				Black	SOUTHWEST	58140	5920bk	
				Brown	SOUTHWEST	58230	5920bn	
				Cerise	SOUTHWEST	58300	5920ce	
				Dark Brown	SOUTHWEST	58430	5920dbn	
				Dark Pink	SOUTHWEST	58280	5920dpk	
				Desert Tan	SOUTHWEST	58412	5920dtn	
				Gold	SOUTHWEST	58010	5920gd	
				Gray	SOUTHWEST	NO BID	NO BID	
				Holly Green	SOUTHWEST	58120	5920hgn	
				Lavender	SOUTHWEST	58290	5920LR	
				Light Blue	SOUTHWEST	58320	5920LBE	
				Light Pink	SOUTHWEST	58040	5920LPK	
				Navy	SOUTHWEST	58462	5920NY	
				Orange	SOUTHWEST	58160	5920OE	
				Parade Blue	SOUTHWEST	58332	5920PBE	
				Purple	SOUTHWEST	58070	5920PE	
				Scarlet	SOUTHWEST	58030	5920ST	
				Turquoise	SOUTHWEST	58200	5920TE	
White	SOUTHWEST	59000	5920WE					
Yellow	SOUTHWEST	58370	5920YW					

ITEM NO.	ESTIMATED USAGE	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION	Vendor	Manufacturer & Mfg Model #	Vendor Stock #	Price
65	610	Pkg	Paper, Tissue, 12"x18", 50 sheets/pkg, assorted colors, Bemis Jason, Pacon, Crystal Standard		PACON		
			Assorted	SOUTHWEST	58520	5910AD	\$2.290
			Apple Green	SOUTHWEST	59127	5910AGN	
			Baby Pink	SOUTHWEST	59047	5910BPK	
			Black	SOUTHWEST	59147	5910BK	
			Canary	SOUTHWEST	59027	5910CY	
			Emerald Green	SOUTHWEST	59137	5910EGN	
			National Red	SOUTHWEST	59187	5910NRD	
			Orange	SOUTHWEST	59167	5910OE	
			Purple	SOUTHWEST	59077	5910PE	
			Scarlet	SOUTHWEST	59037	5910ST	
			Sky Blue	SOUTHWEST	59397	5910SBE	
			Spring Green	SOUTHWEST	59117	5910SGN	
			White	SOUTHWEST	59007	5910WE	
66	1	Pad	Paper, Tracing, 9"x12", 50 sheets/pad, Pacon #2309 358718, SAX 248200	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SAX X2309BB-5987	248200	
67	200	Box	Pastels, Oil, 25 colors/box, Pentel #PHN25, Art & Craft MSDS	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	PENTEL PHN-25	216006	\$1.550
68	25	Box	Pastels, Oil, 12 colors/box, Pentel #PHN12, Art & Craft MSDS	SOUTHWEST	PENTEL PHN-12	339012	\$0.077
69	400	Set	Pencils, colored 8 assorted colors/set, pre-sharpened, 3.3mm core. Crayola #68-4008, (School Specialty #008211)	OFFICE DEPOT	CRAYOLA 68-4008	582062	\$0.800
70	23,350	Set	Pencils, Colored, 12 assorted colors/set, B&S #BIN4012, Dixon #22120, RoseArt #1013 1608-12, Sargent 22-7212	OFFICE DEPOT	SARGENT 22-722	207433	\$0.690
71	580	Set	Pencils, Colored, 24 assorted colors/set, B&S BIN#4024, Dixon #22240, RoseArt #1013 1608-24, Sargent 22-7224	OFFICE DEPOT	SARGENT 22-7224	207442	\$1.290
72	1	Set	Pencils, Colored, Multicultural, 8 skin tones, 3.3mm, art quality lead, BIN #68-4208, Sargent 22-7208, Art & Craft MSDS	NASCO	SARGENT 22-7208	9726666	\$0.800
73	1,230	Set	Pencils, Colored, 36 assorted colors/set, B&S #BIN68-4036, Dixon #22360	OFFICE DEPOT	CRAYOLA 68-4036	949982	\$2.880
74	1	Set	Pencils, Mongol, 10 assorted colors/box, with brush, Dixon #23650, Art & Craft MSDS	OFFICE DEPOT	DIXON 23650	275184	\$1.840
75	25	Pkg	Pipe Cleaners, 6" x 4mm, assorted colors, 100 ea/pkg, Pacon #7100, Chenille Kraft	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	CREATIVITY STREET AC7100-01DI	085883	\$0.500

ITEM NO.	ESTIMATED USAGE	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION	Vendor	Manufacturer & Mfg Model #	Vendor Stock #	Price
76	75	Pkg	Pipe Cleaners, 12", 1/4" diameter, 100 ea/pkg, assorted colors only, Imperial #3620AD, Spartan #J100A, Chenille Kraft, Pacon #7110	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL	3620AD	\$0.610
77	5,230	Pkg	Railroad Board, 22"x28", 6 ply, 25 sheets/pkg, assorted colors, Beveridge, Pacon, Imperial #SC3025-XX	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL		\$8.250
			Black	SOUTHWEST	3025BK	3025BK	
			Blue	SOUTHWEST	3025RBE	3025RBE	
			Blue, Dark	SOUTHWEST	3025DBE	3025DBE	
			Blue, Light	SOUTHWEST	3025LBE	3025LBE	
			Brown	SOUTHWEST	3025BN	3025BN	
			Canary	SOUTHWEST	33025CY	33025CY	
			Cardinal	SOUTHWEST	NO BID	NO BID	
			Green, Emerald	SOUTHWEST	3025LGN	3025LGN	
			Green, Holiday	SOUTHWEST	3025HGN	3025HGN	
			Magenta	SOUTHWEST	3025MA	3025MA	
			Orange	SOUTHWEST	3025OE	3025OE	
			Pink	SOUTHWEST	3025PK	3025PK	
			Red	SOUTHWEST	3025RD	3025RD	
White	SOUTHWEST	3025WE	3025WE				
Yellow, Lemon	SOUTHWEST	3025LYW	3025LYW				
78	30	Each	Rubber Cement, 4 oz, Metal container, Borden #E904, Ross #00044, Art & Craft MSDS	OFFICE DEPOT	ELMERS #E904	443650	\$0.970

ITEM NO.	ESTIMATED USAGE	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION	Vendor	Manufacturer & Mfg Model #	Vendor Stock #	Price
79	1,150		Yarn, Acrylic roving, 8 oz, 3 ply, 450' skein all colors, Pacon, Imperial	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	PACON TRAIT-TEX		\$4.750
				Black	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7301	
			Brown	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7021	222339	
			Dark Blue	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7191	402778	
			Dark Green	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7141	402790	
			Gold	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NO BID	NO BID	
			Hot Pink	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7251	245374	
			Lavender	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NO BID	NO BID	
			Light Blue	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7161	402781	
			Light Green	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	NO BID	NO BID	
			Orange	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7101	402805	
			Purple	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7351	402784	
			Red	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7031	402808	
			White	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7011	402811	
			Yellow	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7081	402814	