



NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM AWARDED VENDOR LIST

| | | |
|-------------------------------|---|-------------------------------|
| BID TITLE: FUEL | SPONSORING DISTRICT: San Diego Unified School District | DELIVERY A.R.O.: <u>1</u> DAY |
| BID NUMBER: GD-18-0167-19 | DISTRICT CONTACT: Julio Gomez, Contract Specialist CONTRACT | |
| PERIOD: 9/7/17 through 9/6/19 | PH: (858)522-5867 | FAX: (619)542-5767 |

| VENDOR NAME | ADDRESS | PHONE/FAX NUMBERS | CONTACT NAME | CASH DISC | M/W/DVBE |
|--|---|--|--|-----------|----------|
| The SOCO Group | 5962 Priestly Drive Carlsbad, CA 92008 | Phone: (800) 458-2711 Fax: (760) 929-8063 | Matt Davis mdavis@thesocogroup.com | N/A | N/A |
| Supreme Oil Company | 755 West A Street 2 nd Floor San Diego, CA 92101 | Phone: (619) 501-3300 Ext 2 Fax: (619) 501-3861 | Laura Swanson lswanson@supremeoil.com | N/A | N/A |
| IPC USA | 4 Hutton Center Drive Suite 700 Santa Ana, CA 92707 | Phone: (800) 936-3930 Fax: (949) 648-5612 | Blanca Hurtado Blanca.hurtado@usipc.com | N/A | N/A |
| P-Fleet (Gas Station for Oceanside USD ONLY) | 6390 Greenwich Dr. Suite 200 San Diego, CA 92122 | Phone: (800) 449-4645 Fax: (858) 348-2596 | John Verardo John.verardo@pfleet.com | N/A | N/A |

BOARD APPROVAL DATE: 06/06/2018

**REVISION NO: 1st Options to Renew
09/07/18 thru 09/06/19**

REVISION DATE: 06/06/2018

NCEPC REGIONS

REGION 1

| | | |
|--|---------------------------------------|---|
| Bonsall Union School District | Julian Union High School District | San Pasqual Union School District |
| Escondido Union School District | Mira Costa Community College District | Spencer Valley School District |
| Escondido Union High School District | Palomar Community College District | Vallecitos School District |
| Fallbrook Union Elementary School District | Poway Unified School District | Valley Center-Pauma Unified School District |
| Fallbrook Union High School District | Ramona Unified School District | Warner Unified School District |
| Julian Union School District | San Marcos Unified School District | |

REGION 2

| | | |
|----------------------------------|-----------------------------------|---|
| Cardiff School District | Encinitas Union School District | San Dieguito Union High School District |
| Carlsbad Unified School District | Oceanside Unified School District | Solana Beach School District |
| Del Mar Union School District | Rancho Santa Fe School District | Vista Unified School District |

REGION 3

| | | |
|-----------------------------------|--------------------------------------|--|
| San Diego Unified School District | San Diego County Office of Education | |
|-----------------------------------|--------------------------------------|--|

REGION 4

| | | |
|---|---|---|
| Alpine Union School District | Jamul-Dulzura Union School District | Lemon Grove School District |
| Cajon Valley Union School District | Lakeside Union School District | Mountain Empire Unified School District |
| Grossmont Cuyamaca Community College District | La Mesa - Spring Valley School District | Santee School District |
| Grossmont Union High School District | | |

REGION 5

| | | |
|--|---------------------------------|---------------------------------------|
| Chula Vista Elementary School District | San Ysidro School District | Southwestern College District |
| Coronado Unified School District | South Bay Union School District | Sweetwater Union High School District |
| National School District | | |



NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM

BID FORM: REGION 1

BID TITLE: GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUELS

SPONSORING DISTRICT: San Diego Unified School District

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 1 DAYS

BID NUMBER: GD-18-0167-19

DISTRICT CONTACT: Julio Gomez, Contract Specialist

CONTRACT PERIOD: 9/7/17 through 9/6/18

PH: (858)522-5867

FAX: (619)542-5767

| Item No. | Estimated Usage | Unit of Issue | Item Specification/Description | Manufacturer & Model No./ Vendor Stock Number | Warranty | Awarded Vendor | Adjustment Amount (+/-) | Extended Price |
|-------------------------|-----------------|---------------|---|---|----------|----------------|-------------------------|----------------|
| UNLEADED REGULAR | | | | | | | | |
| 1 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | (0.0020) | N/A |
| 2 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0088 | N/A |
| 3 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.1196 | N/A |
| 4 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | NO BID | NO BID | N/A |
| UNLEADED PREMIUM | | | | | | | | |
| 5 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | (0.0060) | N/A |
| 6 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0048 | N/A |
| 7 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.2348 | N/A |
| 8 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | NO BID | NO BID | N/A |

| Item No. | Estimated Usage | Unit of Issue | Item Specification/Description | Manufacturer & Model No./ Vendor Stock Number | Warranty | Awarded Vendor | Unit Price | Extended Price |
|----------------------------------|-----------------|---------------|---|---|----------|----------------|------------|----------------|
| DIESEL | | | | | | | | |
| 9 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0155 | N/A |
| 10 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0281 | N/A |
| 11 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.2657 | N/A |
| 12 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.4550 | N/A |
| BIODIESEL B10 | | | | | | | | |
| 13 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0522 | N/A |
| 14 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0728 | N/A |
| 15 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.3550 | N/A |
| 16 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.5050 | N/A |
| BIODIESEL B20 | | | | | | | | |
| 17 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0272 | N/A |
| 18 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0478 | N/A |
| 19 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.3050 | N/A |
| 20 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | .04550 | N/A |
| RENEWABLE DIESEL (NEXBTL) | | | | | | | | |
| 21 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0647 | N/A |
| 22 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0853 | N/A |
| 23 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.4550 | N/A |
| 21 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.6050 | N/A |



NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM BID FORM: REGION 2

BID TITLE: GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUELS

SPONSORING DISTRICT: San Diego Unified School District

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 1 DAYS

BID NUMBER: GD-18-0167-19

DISTRICT CONTACT: Julio Gomez, Contract Specialist

CONTRACT PERIOD: 9/7/17 through 9/6/19

PH: (858)522-5867

FAX: (619)542-5767

| Item No. | Estimated Usage | Unit of Issue | Item Specification/Description | Manufacturer & Model No./ Vendor Stock Number | Warranty | Awarded Vendor | Adjustment Amount (+/-) | |
|-------------------------|-----------------|---------------|---|---|----------|----------------|-------------------------|-----|
| UNLEADED REGULAR | | | | | | | | |
| 1 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0070 | N/A |
| 2 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0219 | N/A |
| 3 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.1591 | N/A |
| 4 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | NO BID | NO BID | N/A |
| UNLEADED PREMIUM | | | | | | | | |
| 5 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0030 | N/A |
| 6 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0179 | N/A |
| 7 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.1591 | N/A |
| 8 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | NO BID | NO BID | N/A |
| DIESEL | | | | | | | | |
| 9 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0282 | N/A |
| 10 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0544 | N/A |
| 11 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0890 | N/A |
| 12 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.4550 | N/A |

| BIODIESEL B10 | | | | | | | | |
|--|--|-----|---|------------------|-----|----------------|--------|-----|
| 13 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0422 | N/A |
| 14 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0601 | N/A |
| 15 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.3550 | N/A |
| 16 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.5050 | N/A |
| BIODIESEL B20 | | | | | | | | |
| 17 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0172 | N/A |
| 18 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0351 | N/A |
| 19 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.3050 | N/A |
| 20 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.4550 | N/A |
| RENEWABLE DIESEL (NEXBTL) | | | | | | | | |
| 21 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0547 | N/A |
| 22 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0726 | N/A |
| 23 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.4550 | N/A |
| 24 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.6050 | N/A |
| FUEL GAS STATION (Oceanside School District Only) | | | | | | | | |
| 25 | | GAL | 500 Airport Road, Oceanside, CA 92054 | REGULAR UNLEADED | N/A | PFLEET | 0.1800 | N/A |
| 26 | | GAL | 500 Airport Road, Oceanside, CA 92054 | DIESEL | N/A | PFLEET | 0.1700 | N/A |



NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM **BID FORM: REGION 3**

BID TITLE: GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUELS

SPONSORING DISTRICT: San Diego Unified School District

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 1 DAYS

BID NUMBER: GD-18-0167-19

DISTRICT CONTACT: Julio Gomez, Contract Specialist

CONTRACT PERIOD: 9/7/17 through 9/6/19

PH: (858)522-5867

FAX: (619)542-5767

| Item No. | Estimated Usage | Unit of Issue | Item Specification/Description | Manufacturer & Model No./ Vendor Stock Number | Warranty | Awarded Vendor | Adjustment Amount (+/-) | |
|-------------------------|-----------------|---------------|---|---|----------|----------------|-------------------------|-----|
| UNLEADED REGULAR | | | | | | | | |
| 1 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | (0.0050) | N/A |
| 2 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0045 | N/A |
| 3 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0367 | N/A |
| 4 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | NO BID | NO BID | N/A |
| UNLEADED PREMIUM | | | | | | | | |
| 5 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | (0.0090) | N/A |
| 6 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0005 | N/A |
| 7 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0367 | N/A |
| 8 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | NO BID | NO BID | N/A |

| Item No. | Estimated Usage | Unit of Issue | Item Specification/Description | Manufacturer & Model No./ Vendor Stock Number | Warranty | Awarded Vendor | Unit Price | Extended Price |
|----------------------------------|-----------------|---------------|---|---|----------|----------------|------------|----------------|
| DIESEL | | | | | | | | |
| 9 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.0089 | N/A |
| 10 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0223 | N/A |
| 11 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0399 | N/A |
| 12 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.4550 | N/A |
| BIODIESEL B10 | | | | | | | | |
| 13 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0522 | N/A |
| 14 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0728 | N/A |
| 15 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.3550 | N/A |
| 16 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.5050 | N/A |
| BIODIESEL B20 | | | | | | | | |
| 17 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.0089 | N/A |
| 18 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0478 | N/A |
| 19 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.3050 | N/A |
| 20 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.4550 | N/A |
| RENEWABLE DIESEL (NEXBTL) | | | | | | | | |
| 21 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0647 | N/A |
| 22 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | IPC USA | 0.0853 | N/A |
| 23 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.4550 | N/A |
| 24 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.6050 | N/A |



NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM **BID FORM: REGION 4**

BID TITLE: GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUELS

SPONSORING DISTRICT: San Diego Unified School District

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 1 DAYS

BID NUMBER: GD-18-0167-19

DISTRICT CONTACT: Julio Gomez, Contract Specialist

CONTRACT PERIOD: 9/7/17 through 9/6/19

PH: (858) 522-5867

FAX: (619) 542-5767

| Item No. | Estimated Usage | Unit of Issue | Item Specification/Description | Manufacturer & Model No./ Vendor Stock Number | Warranty | Awarded Vendor | Adjustment Amount (+/-) | |
|-------------------------|-----------------|---------------|---|---|----------|----------------|-------------------------|-----|
| UNLEADED REGULAR | | | | | | | | |
| 1 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0213 | N/A |
| 2 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0341 | N/A |
| 3 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0712 | N/A |
| 4 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | NO BID | NO BID | N/A |
| UNLEADED PREMIUM | | | | | | | | |
| 5 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0181 | N/A |
| 6 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0281 | N/A |
| 7 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0712 | N/A |
| 8 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | NO BID | NO BID | N/A |

| Item No. | Estimated Usage | Unit of Issue | Item Specification/Description | Manufacturer & Model No./ Vendor Stock Number | Warranty | Awarded Vendor | Unit Price | Extended Price |
|----------------------------------|-----------------|---------------|---|---|----------|----------------|------------|----------------|
| DIESEL | | | | | | | | |
| 9 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0244 | N/A |
| 10 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0291 | N/A |
| 11 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0869 | N/A |
| 12 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.4550 | N/A |
| BIODIESEL B10 | | | | | | | | |
| 13 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.0815 | N/A |
| 14 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.1615 | N/A |
| 15 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.3550 | N/A |
| 16 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.5050 | N/A |
| BIODIESEL B20 | | | | | | | | |
| 17 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.0315 | N/A |
| 18 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.1175 | N/A |
| 19 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.3050 | N/A |
| 20 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.4550 | N/A |
| RENEWABLE DIESEL (NEXBTL) | | | | | | | | |
| 21 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.1150 | N/A |
| 22 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.1915 | N/A |
| 23 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.4550 | N/A |
| 24 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.6050 | N/A |



NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM **BID FORM: REGION 5**

BID TITLE: GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUELS

SPONSORING DISTRICT: San Diego Unified School District

DELIVERY A.R.O.: 1 DAYS

BID NUMBER: GD-18-0167-19

DISTRICT CONTACT: Julio Gomez, Contract Specialist

CONTRACT PERIOD: 9/7/17 through 9/6/19

PH: (858)522-5867

FAX: (619)542-5767

| Item No. | Estimated Usage | Unit of Issue | Item Specification/Description | Manufacturer & Model No./ Vendor Stock Number | Warranty | Awarded Vendor | Adjustment Amount (+/-) | |
|-------------------------|-----------------|---------------|---|---|----------|----------------|-------------------------|-----|
| UNLEADED REGULAR | | | | | | | | |
| 1 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0189 | N/A |
| 2 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0239 | N/A |
| 3 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0600 | N/A |
| 4 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | NO BID | NO BID | N/A |
| UNLEADED PREMIUM | | | | | | | | |
| 5 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0189 | N/A |
| 6 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0239 | N/A |
| 7 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0600 | N/A |
| 8 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | NO BID | NO BID | N/A |

| Item No. | Estimated Usage | Unit of Issue | Item Specification/Description | Manufacturer & Model No./ Vendor Stock Number | Warranty | Awarded Vendor | Unit Price | Extended Price |
|----------------------------------|-----------------|---------------|---|---|----------|----------------|------------|----------------|
| DIESEL | | | | | | | | |
| 9 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0197 | N/A |
| 10 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0270 | N/A |
| 11 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | Supreme Oil | 0.0740 | N/A |
| 12 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.4550 | N/A |
| BIODIESEL B10 | | | | | | | | |
| 13 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.0815 | N/A |
| 14 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.1615 | N/A |
| 15 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.3550 | N/A |
| 16 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.5050 | N/A |
| BIODIESEL B20 | | | | | | | | |
| 17 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.0315 | N/A |
| 18 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.1150 | N/A |
| 19 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.3050 | N/A |
| 20 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.4550 | N/A |
| RENEWABLE DIESEL (NEXBTL) | | | | | | | | |
| 21 | | GAL | Full Truck & Trailer (Min. 7,600 Gallons) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.1115 | N/A |
| 22 | | GAL | Less than Truck & Trailer (Min. 4,300 Gallons to Max 7,599 Gallons) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.1915 | N/A |
| 23 | | GAL | Bobtail Truck (4,299 Gallons and Below) | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.4550 | N/A |
| 24 | | GAL | Wet Hose Operation Must obtain valid permit from local Fire Marshall | | N/A | The SOCO Group | 0.6050 | N/A |